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Second school violence arrest this week
Sanford Middle 
School student,

, I  15, found with

to prison far 21 yean for the 
death of her baby born on 
Christmas Day 1996. The 
Casselberry woman placed 
the baby In a plastic baa 
* * * * *  he suffocated! 
Thursday. Butler was 
sentenced after pleading no 
content to second-degree 
murder In Sanford. Butler did 
not apologue or admit she 
tolled the baby. *1 know a 
ertme has been committed." 
she said. Her sentence ranks 
among the harshest levied 
against a woman accused of 
toning her newborn. Butler 
win get no early parole. Moat 
cases like hers end up with 
charges of manslaughter with 
a maximum sentence of 15 
years.

far help. We recognise the 
need to take a more serious 
look at Incidents like this.* 

Schmidt was arrested at the 
school at 4:30 p.m. He Is 
charged with three felonies. 
Including conspiracy,
threatening to throw or 
discharge a destructive device 
In a public place, and 
Interfering with school 
administration, police said.

Schmidt does not have a 
prior criminal record.

*His family Is very 
distraught.* Ziegler said.

When the April 20 tragedy In 
Littleton. Colo, occurred. 
Ooodaon said that principal 
BUI Moore told students over 
the Intercom that school 
safety Is everyone’s business.

Ooodaon and Ziegler said 
they give credit to the student 
who had the courage to come 
forward with the note to 
school officials.

Schmidt to being held at the 
Juvenile Detention Center. He 
to scheduled to make hte first 
court appearance today.

This to the second time In a 
week In Seminole County a 
student has been anestrd for 
threatening to klU students.

PHor to the tragrdy In 
Littleton. Colo., on April 12. 
an Oviedo High School 
student's gun accidentally 
discharged an campus. No 
one was Injured.

However, statistics from the 
Seminole County schools 
office of secondary education 
show that school violence and 
violations Involving weapons 
are decreasing over the last 
three years.

There were 55 weapons 
violations In county middle 
schools and high schools In 
1997-96. down from 81 In
1996- 97 and 121 In 1995-96.
__to middle schools, there
were 31 weapons violations In
1997- 96. down from 33 In 
1966-97 and 75 In 1990 00.

Two firearms have been 
discovered on school 
campuses this year, and none 
wars found in 1997-96. four 
w m ia s  wees dtocowrwf In 
1996-97. and two were found 
In 1996-96.

SANFORD • An eighth -grade 
student who made a note with 
a hit Hat of teachers and 
students he wished to toll was 
arrested Thursday at Sanford 
Middle School, police said.

Tyler Schmidt. 15. made a 
note with a diagram of himself 
blowing up the school and the 
hit hat of teachers and 
students. A fellow eighth- 
grader Informed a school 
official of the note, and 
Schmidt was discreetly pulled 
out of class, police aald.

On Tuesday, a 13-year old 
student at Rock Lake Middle 
School was arrested when a 
deputy found a map in his

"They are a church-going 
family, and they don’t 
understand why this 
happened. They have been 
very supportive In the 
Investigation.

Sanford Middle School 
assistant principal Helen 
Ooodaon said Schmidt to a 
straight *A* student who had 
not been In trouble before this 
Incident.

'lie  to a good student.* 
Ooodaon said. *Aa for as are 
know he to well liked by his 
peers.*

Ooodaon said the student 
found the note on the floor 
and brought It to s school 
official.

Schmidt wsa pulled out of 
class without Incident at 
around 11-11:30 a.m..
Ooodaon said.

“We went to his classroom 
and asked him to come out.* 
Ooodaon said. ’Luckily, we 
were pulling several other 
students out by coincidence 
for reasons that had nothfcM 
to do with this. I don’t think 
most people were even aware 
that this was happening-*

locker that Included drawings 
of the school hallways and a 
note reading, 'hide bomb In 
globe In science (building).* 

Investigators did not And a 
bomb or weapon at Rock 
Middle School In Longwood. 
Brendan May. a seventh- 
grader. was arrested for 
threatening to discharge a 
destructive device, a felony. 
School officials said class 
activities were not disrupted.

*We don't deem this as a 
copy cat Incident.* Sanford 
Police Department detective 
Kris Ziegler said. “We view 
this as a tod's desperate cry

now resting In a grave near a 
log cabin where he used to 
reflect on major Issues when 
he was Honda's governor. 
Chiles died otj Dec. 12. I960. 
His fondly moved his grave 
Wednesday from tbs ffsseTswn 
Cemetery m Tallahassee to 
the new site. T just wanted 
him to be port of the land he 
loved.'* said Rhea Chiles, the 
governor's wile.

Running forth* polic*
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Sanford to spring into spring tomorrow

Taste of Oviedo

N avy band 
returns to 
festival

In Winter Springs will be held 
Saturday. May 1 at Central 
Winds Park Highway 434 near 
the high school p.m. Plenty of 
music and fireworks, it s free. 
Oates open st 6 p.m. For more 
Info call 656-5488.

JCSmmf and the Heart of 
Florida United Way recognised 
seven people as winner of the 
JCPenny Golden Rule Award 
Program recently. Each 
winner received an engraved 
crystal flame and a 61.000 
contribution for the non-profit 
organization. The youth 
Individual received a $500 
scholarship. The winners 
were: Education - Dividends 
School Volunteer Program: 
Group - American Red Cross 
o f Central Florida Teen Corps: 
Mennonlte Disaster Service for 
Seminole Community
Vounteer Program: Youth - 
Kara Lynn Semento for ML 
Dora High School National 
Honor Society: Adult - Wanda 
Giannani Page for Southwest 
United Communltes; Debra 
Oroseclose for Guardian Ad 
Litem Program. Seminole 
County: Friends of Abused 
Children. and Barbara 
Johnson for Orlando Housing 
Authority.

Jacksonville’s Navy Band. 
T.Q.I.F., a six-piece Dixie­
land group noted for Its 
amazing versatility, to sched­
uled to perform at the 5th 
annual Taste o f Oviedo. This 
will be the first performance 
by a Navy Band unit In the 
Central Florida area since 
the dosing of the Orlando 
Naval Training Center.

Consisting of professional 
Navy musicians, they have 
entertained literally thou­
sands o f audiences In the

too Nary, Page 2A

"This to a chance for people 
In the community to really 
enjoy themselves.* Tony Tay­
lor. a project director for the 
Sanford Housing Authority, 
said. *We re trying to bring the 
community together.*

The seventh annual festival 
will feature free soul food, 
pics, cakes, grilled hot dogs, a 
roasted hog, sausage, barbe­
cued chicken and pork. Ice 
cream, and drinks.

The music will range from 
rock and hip-hop to Jazz and 
country, or even karaoke. 
Sanford Housing Authority of­
ficials expect more than 300 
people to participate In the 
festival.

Pony rides will be available 
along Tcnlh Street.

From east o f the Mulberry 
Avenue Intersection to west of 
the Olive Avenue Intersection. 
Tenth Street will be closed

Saturday from 10 a.m. to 3
p.m.

There will be relay races 
with prizes, a moon walk, a 
cake walk, and bingo.

African and ancient art 
works, as well as homemade 
sandals, will be available for 
purchase.

*lfs  really going to be nice.* 
Taylor said. Th is will be our 
best festival ever.*

SANFORD - A Spring Festival 
will be held on Saturday In 
Sanford, with free food, games 
and music.

The festival will be held at 
94 Casselbrewer Ct. from 10 
a.m. to 3 p.m. to celebrate a 
week of clean-up efforts by 
residents o f the Sanford 
Housing Authority.

Kids ‘get a little 
dirty’ on Arbor Day

□ O U O T E

All violence, all 
that is dreary and 
repels, is not 
power, but the 
absence o f power.

Insure sufficient shade once 
trees are grown.

The day began at approxi­
mately 8:15 a.m. with an 
opening announcement from 
the principal and several In- 
troductoty speeches. Steve 
Patterson. CEO from Zorn, 
also spoke to the assembly to 
explain the significance of 
Arbor Day.

The Audubon Society also 
conducted a showing of ‘ Birds 
o f Prey* for the third, fourth 
and fifth grade classes. The 
actual tree planting ceremony 
started at approximately 9:30 
a.m. followed by a brunch at 
11 a.m.
Swann and Bowlin shared 

that the Pine Crest Environ­
mental Club began In 1902 by 
two fourth grade teachers who 
wanted to encourage environ­
mental thinking. Yet. Swann 
and Bowlin themselves have 
sponsored the club for the 
6ss Arbor, Fags 2A

SANFORD - Students In the 
Environmental Club at Pine 
Crest Elementary along with 
teachers. Patty Swann and 
Debbie Bowlin participated 
this morning In the Arbor Day 
festivities at the school.

Zom Residential ’ udopted* 
Pine Crest for the Ardor Day 
activity and donated 60 trees 
for the Environmental Club to 
assist In planting. Children 
were even Instructed In ad­
vance to wear clothes that 
they could *get a little dirty In." 
Participants will ‘ fill In* the 
holes with dirt and water once 
the trees are set.

Principal. Barry Liebovltz, 
worked along with Lynn An- 
ello, a representative from 
Zom. and Blake Gunnels, a 
landscape architect, to de­
termine planting sites. Vari­
ous locations were plotted to

Ralph Waldo 
Emerson

□ IN D E X

Greenhoward, Beverly Tatum, Tamineka White and 
Scott Vetter with teacher Patty Swann.

Pine Crest kids participating In Arbor Day ceremonies 
include: Leytza Smith, George Brinson, Natasha
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ArborKeeping a log o f misdeeds
Readers of this publication 

have called to td l ua boar 
much they appreciate the 
dally police log that appears 
on page A-3.

Some say the log la their 
favorite material In the 
Seminole Herald.

Identifying the offender* la 
what makes the log even 
Juicer, we've been told.

Each day aomeone from the 
Herald goes to Sheriff Don 
Esllnger's 17-92 encampment 
to record the misdeeds of 
men. women and some 
children.

Arrest paper* are avallab 
to anyone who asks for then 
They are kept on a long, L- 
ahaped desk Inside the first'

last five years.
Each third, fourth and fifth 

grade class has a represents* 
ttvc that Is selected to partici­
pate tn the dub's activities. 
Newspaper rend ing has been 
one o f the focuses of the 
group.

"Did you know that for every 
three foot of newspaper recy­
cled you can save one tree 
from befog cut down?, said 
Swann. "We also recycle alu­
minum cans and with the 
money collected have adopted 
a number o f endangered 
animals such as the Florida 
manatee. Florida panther, 
fo g g n b ^ a * ,. k *  turtles, 
dolphin and a cougar at the 
Central' Florida Zoo. The dub 
representatives worked with a 
master gahlener and our 
business partners to plant 
azaleas and other shrubs In 
front o f the school. We have 
also Involved the dub tn 
planting trees around the 
campus. Including helping 
plant the school's fortieth an­
niversary oaks.”

According to the teachers, 
the Environmental Club 
adopted French Avenue be­
tween 27th Street and Shan­
non Drive and recently held a 
spring trash pick up day to 
celebrate Earth Day. A fall 
and spring "pick-up" Is also 
sponsored and parents and 
staff are encouraged to par 
tlctpate In cleaning the air- 
roundtng areas as well.

Several students shared why 
they fed  It Is important to 
plant trees. Beverly Tatem 
said. "More trees will make the 
school grounds look better.” 
Deshawn Lawrence said. They 
will help the environment.” 
George Brinson aald. They 
will put more oxygen In the 
air.” Beltrls Singleton said. 
“We need more shade around 
the campus.” Keldron Waddy 
said, "So the birds can have a 
place to bulk! nests.” And 
Zuleika Salgado said. They 
provide a home for small ani­
mals.”

The teachers responded that 
they were excited about the 
addition o f the sixty trees. 
They would provide shade for 
the primary playground and 
cool outside Btudy areas for 
the Intermediate students. 
Others though that additional 
trees would contribute to the 
attractiveness of the campus.

F o rw a rd

At AmSouth, we've taken

the time to get to know said no, not until he started 
bleeding.” Oloielli recorded.

aiolelll stopped the car. 
received assistance from 
another officer. Czareckl was 
asked to stop kicking and 
thrashing but he began to do 
so again when the car 
proceeded to the Jail.

GlolelU reported that the 
suspect kicked at the left rear 
window and although he did 
not break It. he permanently 
damaged the window tract.

’ He (Czareckl) said he 
wanted to kill himself,”
GlolelU wrote tn Report 
•9933002400.

At the Jail, Czareckl broke 
loose from the grasp of a 
Seminole County Corrections 
Deputy and ran his head Into 
the sully port vestibule door.

*He (Czareckl) had to be 
contained,”  GlolelU aald.

Carefully, Oloielli put down 
the play-by-play of the 
incident on the report that 
was Just one o f a thousand or 
more accumulated In recent 
weeks In Seminole County.

The reports aren't In any 
particular order • not 
alphabetized nor categorized. 
Czareckl was charged with 
operating a vehicle with 
criminal mischief.

Domestic violence reports 
are In the same stack with 
DUIs. grand theft and 
possession of cannabis. 
There's one there now for sale 
and delivery of tyaeric add. 
and another for false 
Imprisonment. A man named 
Michael Carbal allegedly 
locked in his own mother.

Too much madness to record 
It seems.

small business

floor Criminal Arrests office. 
There are four comfortable 
chair* to alt In and a 
telephone to use.

Whenever I've been In the 
place, Pve had no company.

I was there an hour on 
Thursday, amazed once again 
Just how many new reports 
had arrived since the previous 
day.

It must take the arresting 
officers hours to do all the 
paperwork. Some o f them do 
It In longhand, although most 
are type-written.

Atop the freshest stack of 
arrest reports was one made 
by Sheriffs Deputy Clint L. 
GlolelU at 10:36 p.m. on 
Tuesday. April 27. Incident i  
9933002400.

Deputy Oloielli reported 
that he spotted a red lauzu 
pickup traveling north on 
State Road 600 In Longwood. 
The vehicle did not have a 
proper Florida license.

When GlolelU had the 
drtver stop, he began to quiz 
Paul Edward Czareckl. a DUI 
offender who had been 
ordered to take an alcohol 
treatment cdurae. Czareckl . 
who la 39 today, wasn't 
pleased to befog cuffed and 
taken to the county Jail by 
Oloielli.

In his report. GlolelU aald 
that the subject repeatedly 
banged his head Into the left 
rear window of the patrol car.

*1 asked him to stop but he

slipped on your

shoes and walked

around in them
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Entertainment will be pro­

vided by Tajtrt Arts members.
Employment booths with 

three agencies will be set up 
for anyone seeking a Job.A M S O U I H  B A N K

THE RELATIONSHIP PEOPLE
There will also be representa­
tives from a variety of social 
agencies.

McGruff the Crime Dog wlU 
attend the festival, along with 
members o f the Sheriffs Office 
and the Sanford and Alta­
monte Springs police depart­
ments.

Raffle tickets will be on sale 
for 50 cents or one dollar. 
Participants can win a color 
television, a VCR. and gifts 
from area businesses and or­
ganizations.
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The JoUouHng report* uwra compAed from the Semin 
Sheriff a Office for arre id  reported through April 39.

the Seminote County

ALT 
suhe 
Spring* 
Icncc/A 
ALT

Hlnkley 
[* Police

0, April 37, 11:40 p.m. Allen Drive. Jo- 
DOB 4/27/79, v u  arrested fay Altamonte 

officer*, charged with Domestic Vlo-

. April 27. 1:03 p.m.. Scott Michael 
Carbal. DOB 10/29/09 waa arrested by Altamonte Sptlnga Po­
lice Officers and charged with domestic violence, aggravated 
asaault and false Imprisonment.
•A M FO W , April 39, 0:21 a.m. Lodi Low Drive. Christopher 
Courtney Lysacaars. DOB 10/23/79 waa arrested fay Sanford 
Police Department officers and charged with Domestic Vlo- 
lence/Battery.

8AHFOBD. Thad Jerome Brooks, Jr. DOB 3/8/00, was an  
rested hr Seminole County Sheriffs Deputies and charged with 
Sale/Dettvery of Lyserlc Add, and possession.

>. April 30, 11 p.m.. State Road 436. Jason 
David White. DOB 10/0/74, and David Edward Hogan. DOB 
5/13/75. were arrested fay Casaelberry Police officers, charged 
with Possession of Cannabis and Possession of Drug Para­
phernalia.
■AWrOBD. April 38. Judaon Irving Woods III. DOB 9/10/74 
arrested fay Sanford Police Department officers, charged with 
possession of cannabis

P P l
I. April 28. 10:25 p..m., E. Lake Mary Blvd., Daniel 

Raymond Mitchell. DOB 9/3/80, was arrested fay Seminole 
County Sheriffs officers, charged with DUI.
•AffPOBD, April 29. 0:30 a.m.. Regatta Shores. Vickie Renee 
Rrese, DOB 7/28/ 83. was arrested oy Sanford Police officer*, 
charged with DUI.
SAMPOBD. April 28, 11:51 p.m.. Santa Barbara St., Joshua 
Allen McNeal. DOB 10/3/79 waa arrested by Seminole County 
deputies, charged with DUI and possession of Controlled Sub­
stance.
LONOWOOD. April 29. 0:33 a.m., SR 000 at Laura St.. Janet 
Lee Cooke. DOB 7/0/82. waa arrested by Seminole County 
Deputies and charged with DUI.
W ilm a  FA IR , April 2S. 1:15 a.m..
Iiloodgood. DOB 10/9/08 waa anrrsted by 
Sheriffs Deputies and charged with DUI.^

Michael Joseph 
Seminole County

>. April 27,10:38 p.m.. State Road 000. Paul Ed­
ward Czareckl. DOB 4/30/80, waa arrested by Seminole

! MolCounty Sheriffs ofllcers. charged with Operating 
dc/Crimlnal Mischief.

tor Vehl-

SBflBLagl
lST. April 28. 5:01 p.m.. Rinehart ! 
was arrested fay Lake Mary Police 
1th Orand Theft/Fraudulent Use of a C

Rinehart Rd.. Donna M.
Officer* and 

Credit Card.
Randall, 
charged with

LOROWOOD. April 28. Elijah Lee Munlzzl. DOB9/3/47 waa ar­
rested fay Seminole County Sheriffs Officers and charged with 
a warrant for Grand Theft.

tty. If you bmv In for- 
can remain anony- 

retard
«IU viihiti

Housing'
tags LA

voucher to purchase a home, 
or the option of remaining tn 
public housing.

Officials of the Sanford 
(lousing Authority are holding 
meetings with residents to 
explain the program. 
Residents expressed concerns 
about finding replacement 
homes.

Several residents requested 
that a representative from the 
U.S. Department o f Housing 
and Urban Development be 
present at future meetings.

•We will work with you,’  
Sanford Housing Authority 
Executive Director Tim 
Hudson said Thursday at the 
fourth meeting with residents 
concerning the program.

Hudson said that although 
HUD does not guarantee the 
purchase of a home, the 
Sanford Housing Authority 
'will ensure that no 
demolition will begin until 
housing has been found for 
every resident.*

The Department o f Housing 
und Urban Development will 
announce whether the Hope 
VI grant is awarded to the 
Sanford Housing Authority In 
October.

'Hope six Is a tool that 
housing authorities can use to 
help families live outside 
these Invisible four walla and 
live with other families In 
mixed communities,* Hudson 
said. *lt s a tool to Improve 
your quality of life.*

To make the voucher 
portable, residents must live 
In the issuing Jurisdiction 
(Seminole County) for at least 
12 months.

Under HUD regulations, 
residents will have at least 60 
days alter a voucher Is given 
to find replacement housing. 
The Housing Authority can 
grant two 30 days exceptions.

If the grant Is approved, a 
demolition company would be 
brought on board within six 
months. Then, the Housing 
Authority would have 18 
months to do the demolitions. 
Hudson said.

"We're going to work with 
you all for the next 18 
months.* Hudson said.

Residents will receive 
'creative financing* from the 
government during the loan 
application to * receive

approval on a mortgage for a 
home, Hudson said.

*We want to keep your 
payments at about $490 (per 
month).* Hudson said.

The Housing Authority will 
establish a relocation budget 
with the grant. Hudson said.

The Sanford Housing ’ 
Authority will build about 30- 
50 houses If the grant Is 
approved, Hudson said.

The City Commission wants 
the Housing Authority to 
include a business Incubator 
in the project, with cheap 
rental spaces for businesses 
that will train residents tn Job

Meanwhile, repairs are 
underway at the complexes.

*We can not assume that we 
will get the grant,* Hudson 
•aid.

Hudson said the program 
will give residents a chance to 
own property and leave public 
housing. He said the 
surrounding community will 
benefit from Increased 
property values.

Treena Kaye, director o f 
Central Florida Legal Services, 
said she Is concerned about 
whether the handicapped and 
elderly will find replacement 
housing.

Residents at the meeting 
also expressed concern about 
a federal law. that takes effect 
Oct. I, saying that any 
resident not working at least 
part-time must work for the 
Housing Authority at least 
eight hours per month, or face 
termination of the lease the 
following month.

The law exempts the 
handicapped. elderly,
disabled, or certain people 
under a welfare to work 
program.

Navy-
1A

professionalism o f today's 
United States Navy.* said 
Oviedo Chamber o f Com­
merce director Rich Sloane. 
"Everyone will enjoy them as 
everywhere they perform, 
they're net with excitement 
and enthusiasm.*

T.O.I.F. Is pari o f an all 
day musical entertainment 
schedule being presented on 
two stages at the annual fes­
tival.

'<s

Carmen Maria De Jesus, 73, 
Vestarta Way, Longwood. died 
Thursday. April 39. Mrs. De 
Jesus was a seamstress. 
Bom In Salinas. Puerto Rico, 
she moved to Central Florida 
In 1991. She was Roman 
Catholic.

Survivors Include sons. 
Raul M. Hernandez. Altamonte 
Springs: daughter. MUagros

* VcHICjO* IJIlM lQtli IfiOulCI ■#
Ruben Crux. Orlando: Dormy 
Crux, Puerto Rico: sisters. 
Migdaha Monel. Tost! Crux, 
both of Puerto Rteo; Hilda 
Crux, Philadelphia: stepbroth­
er*. Edison Camacho, Phila­
delphia: Hector Ramos. Cali­
fornia: nine,

Funeria
in charge of aervtcea.

Robert L. Meyers. 78. West 
York Court. Longwood. died 
Wednesday. April 38. Mr. 
Meyers was an investment 
banker. Bom In Cincinnati, 
he moved to Central Florida tn 
1981. He sms a member of 
the Church of the Annuncia­
tion. He was an Army Air 
Forres veteran.

Survivors include wife. Elsie 
F.; brother. Richard J.. Co­
lumbus, N.C.

Baldwtn-Falrrhlld Semo- 
ran-Forest City tn charge of 
aervlces.

Barbara A. Radetsky. 68, 
300 W. 20th St.. Sanford, died 
Tuesday, April 27. of conges­
tive heart failure. Mrs. Radet­
sky was a retired nurse. Bom 
In Braintree. Mass., she 
moved to Central Florida In 
1993. She waa Roman Catho­
lic.

Survivors include sons, 
Daniel M.: Paul: both of San­
ford: sister. Kathryn Webb. 
New Jersey: brother, Donald 
McLaughlin. Maryland.

Sunrise Funeral Home. Or­
lando. in charge of services.

LOTTERY
Hers srs the winning numbers 
selected on Thursday In Ihe Flori­
da Lottery:
Fantaay 6 April 30th 
3-11-17-21-24 
Lotto (April 24)
1S-21-25-30-31-45

Pt*y 4 
1+ 7-2 
Cash 3 
6 *1

Forth* BEST 
local sports 
covoragc 
look to the 

Stmlnolc Herald

Geneva: Charles Velde, Win­
ter Springs: 21 grandchildren: 
18 great-grandchildren ; 
brother-in-law, Bishop Adrian 
Vetgle. Borba, Brazil: and 
numerous adopted family 
members of Central Florida. 
She was loved and will be 
missed fay all.
A  mass of Christian burial 

will be at 10:00 a.m.. Friday. 
April 30. at St. Augustine's 
Catholic Church. Casselberry. 
FL. Visitation for friends will 
be from 8:30 p.m. to 9:00p.m., 
Thursday. April 29 at Alta­
monte Chapel of the Baldwin- 
Fairchild Funeral Home. 
There will be a rosary at 
7:00p.m. Interment will be at 
Glen Haven Memorial Park, 
Winter Park. FL.

Funrral •crvicru for Hnfcrrt L  M ey­
ers, 74. of Lnrwpruod. who M M c d  
•way an Wednesday, Apr* 2S. writ la  
hrtrf nn Monday. May 3. at 10:00 a m  
at Hie Churrh of the Annunciation 
with Father 
Interment •

Memory Oiirrtrm In heu of flower*, 
the fondly m jiif-l*  memorial* to The 
Annunciation Aeitdrmy SrhoLinhtp 
Fund.

tlALOW IN-FAIRCIIUi) FUNERAL 
HOME. Forr*l Clly Chapel. 022 W. 
Male Ita d  436. Allomnntc Spring*, 
r i .  1407) HS9 6005 in charge of *err-

U 'U ' i  U ' l r i r  C ' u i i h i t t o i i  h h

[ ) i m ■ r t (  r r m . i t  i o n

BALDWIN FAIOCIf ILD FUME UAL
HOM E. 904 Km* Akanmnfr Drive. Al­
tamonte Bpnww. FU  33701. 1407) 
S31-3031 Si rhargr of M r r t m

1 2 3 l o a n . c o m
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Luis 'Ed* Chacon. 54. of 
Meadow Hills Court. Sanford, 
died on Tuesday. April 27. Mr. 
Chacon was a salesman for 
Winter Park Dodge. Winter 
Park. Bom In Colombia, 
South America.' he award -to 
Central Florida In 1968. He 
waa a member of AH; Souls 
CathoEc i ChurVh.
Prior to Winter Park'] 
was a salesman at 
Furniture and Levttx Furniture 
stores for many yean and was 
part of the President's Club of 
Levttx Furniture store. Mr. 
Chacon was a U.S. Army Viet­
nam Conflict Veteran.

Survivors Include wife. Car­
men R..Sanford. two daiq(h- 
ters. Sandra. Sanford: Uliana, 
Pensacola.: son, Pablo. Lou­
isville. KY: sister. Paulina 
Revels. Miami. : brother. A l­
fredo. Colombia, South 
America: and one granddaugh­
ter.

Newcomer Family Funeral 
Home. Winter Park. In charge 
o f services.

TOOLS. VIRGINIA ALICE
Virginia Alice Velgle, 84. San 
Tomas Drive. Casselberry, 
died Monday. April 26. Mrs. 
Velgle was bom In Creason. 
Pa. She had an active role In 
St. Benedicts Mothers Club, 
Catholic Daughters. K and C 
Auxiliary. In Johnstown. Pa. 
Mra. Velgle moved to Central 
Florida in 1961. She was a 
memberof St. Augustine’s 
Catholic Church. Casselberry. 
Preceded In death by Hus­
band. Francis T. Velgle. 
March. 1989.

Survivors Include eight 
children. Tom Velgle. Sanford: 
Hazel Kiely. Ambler. Pa.: Re­
gina Kelley A  Rosemary Vel­
gle. Casselberry: Ely sc Ru- 
cosky. Kissimmee: Jim Velgle. 
Winter Park; Kathleen Qelm.

July ft, 1M5< April 1 4 II

Th# parents of this beautiful 
child have lost their son. 
The y are in need of funds to 
cover funeral expense*. 
Anyone wishing to contribute, 
may do so by sending money 
to any First Union Bank, for 
th* Christopher J . Bryson II 
Beneficiary Fund.
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ARAMENTHA E. ARMBRISTER 

“MENTHA”
July 1. 1909-April 30.1995

9od looked around His garden, & found an empty place 
He then looked down upon the earth and saw 
your tired face

He put His arms around you. and He lifted you to rest. 
God’s garden must be beautiful He only takes the best 
He saw the road getting rough and the hills were hard to climb 
So He closed your weary eyelids and whispered, ’’peace is thine"
It broke our hearts to lose you but you did not go alone,
A part of us went with you the day God took you home.
Though the smile is gone forever and your hands we cannot touch 
We will always have sweet memories of the one we loved so much.

The Family, Earl E. Minott, Son 
Naomi E. Ford, Winifred M artin, Denise Andrews

M i ' M t i M iH Am ow Am m
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First Baptist youth comfort Columbine students

Students and youth minister of First Baptist Church of Santord with the 
picture they will send to Colorado Andy Thomas. Laura Robinson. Jason 
Robinson, Christian Kovacs. David Smith. Valene Herter, Michael Vigt. 
youth director Kneeling, Mandi Thom as. Lori Sharrow and Duane Ortiz

'Hot* to him that Is alone 
when he Jalleth: Jot he hath 
not another to help him tip." 
Ecclesiastes 4:10 

Amy tost faith on a Christ­
mas Eve when she was 13.

Her father came home 
ilnm k that night. Amy's 
Christm as present from her 
fattier w as a broken nose.

Amy ran Into the streets, 
nose bleeding, and knocked 
on tire door of a church 
pleading for shelter. When 
they said  'no.* she felt like 
God had  rrjected her.

A week later she returned 
home. Amy's parrnts tried to 
case her pain by spending 
money. With three houses 
and five cars, her parents had 
money to spend.

The tune Amy needed with 
lamlty w as spent at boarding 
schools.

As a freshman In college. 
Amy discovered the pitfalls of 
frat parties. W hen she b e ­
came depressed she knew 
where to go: Ixivs and the 
bottle.

She w as the best friend a 
person could ask for. with a 
patient ear and a helping 
hand. Hut. substance abuse 
leads to friendship abuse.

Amy abused herself until 
she hit rock bottom.

She found hope In the eyes 
of her newborn daughter. The 
father disappeared, but baby 
Am anda will not lack for love.

Last weekend, at age 23. 
Amy married a man who 
promises to love her and 
cherish Amanda.

"Thank you for W in g  there 
for her." Amy's father told one 
of her friends at the wedding. 
"You know her better than I 
do."

On tlie happiest day of 
Amy's life, her father was 
tilled with regret.

Now. the daughter he d is­
owned is the daughter he 
wants to know.

"It should not have been 
this hard  for her." he m um ­
bled.

lie Is alone.
"W oe to him that Is alone 

tehen he Jalleth."

He thanked Amy's friend for 
being her safety net. but he 
was wrong. Faith was her 
safety net.

Amy found faith In love and 
kindness.

She found faith In herself, 
her daughter, and In people 
who care lor her.

Amy fell, but had the cour­
age to survive. She was never 
alone.

Amy lost friends through 
mistakes, but kept the true 
friends through kindness.

"Fatih is the substance o j 
things hoped for. the evidence 
of things not seen" - Hebrews 
1 1 1 .

It's I 1 p in. and Amy turns 
on the news. Soldiers are 
being sent Into combat. Chil­
dren are threatening to kill
children.

Turn the channel, but real­
ity Is undeniable.

W ar Is the Illusion that 
killing brings peace.

The teenage terrorist seeks 
|x-ure through annihilation. 

Alone when he falletli. 
Then there is Amy's daugh­

ter. approaching her second 
birthday.

'l l ie substance o j  things 
liofH’d Jor.

'll ie mystery Is there's still 
love, sit 111 grace Inside.

W e are not alone.

By Susan W en n er
H E R A L D  S l 'A F F  W R I T E R

SANFORD - In the wake of 
the recent disaster at 
Columbine High School In 
Colorado. students
throughout the nation have 
moumed. cried, feared and 
retreated. Yet. through the 
confusion and questioning, a 
local youth group decided to 
reach out to comfort the high 
schoolers with a message of 
hope.

First Baptist Church of 
Sanford's Youth Minister. 
Michael Voigt, shared that 
last Tuesday evening began  
with a cllrk o f the television 
remote and soon he was in 
tears as he watched and 
listened to the deviation. 
Although he h as heard about 
shootings at other schools, 
the Colorado massacre was 
especially heartbreaking
because Voigt's  In-laws live 
near the school and his own 
mother-in-law attended the 
funeral of a student that was 
killed.

"I guess we all want to think 
that the world Is a good 
place." said Voigt. "We want 
to believe that our children 
are growing up to becom e  
productive members of 
society. When I heard what 
had happened. I realized that 
at least 15 peop le 's  family no 
longer had that hope. They no 
longer even had the option of 
dreaming of a  better day for 
their son. daughter or friend."

Voigt added that he "prayed 
and cried and asked God to 
tell me something that we

What happened to the Protestant 
Church's idea to replace Sunday mom 
ing as the weekly day of worship' 

Nothing
After the Catholic Church broke with 

Sunday tradition 40 years ago and in­
stituted Saturday afternoon masses, 
there was some talk that the Proles 
(ants might follow suit Many church 
es made it clear that from their point 
of view, there is nothing sacred about 
"Sunday morning at II."

The success of the Saturday masses 
in the Catholic Church caused Protes­
tant ministers to give serious thought 
to the idea of holding midweek ser 
vices for those who preferred to keep 
Sunday free as a day of rest and re 
taxation

“In the old days." one pastor said, 
'churches would notice a drop in at­
tendance in the summer when people 
went to their cottages. But things were 
back to normal in September.

“Then people started keeping their 
cottages open till November. With the 
popularity of skiing and other winter 
activities, the weekend exodus became 
practically a year round phenomenon 
We decided we had to do something " 

What his United Methodist congre­
gation did was start holding Thursday 
evening services in addition to its 
Sunday worship service. But instead 
of the midweek service being a repeat 
of the previous Sunday's service, the 
Thursday service was new “from pre 
lude to postludc," including the 
sermon and the choir selections

The service was then presented 
again the next Sunday morning 

Some churches experimented with 
Monday evening services for those 
who wanted to reserve Sunday for 
HAH But the weeknight service was 
never tried on a wide scale Pastors 
doubted that many of their parish 
ior.ers would consider it an improve­
ment over Sunday 

“Those who are too occupied on 
Sunday are usually just as involved on 
Saturday,” said one skeptic of the pro­
posed changes Like most ministers, 
he stuck to Sunday 

“It's true." echoes one Lutheran 
pastor, "that, as our attendance fig 
ures indicate, many people want to 
spend their Sundays digging in the 
garden or reading The New York 
Times

could do to express our love, 
our coticem and otir 
encouragement to those  
Involved, since I was unable  
to physically to Littleton. I 
asked students from  
surrounding schools to donate  
money to purchase a large 
framed picture that would 
express how we felt and  
provide a piece of the healing  
that Is so desperately needed  
111 Littleton. /Ml the money  
that was received came solely  
from High Sc hool and Middle 
School students. Money was  
given by the students from  
First Baptist Church of 
Sanford. Church of the 
Na/arrne on Sanford Avenue 
and from Student Venture, the

SAINTS A N D  S IN N E R S

“There are other problems with 
holding duplicate services." he added 
“When do you have Sunday school'" 

Other alternatives to the "Sunday at 
11" church service were suggested and 
sometimes tried An abbreviated 
Monday evening service HO minutes) 
was found to be successful in some 
churches

But there were glitches One church 
dropped the Monday evening service 
when members insisted on being home 
by 8 00 so they could catch "laiugh In" 
on television

Most pastors say there would be no 
theological objection to choosing an 
other day than Sunday for worship 
Sunday is traditional because that is 
the day on which Christ rose While 
this is the chief reason, the church's 
Sunday observance has also been as 
sociated with the first day of creation 
and the birthday of the Christian 
church on Pentecost, seven weeks 
after Easter

The earliest scriptural reference to 
Sunday as a day of worship for Chris 
tians occurs in the Book of Acts 
Speaking of Paul's visit to Troas in 
Greece, the King James version says. 
“And upon the first day of the week, 
when the disciples came together to 
break bread, Paul preached to them " 

Most modem translations, however, 
substitute “on Saturday night" for "the 
first day of the week" This could mean 
that the early Christians regularly held 
their worship services on Saturday 
night.

One clergyman is of the opinion that 
“no one particular hour of the week Ls 
more sacred than any other. On the 
other hand. I am not sure that chang 
ing our services from Sunday to an­
other day of the week is the answer. 
It may be better to try another hour 
on Sunday"

What would be your reaction?
C vm NEWSI’Al’KH ENTERPRISE ASSN

praying for yon. It must be 
bard to lose all those people, 
especially if they were your 
friends." Others such as 
Laura Robinson. Andrew 
Thomas and Valerie llertrr 
also offered notes of 
sympathy.
Just as the youth ministry at 

First Baptist Church of 
Sanford "exists to transform 
youth and ultimately all 
people Into fully devoted 
loltowers of Christ." It Is the 
hope of all the youth Involved 
in this endeavor that comfort 
and transformation exist with 
those m need In Colorado. 
Tills, they collectively agreed, 
was the motivation behind 
their generous act

campus outreach ministry of 
Seminole High School *

He continued by saying." I 
realize that many people may 
think that this Is just 
a token gesture that won't 
mean much when so many 
people are sending things 
from .ill over the United 
States I am reminded though 
of a motto I heard once that I 
think best expresses how we 
would respond to this 
criticism. AVe can't do 
everything, but we can do 
something and that 
something we can do. we 
must do.”

Sonte of the First Baptist 
youth group cited thetr 
feelings. Christian Kovacs. a 
seventh grader, said In a 
letter."I understand how you 
feel to lose a loved 
one ..Always understand God 
Is with you and loves you." 
lain Sharrow. sixth grader 
said. "The reason I thought It 
was right to give was because 
what If it happened to me or 
my family I would want 
people to send support with 
love and peace to me." Mandy 
Thomas said. "I'm sorry this 
happrurt! to your sc hool and 
town. I'll lx- praying for you 
guys. 1 do know God cares 
and loves everyone Don't give 
up I'm sorry for your lossrs  
and I'll lx- praying * Duane 
Ortiz said. "I know many of 
you lost friends or f.Vmlly. 
Just to let you know that God 
Is with you and always think 
of the gixxi memories that you 
had together." David Smith 
said." I want all you guys and 
girls to know that I am

B ible s tu d y
CASSELBERRY • Perspec­

tives "99 Tuesdays will lx- o f­
fered from Jan. HI to May -I at 
Norlliland Community Church 
In church room 406 Tills is a 
Bible study for those serklng 
a deeper understanding of the 
Bible and a closer relation­
ship with God.

Perspectives Is a course for 
|x*ople who want to explore 
what God has In store for 
their lives. For more Informa­
tion call 830 7146

V ideo  n igh t
LONG W OOD - A Christian  

Video Night ts being offered 
on Tuesdays at H p in  at 
Kxodusla Christian Assembly. 
The night will feature fun. 
teaching and uplifting videos 
and fellowship

For more liii'omiatlon call 
802-1310.

Y o u th  G ro u p
SANFORD • Pastor Kay Ber­

trand has started a youth 
group on Sunday afternoons 
from 5 • 7 p.m. at Christ 
United Methodist Church. The 
group Is for anyone In 6th • 
12th grade Call 322-7U00 for 
Information

Y o u th  E xp lo sion
SANFO RD  Youth Reach­

ing Youth for Christ Is the 
youth department of the Full 
Deliverance Church of Jesus, 
a non-profit organization 
opened to all the youth In the 
local community. It is con­
cerned with teaching youths 
to lx- leaders in society and 
starting Feb 2. they Ix-gan a 
nightly program entitled Youth 
Explosion from 5:.'lO p m  - H 
p m.

Lessons Include biblical 
principals, authority figures, 
and more. On Feb. HI-20, 
there will lx- a musical p ro ­
duction for Black History 
Month titled. 'H ie  Chains 
’Dial Bind * The goal Is to help 
the youth to l>cl!cvr in them 
selves, stay In school, off 
drugs, oil of the streets and 
many more (xisitive princi­
pa ls Call Cindy Phlleman. the 
youth director of die Full De­
liverance Church of Jesus at 
330 3-125 for details

Youth Blast 99
SANFORD Youth Blast Tl*l 

will lx- held at First Baptist 
Church . 5HI S  Park Ave., on 
Saturday. May I at 7 p.m. A 
drama performance will be 
presented by "Medlterra" along 
with music by "Just the 
T R U T H.' and "Beautiful Sim ­
plicity."

Guest speaker will tx- Dave 
Edwards llzza and fellowship  
will follow the program.

For more Information call the 
church office at 322-60-11.

Revival scheduled
SANFORD - A  revival Is set for 

Second Shiloh Missionary B ap ­
tist Church. 2150 W. Airport 
Blvd.. on May 3 through 7 at 7 
pin . nightly. Evangelist Larry 
G. Mills of Orlando will pre­
side.

Sc heduled days and church 
sponsors are as  follows: 
Monday. May 3 - Mt. Sinai 
Church - Anthony Miller. Pas­
tor
Tuesday. May -l - St. Mathews 
Church of Midway - Leonard 
Wilson. Pastor
Wednesday. May 5 - New Mt. 
Cavalry Church of Sanford - 
Ricky Scott. Pastor 
Thursday. May 6 - New Mt. 
Zion of Sanford - James Lynn. 
Pastor
Friday. May 7 - New Mt. Sinai 
Church of Orlando - Larry G. 
Mills. Evangelist 

For more Information call the 
c hurch office at 3 2 1-6700.

Judy and Trent Roger*

Mother-daughter team to 
sing at Holy Cross Lutheran
By Satan Wenner
STAFF WRITER

I.AKE MARY • Judy and 
Trena Rogers, a mother and 
daughter singing team, wll 
perform at Holy Cross Lu 
t hr ran Church In Lake Mary 
7GO N. Sun Drive. The per 
formatter will lx- held fol 
lowing u Mother-Daughter 
Danqurt on Saturday. May 8 
at 8 p in. Special guest, To- 
rte. will also sing with the 
duo.

The team "share God's pow­
erful message through music 
mid ministry." according to a 
recent press release. "They 
communicate with humor 
and Inspiration lo audiences 
of all ages.'

New beginnings Ministries, 
as their mission Is called, 
shares Iheir commitment. 
During (he concert Judy 
shares the word In sign lan­
guage while Trena sings a 
heart fell sung. Toric, Trrna's 
daughter will also share a 
song from Iheir newest chil­
dren's album.

Over the years. Judy and 
Trena have been blessed to 
perform church conccris. re­
vivals. banquets, music con­
ferences. Christian enter­

tainment for Commodore 
Cruise Ships, live radio and 
television broadcasts. They 
have also participated In 
telethons. Mayor's Prayer 
Breakfasts, entertainment for 
theme parks, men's and 
women's business meetings 
and more.

Promoters add "they believe 
they have been culled by God 
to share their testimony to 
every person within reach. 
Their goal ts to draw families 
closer to God and to each 
other and they accomplish 
this through a ministry 
coming straight from the 
heart."

Deanna Schott, organizer 
for the event for Holy Cross, 
cited. "I picked this group lo 
perform because they have a 
phenomenal relationship. 
Since the theme of our b an ­
quet Is 'Izive through the 
Generations' I felt that they 
truly exemplify this. They 
have such an endearing, 
charming and Inspirational 
message and such a moving 
story. They feel their love Is 
truly a gift from God. They 
work together by choice and 
really love It."

For more Information about 
the event call the church of­
fice at 333-0797.

Is Sunday the only 
day o f worship?

We need your input and opinions. 
Letters to the editor and guest columns are 

both encouraged and appreciated.
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IT  U U K I  

ANGUCA* C*TVt»D**L
) ) «  V* S « *J« lAiwn. A n  ) 

| t < iA * (A r < M > « N ,
SH4t»(kiingF««f|

O m «  Ilona.
A a r u r n n

i .78 Run* 0< C crm n  l*'an<
St/allf S ry tM

• 00 a m S M  I  ucfwit
»  00 A m Sunday Schott

IMAgMi
(0 00 am W 'g(urrw n*i

| (A n » l  A* S a w tn i 
M a d a i  (o v e n

0»*y Mamng h i m  § K  a m
m i  Holy luchaxat > 00 p m 
Fn Mo», I  nth.**! 1700 noon

A« P u m  lb *
(M y Day. H O O n w i

T* . 0 » « n c *  •» Irtodh 
Th» Cmanca

A s s a m b ly  0 1  G o d

CONNfNSTONt 
A lU IM iV  OF QOO

I l f  N (M lT f  ChJb «4  
l AM M i’f Ft 
40/ » J | f 4 0  

Rm» MorOuuM
V f u J  9104m
W rV-i) 10 10 4 m

V A lly f ia n r g  400pm
rt*l l » r w , V ^  / X p m

^Xr^JarJ

f A H l »  I O I I M F  C lN TIft
1//0 W ftv'i
W «o rJ H  17//1

•0/ m  t e n
»•  »M t<
w » H r  S i u i  i i o  am
w.-***, ‘.•'vtA 10104m

5#<vc* / 10 pm
WTCIUVA A l l l M H f  O f GOO 

i l ^ D i o r  u j
i H  n r r »

40/ M o n ?
Grpg f '*mr**r f i ih /
V / D if  C M O '^a r W v < a «

9 00 4 m r d  * 3 K i *

Nb* Snxty *o# AtX/t i  f M p m
• fwwy i  p»w«)kJ to il irycai 
l HI RTY CHRISTIAN SCHOOL 
(4 VCARS TO 12TMQRAI# > 

m is T  BAPTIST CHURCH 
OF SANTORO 

Sf95 Am  snort) n  
40 M 2? 4041

O' S' p«%kjr
Tto* Tom Sm*H cd

Sf A rt^i 
Vouh Pa Mo#

S yV «(V »y  Or*ct0« of Mu*<
St/^Tiy School 9 15 4m
Sk/totfy Wo*V-p 10 10 4 m
W v trtrvng # y v ^ c  1 0 0 pm
W4d P'aM 'H&a Stotfy 9 X p m

Ntyi4/y P^darJ 

CCNTRAL BAPTIST CHURCH
n o i in i m s i  s n v d

(407) 122 2914
Ammy 04W P »*•'**' PMOr
Af’ir f jg«ia Auoc Patio#
Jaca M T»«sna« rjf M*k
Am P»jar U / '-v r  >  fjufi
S*ytd4y ScfK>A 910am
Mor>rg H O O am
I v«rang N / V i  I  00 p m
m d  P»aM* Saryca l ) 0 pf"

MUST BAPTIST CHURCH 
O f LONGWOOO

ft U/50 5194 
1407) m  JS17

SUJy 9 10 a m
***** 10 45 am
*tor**t>«C*M*7*C' Tf 1 10 p m 

AWASJLTouN 4 10 p m 
Mxv*P*a^*P*am' 7 00pm
A4A  O o f  • 00 p m

C K LI  BRA HON C HURCH 
LAHf MART 

*29 A  laM *«a Am  
I j m  M4*y fcAla 

(407) 121 0210
O' f i y i O O P  P iito

Mnmng
Ca n iN y  S#*wa 10 00 am

W »r*vlay *a/ 1
Taacf^g Mrnf'y 7 00 p m

rtRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
MAftR HAM WOOO*

5400 M i r t r y  No*]
L A B y  V N jti 9 X  • m IJ M  Wa', f l  UT49
W »B |  P'lyB* f  00 pm 40/) 1112095
f a i  t o #  to/i / X p m O' N® P«x«* fltfc*
W*.J 700 pm Uoyd rxjjtn

*km*| ftor' WJ W «N y

B a p tis t
CcPm  and Ootv/ 1  
IM-* Vjtfy

» X  A M 
945 A U

w ttr v ic w  t i p n s r  c h u n c h W / V t 10 45 AM

W e s t v i e w  B a p t l a t  C h u r c h  4 1 0 0  P a o la  R d .  4 6 A  S a n f o r d .  F L .

4100 P n i  Rt*3 44 A|
S r t o i  ftotoa 
•C 7 I2JCS21

O' D«rrM  L « * c r  Pm M
S ^ J iy  Morning

N / V t  900 a m S *0 15 4 m 
V Alay S tfu t 90Cam  S 10 19 am 
CT^ftP Tr»nng 900pm
iM 'v g T M V 'P  700 pm
Ami P*an» S#*v*4 700pm

COUNTRTMOC BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Costry C*A ft3 l a m  Mar> f t
**ry M lorg fM to
SvAMy S d u l 9 45 «m
P ^ 4 d v ^  9 WtoVto*-g 10 45 «m
ne* SauXy 9 X p m

/ X p m
W*J P»»y»» Um I / X p m
SW U r «  p 'ly*  IAm * 9 15pm

SkA#Ti Ptomd*d

R M C f N I f  RAPWRT CHUNCH
901 1 Mt /  »->*•• )

5 4 to 1  l< A t|  32 771
c n yip  or*w* m  J7i r
D* M C c W * »*••!*
V A lly  Sdmu 9 45 «m
M o m g Worvc 10 45 • m
(•*tng Wo*V«C ( X p m
fXT#*Jtfy

U k> N « t  Wty**p / X p m
C tvG f' 1  C/V*» / X p m

T W t l y  ^ittfn/ 9 X p m

JONOAN BAPTIST CHUNCH
920 i i  M 4 h j

133 9072
CscorjB W » P « t o
Sv»Jly Skfeu 1 0 X  • m
Mc*mj S r w i 11 OO tm
|r*V>g S#V»4 9 00pm
w * .r* vu » S#mce / X p m

0 3  T f j n  *o' • D«y

PALMITTO A V IN U I 
BAPTIST CHURCH
2929 Pam«t*3 Am  
Sartorj f t  12771

H#* Ron *7*am« Samof P**o* 
0*o Brian Hv/daon A u -v a 'i P»to* 
«•* O a*a« S*rp40r

ScPoof Pnncipa 
Bra Jay WAMm* O orf DwacK* 
Bro 8**4n Br?am voum P ti’o*
Bro BA S*mp%cr A T M  M gr O 'act or
* lar^y Afonr* Sa'vca 4 45am
* S«yv3ay ScToof 10 00 am
* Mcm^g A *yv* Sarnca 1 1 0 0 am
* E Mrmg AforV* Saonca 9 00pm

7 15pm 
/ X p m

A Af A N A *cw Cr*Jrpn 
Taan impact ** Tout*

(O-cAa^ • CN/t* P*wr.jadi 
A ry v *  700 PM

AnaAaaMy
e v e r  f cv'M ' a oo p  m
Taa^AOCAA* 9 45 PM
rju r  P’lt a  ard ***** '0 0  PM
Pr*M' * n  fl©*# SVJy 7 0CPM

V / * >  p ^ »ij* j *

C a th o lic
AU. SOULS CATHOLIC CHURCH 

•◦OOaa Am  S r t o i  ft  
4C7 122 1795

f a fa  »«.*a' 1 AT TtxA * iik r
Sal VSp V i m i  4 0C 9 5 10 p m 
V /  VatM i 7 45 Id X  9 12 X  a m 
S R n a rU a ii 900 am
C n w a o r  S #  1X  1 45 p m
Am*>Jay M m  9 0 0 a n

C h r is t ia n
FIRST CHHISTUN CHURCH 

iO»actp*aa of CAraf)
»9C7 9 S a ^ to lAm  S r t o i  f t

122 7727
V A S y S t fw i 9 10am
***** 11 0 0 am

-g rt
1//4 5cCC«r 9pm
BC-a Study am) P*«ya« Same# 7pm  

CePaa fn cm N p  A*a******
AI Am  Am * era Rra 

*»/lt'y A.a aC a
Marxpeap A i* u  

SANFORO CHRISTIAN CHURCH
7K upaaa * 1  S r t o i  ft

joa Caputo ' > r  M ' . *a'
StaM M*'<*' O ^u a n  t jU4abc*> 
M tr r g  f a 4 c«V *  • X  a m
V r S y  Itta  Sc*0O 9 X a m
MomngAyor** 1015
iM m rg Afc***

and *xm 1 0 0 pm
Amraviay 9 X  p m

f a-Vy Mgrt Soppar | B (m  Sfudy 
Surw y Pn>ndad

LAKE MART CHRISTIAN CENTER 
Sanaa Oodaor M mmai 

Maan^ af Pa Strang Communcaacra 
ai 900 Rnanad m  la a  V i i> ft  

Paatexa Cai 9 Sanaa Oodaon 
Nuraary 9 0.«dran a O v e r  P»CN*dad

C h r is t ia n  S c ie n c e
FIRST CHURCH Of CHRIST 

SCIENTIST. LONG WOO O
975 Mar*am /foods Read

Comar of E I AAaa^arr (V a ) 
407 TRS- 7709 

V A B y  C V d  V w i
a n SvPday Scroo iO O C a »

N »r# v i»y  • X  p m
C7M) Cam *.» a! a if a* Sanrcaa 

Raalng Moor
to A l ly  r*U  S4*-"14,
l O X i m  lo a x p m  

T V ld ly  I gw  t o | p «
* 45 m* .a Sprgi Real 

V M  'O A ly ig a o o )  f t  1 2 779 
PN** 4C7 M 9 »49C

C h u r c h  01 C h r is t
LONGATOOO CHURCH O# CHRIST
10H Rary ’ 7 92 1 N O  H«ry 414 
121 U K  4J90912 904-79*1173 

V a  f t o v s  1 0 X a m  9 4 p m  
«'a r »  t l  »o r v  Mudy a n  a v

* *  j r  t o  - •a' t o - 't  A * 'r d  
•y graa'ng »* «y i l a i n

MO f t  OHIO A
c h u r c h  Of Ch r is t

2*9 Ratta SI
Sfm oi f t  1273*

*xMy sa'vraa * 0 X A m tr5 0 9 r i 
S A B y B t a S W y  9 K  am
Ami Boa Vudy 720pm
M n«#r Ba^y M*yaa
fmema (407) 12 7 40C5

C h u r c h  01 G o d

CHURCH Of GOO
•c* w  22n  St S r t o i  f t  

407 122 1942
Mr* Amaay Ba*a* Paa»tT
Svinday ScPoc* 9 45 am
Morvng A**V* * 0 )0 i  n
f *angaa*< Satoca 9 00 P m
f anVy Eivxrmarl

Sanrea / f » r « v )4y 7 X p m
Samnua Trr*y 
Cimaran S d M  

P*a Scfoci irru ya ia  12 
407 121 2721 

Aao Day Ca*a Stafta 
af ! yaar fa p ' l k f t d  

407 121 1411

M a 'y  P'ardad

C o n g re g a t io n a l

GRACE fltLOW5MiP 
CONGREGATlONAt CHURCH 

INACCC)
2401 5 Pa*a a, «  S r « v l  

407 122 4*44
FradNaa Pitto
V A Jiy S ifo n  9 X a m
C N I 9 CePaa t O X a m

A W y  11 00 4 m
faaoar**  tWa* 4 0 0 p m

t*ry 2n Am aaĉ  " i/ r
C lo t P » J < l  A N te aB y 9 4 5pm
Scrap Par Coe (Vm i ' i v  

i aaf S r  aa.* mor* 9 X  a m

M '» Cca
Svnay

Memrg Af W  C 
l * r n ;  Sanrea 

T̂ aaday f Mnrg 
Htoa Svdy

E p is c o p a l

PW o

100C A m 
• 'JOtm

( K ( - i

N o n -D e n o m i n a t io n a l

WORO O f U fE  
CHURCH Of GOO *  CHRIST

I ' l  Sarfor] A « r  r  
S r t o i  fL  12771 

4C7 121 9U9
f  d r  j / ^ A r *  Rana'Acr P »tto  

1 0 X  a m 
11 X  am 
40 0pm  
7 W p m

F o u r s q u a r e

r  ?_ i

CORNERSTONE 
CHRISTIAN FELLOWSHIP 

Lsia U t'v  F o u iq u ri 
La*a toa'V I *m#rtary ScTooi 
Coma* i a»e toa'y B»1 a n  

Country C U ) Road 
U M  to*--, f i 

Ta< 407 12199X
Sfava Oo-%arr#f*y Pssfar
Sv«nday TAd*V* 1000am

■v+yiI J

HOLT CROSS 
(ISCOPAL CHURCH

act Pat Am  S r t o i  f t  
T —tr< r*  407 122 44*i 
Me* C A.«*ad Ccaa >

Mr* C rs fc p N ' B t o r g  
»iwatrg

Mrfy I A to 'V  7 X  a m
M P lC if N R t  »O O O i"<
Tutaday TOOam
A a y * v u »  10OO a m
TNyaday 7 )0  pm

ST PfTERS 
EPISCOPAL CHRUCM 

7X R ^a ra tR i 
l*«a Ma*> ft 

444 5971
Tr# Mae H i B* ĵa Macao* 

V A la y
H u fytu JP S l 9 X  a m
C trita r  E dxaton 

Aji Ajaa 9 X  a m
Mo*t E ucra**al *0 00am
CtoON" a O v e r  lO O O im  
(E Jucaaor Af*^
N k S ry  (Wgrs Af 9 X  I  m 
Tn*tx/jT O O C a m  S r v t i  

Afa<r aula y
Ncyy Ewer anal 7 0 0 pm

C h a r is m a t ic

E p is c o p a l

CHURCH Of THE HOLT 
COMFORTER

•Cranamanc - Satr'ama**ta» * 
t*anga-caT 

Tra Sa^Nxl Bnga 
Coma* J  t>v> St 9 Mery Am  

Sar'od Fiona 
407-29*5094

Ra« toa * Baim Oaacon
Sxyaay Ewcra^* 9 X a m

In t e r -D e n o m in a t io n a l

BEARDALL AVE CHAPEL
XC2 Baanai Am

407 12T 37>4

7 X p m

4 00pm
7 X  P m
7 X p m

v n a y  Scree*
lA /'/vj *****
Arayg # y i r s  
E ra*»mg Savea 
Twaaday

*A^» P*poaa V / l  
Be -a Stody Ma- as 
O orm nO aS Data 

N e re u liy
C m p tr
Uar#* ( V r )
C TO ' M y*«|-u 

1* S iA B y
to* Lena Ŝ PCR*

A J  S A B f  M r.Vtotoh
i-o*a*a bay a n  CAmar'

V I  V A B y  fisto s  
4A V A B y  * ju-  Day 
5P> V A B y  fa*cmWp a n  Omra* 

at vanua ccafcna

SHOWER DOWN O f BLESSINGS
2C» f m Am  S r t o i  fL

407 S ’ *349
Tmo*>y *tod*cA 4‘aato*
S A B y V f o o  1000am
Mc*mng Afar** H O O am
Twaaday Btoa Study 7 X p m
TNxaday P*aya* 9 X p m

N o n -D e n o m in a t io n a l

FAITHFUL WORO MPetSTRIES 
CNr*anan Raaourca Carta* 

ia * e .««P a /a *  407i 32S-4X0 
120 E Commaroai Si • Sanford 

Sxnay Sanr<« H OOam
C M > r  % fafloyMtop
agaa 4 *21

f  rn iy  f h  
Raf*aarmaria 

TN*raday
f aaowar-p toaarrg 

fn a y  • Croatian
CutoM 'fg 2 X  5 OOpr

P-aav cai 329-4X0 «0* apet 
Ray Sfa»a Metas 

Paaia»t>*actof

M a rtx  Pn cto Cy Tommy V a c b t i

LergarDOf) f l
x r .  124X97 43 7, •§9)729

Rato M i*a I C41 pm 0 
Me -> a.s laadar

I»ery 'tf  (  ->!*, cl MortN
fam#* Saceam Sa-vea 7 X p m  

M U y  Saccatm Save*
a* oira* f m n  4 15 p w

S tf*H f Saccam Samrcaa 9 X  a m 
M e n tr V e  A rg o c i Scftoi r d  

L x /  ix x a ’c r  P*og*r^a 
irto*4t</ Cai

|AS7, 799 1729 Of i407, 772 0477 
TEMPLE SHALOM 

Of DELTONA
1795 fa^am B/J 

Cwacra f u n  12725 
(9C4i 7f9 22C?

Mato ( 1  Sefaca conduefrg
f n a y 'v y i  w 'r M  at 9 X  5 m

Sato*lay n e r r j  wK.<a% 10 X  4 m

L u th e ra n

GOOO SHEPHERO EVANGELICAL 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 

Of SANFORO 
ILCA

29' 7 O rano O' Mery 1^97

B jC Braaar-a^n N tto
StoXay Scroei < t . •

a x /  Boa stuTy I M i m
W**K> Sa*v«ca 10 X  4 m

Nwraary FtondaJ

HOLT CROSS LUTHERAN 
CHURCH Of LAKE MART

790 StA Dt m  ta*a Ma~y f L 
Pato MCyf* Patio*
Saturday a w ^ j  5 X  P m

Cenamporany A fW *  
S A B y  momwg I X  am

SJday momyrg

11 X  am

12 X p  m 

7 X  P m

J e w i s h

CONGREGATION BETH EL 
O f CENTRAL f  LORlOA

’90 ID S Read

9 X  am

SbAday n * v x j  - X a m
f»mwy W orve Sa-v<a 

Nuraa'y i  provdad tf 
9 X a m  a n  11 X a m  MN<aa 

S A B y  SctoXl to »X/1
an cTuoran 9 X a rn
Maty C'oaa P»tacrcc4
fc# mdormaton Ca« 407 131-C797

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
O f THE REDEMMER

(MiaaowH Synod)
2525 Oa- A.t Sarfonj f L 

m#» Eim#r a  Rawacra' Pastor
S A B y  Sctox* ' C i C i m
***** 5#rv<a t O X a m

trfyTTvator. 122-1552 Of 323-04^0

M e th o d is t
CHRIST U N H ID  

MCTHO0*ST CHURCH
4C8 TjC>«» D "».

<C»r*r Tuck* Or t  Cn «7 1  
R n  Ra, B a n m  Pi«o»

Twpncr* (40*) 322-7900 
SuftU* School 910 am
■rw-Wmon ( 0 X » m
Morrwig M M N p  ( 1 0 0 am
SuT E>«v<g TOuWOnwO S-7 00 (ffl 
Oo*. Sv j »

A t f a v la )  I X p n
c r » w n  » TVr*. In e V M  n WorV<« 

Nornry prov-lH *or 
BMM. and S<r»a Cr*m n  

v m  Erwu^i To lo r .  VBu - 
O o ^n g  b  O i » «  To 5 ^ v »  you"

EWST UNTTID 
M lTHO O rJT CHUWCH

4*3 P r .  A y. ViTtora F l  
407 122 4J71

E U a M h T9 9 4 U 4 a l Ptuor
0 4 ^ . C,mncr Choir [V ie w
Waa I b W  Tamra W n a m  f>nCO 
Morrrig Worth* 8 211 10 55 • m 
CcffMFbKMVTO 9 M 8 m
Sunoar School 9 43 «  n
irouih Fm o«V < p  4 0 0 p m
R h n r  t I h c m R .

1«1 Ihyvnj T l O O t m
h w  i  Croa

TndWgnUf
10 00 4 m 2 00pm 7 ] O p m

M b  t P'lr** 8*14*1111
i«a lNjmaa» 8 10 4 m

Mao t iM cm h g  Or*.*
>d T i w U y  8 »  pm

**c*w*> P w «

C IU C C  UMT10 
uETHOotsr c h u h c h
419 CoibTry C b t B c«J 

Mar, Fl 
4C7 122-1472

D#vrJ 4 I.OM4 >  Purer
C e na ^or*  S4*v*c. I X a m
S*Ala, Schoca » 10 ■ m
Uy*«~j r r -r v e  I010 - l i l 0 8 m
S*/i CcbM Fucaawp 11 10 1  m
Towlh G«»*e Ss*h 3 00-7 X  p m
0 7 a a » h i h *  K M  I l i a n
Chanc* O c v  hac 7 X  p m
J O T  IJ lM O U r  Tou»|

l2ndF" U t 4  Morihi 12 X p m
U W M  T a -o J U  War

2-xJ S. 1  cF.a Moriri 7 X i m
Unrmj Ma*hcOM h  r a '

3*3 S4I cj 44 Uontri 
(3 M  SiuUt  'O X  4 m
M u -r g  11 X  8 m

X4-r*g Sh.'r-g Aca G '3 «»X  
b  Or4C*

Nazarene
fM ST CHURCH 

O f THE NAZARENE
25*i Sarfe/d Am  Sarfo*d fL  

X  7 122-H22
jca Cam#* Paste*
toorNAg *for*p ) M | H 0 0 l M
SA<By Setoxf S X i l I X a m
$ A B y  EM*"Ag 4 X p m
Wa-d V jf i  Br-a Study 7 X  p m 
*fad Ngrt Wx.m G rxp  7 X  p m 
Nad N / f  Cara*an 7 X  p m

LONGWOOO CHURCH 
O f THC NAiARENf
2 X  N MHympn Si 

LCAgaood fL 
931 *559

f •‘oeitoi 9 i 5 t m
S A B yS e N W  9 4 5 t m
Mortorg #yor*«0 10 45 4 m
Cmnran 4 CfVtfi 1045*m
F tro a n fe S im e a  4 X p m
/ m r e « a y F ir * t  N 7 1  7 X p m

fouto Namn. and a a a  Be. a St^dy 
T V l B y  7 X p m

X M  w m  a Pwrpoaa’
M a n  p*#m * Rraaefatf *4f I 00 im

*NaM* A Stranga* H#ra*

Presbytarian
UPSALA COMMUNmr 

PRf S IT T IN U N  CHURCH
Corrar Gf W 25m Si *

UCV44 Rd
1C1 UC4A 4 Road 

S r t o i  FL 32 771 
X 7  I X  2935

^jyst S Aam va Paafor
S A B y  Educator 9 X a m
* •* ‘iy Nerv'd **
2nd /reXevBy of aacr monir 
fan w arp  Omar ( X p m

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
O f SANFORO 

Bafeaan 3rd a n  4ir St 
9 Pax I  04a 7 Ocertown 

Sarford FL 
f^ona 407-322 2992 

fia  4C7-322 2944 
■'rm“a*a Wa Know Toy Nama" 

m T n  Naar Of P'a Cfy 
Raw Bruca B Scon Patter
S ^nay O v e r  Senoa i Q O Oi m
Swnday Momyig iNOfSNp l O X t m

Nu*ia*y
A r r e s B y  f amtfy Ngrt

Swppa* • Em *> Wad 5 X p m  
YOutr G'dwpl • Rad 5 X  • 7 X  p m 

Buccaraa*! K-4 Gradat)
V  M a n  i5 4 Graoat)
Sartor H gr 
AX-1 Program*

Ra<r#vlay ( M ' 7 M p m

FIRST PRCS S m  RIAN CHURCH 
O f LAKE MART

128 W W»t>ur Am  
uwa Mary f L
407-321-1021

K m  AF S(M ns P « t o
Chufth P-X*v M ««n g 9 1 5 a m
Chufth SchocX 9 45 am
Momrg MorV-p 11 X a m
TQUh tlnuc 9 X  0 m
V f «  Chew P n c lt . / X p m
Thurt ’ejubChor 9 X p m

MAfWHAH WOOOR
p R C sa m m A N  c h u r c h
/ Max**am twoodt Road 

la*a M*y 40 7 333 2 C X
Mr* CnaratR J e m  Pastor
V A B y  Scrod atf agaa 9 X a m
C Tvtfi Sanxaa l O O l t O X a m  

Nuraary P w ia d
Wxim Group S A B y  J M p r n
P*a-$<noci Man irr jfn  9 t o i 2
MontfTy fafTWy NgTt Swppa*

TNrJ WrravJay of
Eacr Menm ( X p m

WflUVA PRESBYTERIAN
CHURCH

211 Ra«>4 S pnrgaU n 
Longwqpd Pnera §99-16G*

Pa* Dr Jem A D« at 
Cruftr Sanreaa 9 X | i i X a m  
S A B y  Sa m

(At a p t 1 9 4 5 a m
Nuraary Pn*wdad

Seventh Day Adventist
SANFORO MEADOWS 

SCVfNTH OAT ADVENTIST 
CHURCH

5915 N CourtyRd 427 
Sanvd FL

X7-322-7910
S w ea t iSa») 915 a m
Orvna iWo*v*p (San 11 X a m  
PrayarMaatng Wad ) 7 X  p m 
A"a* Be-a ( S a f ) 1 i 5 p m

SANFORO SEVENTH OAT 
ADVENTISTS

IOC E Sacon S tof 
Svtord FL W771

i407, 32 1 5949 
Palter jaciion Oeggara 

P^on r40T) 79*-’2X  
Saccatm Scrooi 9 X  a m
0*v^aWcr*p t I X a m
P'aya* Maamg

Wrraudayt 7 X  p m
T n  Ou*cr w^a't fair 

Next TTrougr leva

S p ir it u a lis t

SPIRITUALIST CHURCH 
OF AWARENESS. NS AC

3213 N O c m *4* T'tf of 
of Ba*«t Mead Ofano 

Swnay Sanrea 10 X  a m
(V a rtv B y  Sato'ca 7 X p m

Mi'Vffa^rg 2nd S A B y  
Sactamca* irru Apm 

For mcra rf© cal 407*79 34*8 
CoPaitcM Pa* Jaan la tr  *

Pa* Am Otoatargar

u C S S SPIRITUAL CENTRE
i a  A A uer Am  
OrangaC-fy f l  

(Acroaatrom 
Bwa S jm g i Awto WtlT)

Pa« Margwat Am Scr n  Paaror 
S * R y

M eaA] S w ea t O X a m
Paguat Sine# t O X a m

n i A B y
a j  V e tu p i Samoa 7 JO p m

mfiymahcn on Cf\/cn fvrctiona
a n  Sptnfuai Co / m ^

C4d 1904, 229-2222

U n it e d  C h u r c h  01 C h r i s !

LONGWOOO HILLS 
CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH

u c c
1255 E E  VWt»arNon Poad 

Longeood fL 
4T*\32 9253

Oa* Dr Ha, ruwgcxxd Mirvvar
Swnday Saxcai

Cor*—*Oorary 9 X  4 m
T'aot-cr* Wortr-e ’0 X * » -

Nwraary Pn^nad
Ctoifcr Scrooi 9 IS a m - i O i S  a m  
Toutr 4 Crwdran Mixainr

W areuBy ( X p m

Wesleyan
WESLEYAN CHURCH 

OF PAOLA
5590 Wayuda 0*
Sar^fd FL 32771 

i0* F4 1 Em  5 i) Wait 
F n l Sf'tat on lan • Or# Mwi 

Ltonard 0  Dema* Pastor
407 )22 9332

■ Y T a i tra Goapa, »i Good s#*m  
Sunday Serge, 9 45 4 m
Mommg Wor* Q  ft X  4 m
E eanrf'g Wor* p ( W p m

Mu>Wa«« M*g Wad 7 X p m
P'aaia Snax Your L»a Wtr u*

t  %  f t  1? K 1:;,J

THIS PAGE IS MADE POSSIBLE BY THESE CIVIC-MINDED SPONSORS
THEY DESERVE YOUR SUPPORT

/

BARNES HEATING & 
AIR CONDITIONING

COMPUTE SYSTEMS • *00 OKS 
FREE ESTIVATES • SERVICE AIL BRANDS 

r e s id e n tia l  a n d  c o m m e r c ia l  
-m ea t  p o m p  EXPERTS'

STATE CERT 4CAC016U4

9 1 5  W . 2 n d  S t .  3 2 3 -3 5 1 7

Aa African American
finest Presents 

Creative Inspirational 
GOSPEL SONGS  

by Nr. Horace 323-1386

RIDE WITH THE BEST...

U N IT E D  C A B

RatioraO'a Ratal 
5am  - 11pm 

Lcariad A miurad (407) 321-7741

ACE
Hardware

S t o r e s

SANFORO
207 E  25th SI 

3 2 1 -0 8 0 5  
LONGWOOO 
H a y  434 5  427 

3 3 9 -4 8 8 3  
CASSELBERRY 

W*mar Park Or 
3 3 9 -7 3 6 5

tour Satisfaction... 
My Minimum Standard

w a  local Roalcnt For 48 Yean 
K m  b T iT i  R iu  E im  ^  

U f l  L A K E
Pgattl Ault n M A R Y

3X1-X720
COLDUJCLL 
B A N K C R  1)

B A l d w B  F A l a d i i l d  O a K U w h  P a s L

C i u m a y  m ,  h m u l  H o m

offenng pro-arrangement through 

THE SIMPLICITY PLAN ,M 
St. Rtf. 4(A  at RlHnehart Rtf., lake Mary

322*4263

SEMINOLE TRINITY CHRISTIAN 
SCHOOL and DAYCARE

Pre-schoot thru 12th grade 
*A Ministry ol Church ot Goa ol SantonT 

A BEK A Curriculum 
S O I W . 2 2 n d  S t . .  S a n to fd  • 321-27 33

3#*1
J i m  D u n n

Owner
UV-2S480

CM FORD CHRYSLER 
All American & Import 
Car A Truck Repairs 
P h o n e  3 2 1 - 7 0 0 0

201 N M.iplri A.o
Santord. FL 32771 

Comw of Conyrwfciar 8 Map* 
iN.if to S»TYno» Herjui

Village On The Green
Ki-iircrik-nt &  Nursing C’cnicr 

For a cum-ni haling ol 
j »  jiljhlc po-ilionv vall Mu.tk.-le 
( jf|k-nuf. Ituiiun Keviurcek jl

(4 0 7 )  6 8 2 -0 2 .M )

o /a J teo ieu r -N U R S IN G  C E N TE R  

A L o n ^Te n n  Skilled Facility
Respite Cere Prognrn • Reliel ter Hie Ceregiter

CHECK OUT OUR LOW RATES
S H E  SECONOST SANFORO

4 0 7 -3 2 2 -6 7 0 7

Chapter W  Verse
Christian Books Tapes ‘.V Things

M h  E. (j im m e rc ia l S l  • S anford 
(UlrMru I'li/i nru to Civil tVnur) 
Ribtrs • Books • florals ■ Prints

• CIJls • Keseanh Books
• Cassette Rtkle Similes

A D O P T I O N
Free medical care, transportation, 

counseling, private doctor 
plus living expenses.

Bar *237515 • St Petersburg Attorney

UC EN S EO  
8 0 .C C  D

A.J.G. LOCKSMITH
aeia e m i i  A n .  • M «y. i ;-* a

■ANPONO, P U M B A  1*771 
A lO E N J GREENE MO0ILE SER VCE

LOCK I  SAFE (WORK

STENSTROM
REALTY

Patrick Stenstrom & Staff

322-2420

HARREL & BEVERLY 
TRANSMISSIONS

David Beverly and S taff 
209 W. 25th St.

BRISSON 
FUNERAL HOME

O  R -Shorty" Smith and 
Bill Welborn

9 t h  S t .  a n d  L a u r e l  A v e .  

S a n f o r d  3 2 2 -2 1 3 1

V IA  IK l . \ K i r s  
v i l l a g e :

LAKE A0A 
t BEDROOM $355 

2 BEDROOMS $445 $470

: i 2 : u u » 7 0

TH IS  SPACE 
AVAILABLE
Only $6.00 Per Week 

Call: 322-2611
UNIVERSAL SECUHITY A 
INVESTIGATIONS. INC.

Pn«M lAMtnQtfKM • VIP 5*cuMy • ProiKftM '>«i*m # • 
Krpul Wwn*y • Bcur'y CmaM» < ***«••.*."•*% I 

lcent* fcwirw AM00144 9<M00114 LMQ0J1J 9undftt
<p»*» (Jl fill JOHN 1 RIGHT. JR.

fm klcK l
ib il  S Ortuhto Dr Suite H 
i SjuiforJ. f l  «773

f . .  IW ’ I ( I I I I . ( 
b l l  IWT* ( l . -W -  

I

(407)330-1660 fOOO SERVICE EQUIPMtM 
FAX (407) 373 3325

C E N T R A L  S Y S T E M S  S  E . ,  IN C .

COMMERCIAL INDUSTRIAL REFRIGERATION

BOB ClAPx 2620 IROQUOIS AVENUE
ST R£G RA 0059149 SATifOPO FLORIDA 32773 323-2999

COLONIAL
ROOM
RESTAURANT
M Sat »  30 AM - 7 PM 

115 E. FIRST ST., 
SANFORD

STENSTRO M . M d N T O SH . COLBERT 
W H IG HAM  & S IM M O N S . P.A. 

—  Attorneys at Law —
Suite 22 - Sun Trust Building 

200 West First Street 
Santord-322-2171 

Internet - http /Aeww stenslrom.com

THE McKIBBIN 
AGENCY
I N S U R A N C E

114 N. Park Ave., Sanford 
322-0331

JIM ROWE 
PEST CONTROL

LOCALLY OWNED AND OPERATED 
RON RISSI A STAFF 

2626 Iroquois Ire. • 322 2070

— ( W im D ix ie • y

mktpim
TH IS  SPACE 
AVAILABLE
Only $6.00 Per Week 

Call: 322-2611

tuitions Keelin'
COUNTRY CHICKEN

“i r S  MONEY OlPPfD 
1905 FRENCH AVE 32>J450

Air CrattnOetailing
Available A I Day Tues and Wed 

Dependable Service • Competitive Prices
8  NoftUf/TUnd W ei"
-  KonmeJanet c*ll Foe A ppointm .nl '
”  t Owner I  Pgr .(4 0  7) 974 0956

G r a m  k o w
F u n e r a l  H o m e

• Complete Funeral Services • Cremation 
• Markers & Monuments • Prearrangements 

500 E . Airport B lvtf., Santord 32773
3 2 2 -3 2 1 3

SL John's Riverside.
Adult Home

t t ’m y o u r  d a y .
W e pick up  and drop off your 

loved one. 140.00 per day.

. ▼  (4 0 7 ) 341-5133

—  — -  **
.a ^ a w y ig c J --• 5 4 i
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People

VFW  honors JR O T C

At the Air Force JROTC awards ceremony at Seminole High School, 
tho Votorans of Foroign Wars prosontod citations and Bronzo Modals 
to two outstanding cadets and a plaque to Col Charles H Gibson. 
USAF. rot. senior aerospace science instructor at the school. »i ap­
preciation of his devotion to tho AFJROTC program and his assis­
tance to tho VFW Post and Auxiliary Making tho presentation to Gib­
son (contor) aro Sandra Cass. Ladies Aunliary president, and Norm 
Cass, commander of VFW Post 10108 in Sanford

C A LEN D A R
W riters ' g ro up

llir  Hound Tallin Writers' 
(irini|> meets every Saturday at 
111 .i in In tfir rafe al Herders 
liookstore. HMO \V. State Hoad 
l-'M* (southeast comer of -l.'tti 
•ind Kill. Altamonte Springs

Hie meetings are open to 
anyone Interested hi Improving 
writing skills, whether lor rn- 
loyment or lo adv.uur toward 
gelling work published There  
Is no cost.

Anyone Is welcome to attend 
the meetings, and to partlrl 
pate by bringing examples of 
their own creative writing For 
more Information rail Darrell 
Johnson at |4U7| 282-1449.

Sunbe lt D ay lily  C lub
Sunlielt Daylllv Club meets 

•lie first Sunday of the month 
at 2 p m through Apnl .it the 
Agricultural Center In Sanford

The club educates members 
on daylllv growing through 
slide shows, guest speakers 
and trips to daylily gardens 
There are no club dues Call
3 5 1 :i2 i«i

Blood B ank
Central Florida Blood Bank  

Is asking donors of all types of 
blood especially O  type d o ­
nors to donate at Us Sanford 
branch. 1302 E. Second St. For 
Information, call 322-0822.

S a n fo rd  R o ta ry
Hotary Club of Sanford meets 

every Monday at noon, at tire 
Marina Hotel.

C a n c e r  su p p o r t
Support. Hope and Recovery. 

S.II.A.K., meets every Monday 
afternoon at 5 p.m. at Central 
Florida Regional Hospital In 
•tie far com er of the dining 
room. Tills Is a self help sup- 
|Kirt group for all cancer survi­
vors, whether In treatment now  
or finished with It. Call 324- 
H737 or 322-7785 for more in­
formation.

C o n tra c t B ridge
I lodge players are Invited to 

play contract bridge every 
Monday, at 10:30 a.m.. at the 
Sanford Senior Center. For In­
formation. call 322-6326.

G a m b le rs , fam ilies
Gamblers Anonymous and 

Gum-Anon for family and  
friends, meet separately M on­
day and Friday (non-smokers) 
at 7:30 p.m.. Church of the 
Good Shepherd. 331 Lake Avr.. 
Maitland. For more Informa­
tion. t all 236 9206.

N arco tic s  A nonym ous
Narcotics Anonymous meets 

Monday at H p.m. at the Pres­
byterian House of Goodwill. 
317 Oak Avc.. Sanlord

L akeside  L ions
Tlie Sanford Lakeside Lions 

Club meets the first and third 
Monday of the month, at 7:00 
p.m.. at tlie Marina Hotel. 
Visitors and new members are 
welcome. For Information, call 
Malt Altemose. 322-8545, or 
David Hall. 330-5238.

llir clubs living field Is located 
in Sanlord For more Informa­
tion. contact L-r Dorstie at
574-4732

O v e re a te rs
A n onym ous

Overeaters Anonymous meets 
every Tuesday, at IO a m In 
Parish ll.dl Wintrier I an mgr of 
Holy Cross Kplscopal Church 
In Sanford Hie meetings last 
about an hour There arr no 
dues nor fees. Hie only re 
ipiiremrtil lo attend Is the d e ­
sire to stop eating com pul­
sively

S h u ff le h o a rd
'Hie Sanford Tourist and  

Shulllrboard (lu ll p ra rllie s  
every T1irsd.iv and Friday 
starting at I :U) p in The 
i mills are located behind I lie 
Sanford Senior Center Those 
Interested In playing, learning 
lo play or Joining the d u b  may 
rail Ktiss Kllnrr. president. 
322-7751. tor Information.

S en io r a c tiv itie s
l-akr Mary Seniors Invite any ­

one 55 years or older to Join 
thrm In activities every Monday 
through Friday. Irom 9:30 a til. 
to 3 p.m.. at the Lake Mary 
Community Center. 200 N. 
Country Club Road.

K iw anis C lub
Klwanls Clut) of Casselberry  

meets every Tuesday at 7:30 
a.m.. at Denny's on Slate Road 
436 In Casseilierry. For Infor­
mation. call 83 1 8545.

T o astm aste rs  m eet
Tlie Night Owls Toastmasters 

Club #6581 meets every Tues­
day of the month, at 7:30 p in., 
at the Lake Mary Community 
Building on Country Club 
Road. Contact Kost-lla lionham  
at 323-828-1 for more Informa­
tion.

Sanford  S en io rs
The Sanford Senior Citizens 

Club meets the first and third 
Tuesday, at II a.m., at the 
Sanlord Senior Center. A hag 
lunch follows. Visitors are wel­
come. For Information, call 
322-2353 or 322-8161.

W idow s, w idow ers
Widows or widowers or per­

sons with spouses In nursing 
homes (W.O.W.) Is a group o f ­
fering support, bonding, assis­
tance. brolherhood and social 
activities to members. 
Meetings are held the first 
Tuesday of the month In the 
Florida Hospital at I 1 a.m. In 
Dike Mary on Sand Pond Road, 
right oil of Like Kmuui Road. 
For more Information call Doin 
DcSamo. 323-5152 or Mlnnlt- 
Kane. 322-8549.

M asons
'Hie Sanlord Luigi- *62 

FAAM - Stated Communica­
tions are held on the first and 
third Tuesdays of each month 
at 7:30 p.m. Dinner Is served at 
6:15 p.m.

The lodge Is located at 212 
Park Avc. North. Sanford. For 
more Information call (-107)
322-2616.

How to face the myths of marriage
"And they lived happily ever 

after". Nearly rveryone lias 
been tainted liy fairytales and 
dlmeslore novels altout the 
tmths of marriage. Many cou ­
ples believe, al least In part, 
four myths alxiut life after mnr- 
hagr.

Myth I: You and your spouse  
expect exactly the same tilings 
from marriage.

But remember, you grew uj> 
In different households with 
different rules, expectations 
and roles. You can t assume 
that your jiartner will have the 
same "script" as you do. The 
expectations you bring to mar­
riage ran make or break your 
relationship. Tlie more openly 
you discuss your differing ex­
pectation*. the more likely you 
arr to create a In-ttrr partner­
ship.

Myth 2 Kvrrythlng In your 
rrl.itlonshlp will get better.

Romance In thr beginning of 
•i relationship doesn’t last for­
ever flits illusion ts what grts 
a lot of peojilr In trouble. In 
reality, people tend to con­
struct an Idr.ill/rd Image of the 
person they marry. After you've

l l\Kll\k \ III (.Ill s

C v , V

\
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married for a while, you realize 
you've marrlrd a human b rin g  
and not an Image. Tlie good 
news is that disenchantment 
enable* you lo move Into a 
deeper intimacy

Myth 3: Everything had In 
your life will disappear

Many proplr marry to erase  
loneliness or avoid unplrus- 
untnrss. Hut marriage dorsn  t 
erase personal pain. People get 
married primarily to further 
fhrlr own well Iwlng. not to 
take rare of someone else The  
feelings and traits you had Ik--

Plate glass could 
be a disaster to 
unwary shoppers

HF.AR A It I tV lii.1 week I was m 
New York City for a conference On 
my first evening in the hotel I 
noticed ii large adjacent store had 
an entrunce from the hotel lobby A* 
I walked quickly to the store 
entrance, I suddenly received a 
blow to my face that knocked me 
down, broke mv glasses in half, cut 
my eyelid and made my n iw  blcssi 
I bad walked full-stride into u plate- 
glass door’ With bright lighting 
inside the door and «>lt lighting in 
the lobby, I had seen no reflection 
on the glass

When I returned home this week 
and related my story , nearly every ­
one I sjsike to had a similar story or 
knew someone who did The inci­
dence of injuries from this kind of 
accident must be staggering

Since regulations vary from 
place to place, please urge your 
readers to place decals, logos or let­
tering at eye level on any plate- 
glass window or door that could pos­
sibly he mistaken for an opening I 
have seen this done in attractive- 
ways that promote a store's name or 
image Had such a visual cue been 
in pluce, I would not have been 
injured As a side note, my compul 
»ive habit of always parking an old 
puir of glasses as a backup finally 
paid olT

I’ANE-FUL EXPERIENCE, 
ATHENS. OHIO

B E A R  P A N E -F U L : I have  
heard about hapless individuals 
w a lk in g  th rough  p la te -g la ss  
patio doors during sw im m ing  
parties or summer barbecues, 
but this is the first tim e I’ve 
heard about its happening in a 
business establishm ent. Your  
suggestions are valid. I hope the 
m unugem ent o f the h o te l in 
which the accident occu rred  
will institute same safeguards  
to prevent It from h appen ing  
again. It could prevent injuries, 
as well as protect the hotel from 
a lawsuit.

DEAR ABHY: Pleuse send u 
wake-up call to starry-eyed women 
who marry for *love' und never look 
past their heating hearts As cold 
und unromuntic as it may sound, 
financial security should also be a 
consideration when muking a life­
long commitment The moment 
your Prince Charming adds your 
name to his credit curds, hunk 
accounts or other legal documents, 
he cun begin weaving a web thut 
connects you tighter than any rtiur- 
riage contract.

Abby, there is so much more to 
choosing a partner than just physi­
cal attraction or “love.” Lust with­
ers. and what’s left behind needs to 
be u secure, capable jiartner -  not 
a wimpy flnunciul disaster.

BEEN THERE

D EAR  BEEN TH ER E: Many  
people marry for love und have 
strong und lusting marriages, so 
I’m hesitant to cast aspersions 
on all love matches. However, If 
someone marries u financially  
Irre sp o n s ib le  p a rtn e r , o n e ’s 
first thought should be damage 
control. 'Hie marriage might be 
salvageable if the responsible  
purtner is w illing to set limits 
on the other’s imprudent spend­
ing. It cuuld mean closing Joint 
uccounts, putting the money in 
the nam e o f the re sp o n s ib le  
spouse und canceling joint cred­
it cards. If the murriage is reul-

l> a love mutch, there should be 
no difficulty In getting the nec­
essary signatures to remedy the 
problem . If the problems p e r ­
sist, h o w eve r, und th e re ’s a 
refusal to ciMiperutr, the p ro b ­
lem may he less uImiuI finances 
than w ho’s in control.

• • •

DEAR AIIBY The letter from 
"Mourning in Texas" prompted me 
to write "Mourning" w.t* disup- 
pointed uL>ul the small nmnls-r of 
floral arrangements sent to his late 
wife's funeral

You were correct in stating that 
many people donate money to chan­
ty in order that "something good* 
may come from the sadness of a 
loved one's death However, we 
should all remember that floral 
arrangements sent to a wake or the 
home of the gnevrng are also "some­
thing gissi* — and useful

T(s> often. p»siple hesitate to send 
flowers thinking they'll Ik- thrown 
out after the funeral But what is 
imjxirt.int is the message of condo­
lence that (lowers convey to the 
grieving family during those 
extremely dltTlcult few days Flow­
ers are for the living they say, 
"We loved her. loo She had value to 
us, and we care that you are  
grieving "

This is not to say that making u 
charitable donation isn't worth­
while, but to remind people thut 
sometimes flowers siM-ak volumes.

May I share with you what my 
husband and I do ut such times? 
When we uttend a funeral or u 
wake, we take a card and a single 
rose One week later, we send u 
"thinking of you" card A month 
later, we send u colorful arrange­
ment of flowers to the family of the 
deceased to let them know they are 
still in our thoughts und prayers. I 
cannot tell you how often we are 
told. "Thank you for thinking of us. 
It feels as though everyone's world 
has gone on and no one remembers 
we ure in pain, hut you remem!>er."

Abby, it makes us feel wonderful 
to let someone know they matter

FLOWER FANS. 
LONG ISLAND, N  Y

B E A R  F L O W E R  F A N S :  
Thut’s u terrific jrlun of uction, 
und one from which muny cun  
leurn. Too often, after the funer- 
ul und ull the offers of “W hut 
cun I do to help?” — there is 
only silence.

To order "llow  lo Write l^ l lrn  for All 
Deration*,” tend a butinett tiled , 
addrvtted envelope, plu* cheek or money 
order for H .M  ($1.50 In Canadal lo: Dear 
Abby, L e tte r  Booklet. I*.D. Hot 447, 
Mount Mornt, III tftU5HM17. (I'ottage U 
included.)

I hmmI advice for everyone -  Irena to 
ten lort — It In **The Anger In All o f  Ua 
and llovv lo Deal With It.” To order, tend 
a butinett ailed. *e If add retard rnvrlopr, 
plu* check or money order for $3.95 
($4.50 In Canada I to: Dear Abby. Anger 
Booklet. P.D. Hot 447, Mount Morrta, 111. 
UI054-O447. (Portage U Included.)

fore marriage will still Ire with 
you after you marry. Marriage 
Is a way of living and you can't 
expert it to Ik- all sunshine and 
rose*, but given time. It can 
heroine a powerful hrallng 
agent. Good marriages take 
work.

Myth 4: Your spouse will 
make you whole.

People who believe this myth 
become dependent on their 
sjKMise In unhealthy ways. 
These couples rely on their 
spouse for continued siijijMirt, 
assurance and wholeness. 
Usually this Is roujilrd with 
low self-esteem and a sense of 
Inferiority that Is easily con­
trolled by their partner. These 
|K-oj)le are not Interested In 
nourishing a relationship lint 
In l>etng nourished by their 
sjKiuse. They la-lleve that sim­
ply by being marrlrd. they will 
Ik* whole.
If you vr ever held such fables 
lo Ik* true, dotit despair. Suc­
cessful marriages work p a ­
tiently to ( liallengr and (llsjirl 
these myths

Fighting the Good Fight Hr 
search shows dial how rouplrs 
handle disagreement* Is tar 
more Important to thr survival 
of a marriage than tielng in 
love Thrrr are four omens In

conflict that will sabotage at 
trrnpls to resolve things con 
strut-lively. Steer clear of th rsr 
to light the good fight.

Criticism. Criticism Involves 
attacking someone's personal 
tty rather than the behavior

Contempt. Contempt in 
vnlvcs Intentionally Insulting or 
psychologically abusing your 
spouse. It Is aimed right at thr 
heart and causes pain Name 
enlllng. hostile humor and 
mockery are examples of con 
tempt

Defensiveness. Defenslvrness 
follows contempt. If a partner 
feels victimized, thr natural 
Inclination Is to become drfen 
si ve.

Stonewalling. If verbal at 
tacks and contempt overwhelm 
a person, he or she eventually 
stops responding. Stonewalling 
conveys disapproval. Icy ills 
lance and smugness

By teaming lo fight fair, mar 
Gage can flourish.

Barbara Hughca la the Seminole 
C o u n ty  Extension Direlctor 
Inquiries may be directed lo her at 
the Cooperative Eitenalon 
Service . 250 W. County Home 
Road. Sanford. FI. 32773 or phone 
323-2500 Ext. 5556

P f p i s *
*
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Rock A n d  R oll 
M usic Fans!

r

r  n,r U-ROCK INN
Is h.itliitf .i minion purl) on 
Friday April 30 and 

Saturday May l, 1999*
Our ol Orlando's Lnorllr hands.

“ K ID  R ID L Y N ”
s ill  he here bolh nlglils.

So If >ou » ml In M» the I to# k gang U* our sjiring lime jiartt come on 
damn Hints Mprn.it H(x> I'M both otgliL and *r  jurt) until 2UU VM thrrr 
8 .1 s"l*i cmrr ,u*| plentt of frtrndh In hang sill) Ur arr Imalnl
In Mt.m»>ntr spring* »nr M<* k v>uth id ll*\ i n on Maitland Urnur m 
thr nr it-ni.i I lira I1ra*r rail nur message linr (111 KUmi for ■li1lilon.il 
ujMisning rvrnt*
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Sal unlay >lay I si
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•*- I 1*31 - .1 1*31
•••
••• Plain Sale Begins al 2) A3I

* Display of beautiful blooms from 
r.xliil tilors located in (.Vntral Honda. 

• Daylily plants for

SALE from $2 - $10 
W h ile  T h e y  L a s t !

Admission Free

«
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5 !*•.• Accredited Hy: The American Homewcallis Society 
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Tribe moves on
Pitching, consistent offense carry 
Seminole into 5A-5 baseball final

’R j f i W M l l -------------------------------------------------- f r g  m w  in the top of the seventh Inning, al-
CUt TOR — —  L^ J  m.  t l MAf VI Ml  VIMI ftn tko  ^   

White Sox 
finish up 
unbeaten 
in Ruth

SANFORD - The Noble* 
Communication White Sox 
wrapped up •  perfect sea­
son on Thursday as the 
Babe Ruth League wrapped 
up Its regular season in the 
City o f Hanford Recreation 
and Parks Department 
Babe Ruth Baseball League.

The White Sox scored two 
runs in each of the first 
three Innings and Loomis 
pitched a two-hitter aa the 
White Sox knocked o ff the 
arcond-best tram in the 
league, the Knights o f Co­
lumbus Expos. 7-1. to Im­
prove to 13-0. The Expos

The Babe Ruth and Bam­
bino Major league's have 
concluded their regular 
aeaaon and the City Cham­
pionship Series should be­
gin next week.

Seminole High School. 7:30 p.m.^ DAYTONA BEACH - The rains that washed out 
Wednesdays scheduled ■emrttwaU ^  it,. n , M  
5A-District 3 Baseball Tbunuunent at Daytona 
Beach Community College proved to be benefl- 

tt*  ^
With the rain out and a five-inning, blow out 

win oyer Mainland on Tuesday. Seminole High 
School coach Mike Powers  waa able to brtM  ace 
Brian Nielsen back to the mound for Thursdays 
match-up with Spruce Creek. 1

And the junior lefthander waa in fine form. 
*0<n*  •*** •Bowing one unearned
runon four hits before leaving with a 3-1 lead.

The rain on Wednesday proved to be the 
turning point so for.* said Powers. -Since Brian 
(Nielsen) only threw four inning on Tuesday and 
then with the rain, he could come back today 
and we could save Chax (Lytle) and Anarto 
(Fwracca) for Deltona." ^

Closer Jenmie Meyers came on to retire two 
men In a row with the tying run on second > «««  
and. after the Fighting Scrntnoles had scored

Oame 3 _  Lake Mary High School 3. Lyman High School I 
Game 4 _ Oviedo H.S. 7. Lake Brantley H.S. 0

n m u Y
Oame 5 .  a U M n O M M P  OM Ot Lake Mary High School 

Oviedo High School. 7 p.m.

Oame 1 _  Cocoa Beach H.S. fl, Bsystde High School S

Oame 2 .  Winter Springs 4. Melbourne-Central Catholic 0
VHDAT

Oame 3 _ Melbourne-Florida Air Academy vs. Cocoa Beach

Results: Nobles Commu­
nication White Sox 7. 
Knights of Columbus Expos 
1 •

Providing the offense 
were:

Nobles Communication 
White Sox: one hit B. 
Hutchins (triple. RBI). 
Loomis (double, two runs). 
Rraga. O. Hutchins (one 
run each). Hennlaon (two 
runs). Pearson (run). Bar­
nes (RBI).

Knights of Columbus Ex­
pos: one hit _ Cleo White 
(double, run). Brandon 
Bryant.

DrLand High School 3. Lake Brantley H.S. 1 
Lake Howell High School 13. Lyman High School 2 

THURSDAY
Oviedo High School 10. DeLand High School 0 

FRIDAY
Lake Howell H.S. vs. Lake Man H.S.. 4:30 p.m.

Standings _  Nobles 
Communication White Sox 
(13-0), Knights o f Colum­
bus Expos 18-6). Dean, 
"togws, Morgan and Law-

‘  - ^ y » * l e  vs- Mrlboume-Central Catholic. 4 p.m. 
Oame 2 _  Winter Springs H.S. vs. Cocoa Beach H.S.. 7 p.m 

SATURDAY
5  ®HAfiIMOIIiRIP OAMB: Oame 2 winner vs. Game

Standings _ American Di­
vision: Sanford Lodge #62 
Free A  Accepted Masons 
Yankees (10-2-1). Rinker 
Materials Devil Rays (6-7) 
and Sanford Electric Ath­
letics (3-11); National D ivi­
sion: Railroaders Cubs (12 ­
1-1). Rotary Breakfast Club 
Expos (6-9) and Sunnlland 
Corporation Martina (S-10).

Chaz L y «a  (Ml) waa 2-tor-2 w «h  a  doubla w id  acorad  
«  runs and Jarsmis Mayors (right) cam s on to sm ifl

Lions, Rams advance 
to 6A-3 baseball final

‘‘ Thank God no one was 
hurt." said Oviedo coach Kenne 
Brown after his top-seeded Li­
ons had eliminated Lake Bran­
tley 7-0. Th at was a lot closer 
than I ever wanted to be to a 
lightning bolt."

Earlier In the day. the No. 2- 
seeded Lake Mary Rams

Standings American 
Division: Royals (8-4), Red 
Sox (5-6). New Tribes M is­
sion Indians (2-9) and
Manners (1-10): National 
Division: Pirates (9-2). 
Devil Rays (9-3) and
Newsome Hardwoods Ath­
letics (6-6).

DeLAND - Win, lose, or draw, 
all the players, coaches, um­
pires. and fans In attendance a# 
the 6A-District 3 baseball tour­
nament semifinal between 
Oviedo and Lake Brantley at 
Conrad Park Thursday night 
can consider themselves lucky.

As Oviedo pitcher Paul Lu- 
brano delivered a 2-0, two-out 
pitch to Lake Brantley second 
baseman Kevin Melillo In the 
top of the fourth inning, a bolt 
of lightning spilt the sky. 
striking an AM radio tower less 
than a half mile away.

Within seconds, aa sparks 
fell from the tower, everyone 
scrambled for cover. While 
there was no more lighting In 
the Immediate area, the one bolt 
started a rain delay that lasted 
an hour and 40 minutes.

seeaeo uutc Mary Rams scram­
bled post the Lyman Grey­
hounds 3-1 to earn a berth In 
tonight's championship game. 
The contest is scheduled to 
start at 7 p.m.

"We've been playing close 
games all year long." said Lake 
Mary coach Allen Tuttle. *We’ve 
been fortunate enough to come 
out on top In most of them. We 
Just work hard and never give
up."

Chad LeOate's two-out double 
scored Brandon Haney In the 
bottom of the sixth Inning to

BAMBINO T-BALL
Schedule _ S a tu rd a y . 

May 1 at Lakeside Field. 
Sanford Campbcll-Losslng 
American Legion Post 53 
vs. Rich Plan. 8:30 a.m.; 
JTH Enterprises vs. Crown 
Trophy. 9:30 a.m.; Sun­
nlland Corporation va. 
Bovts Homes. 10:30 a.m.: 
Saturday, May 8 at Lake­
side Field. Boris Homes vs. 
Crown Trophy. 8:30 a.m.; 
Rich Plan vs. JTH Enter­
prises. 9:30 a.m.; Sanford 
Campbcll-Losslng American 
Legion Post 53 vs. Sun­
nlland Corporation. 10:30

Tony Corrao (right) and Paul Lubrano (abova) pitched 
D>k* Mary and Orisdo, raspsetfvety. Into tonight's 
Claaa SA-OMrlct 3 Baaabal Championship gams.

Oviedo rolls, awaits Nazarene 
II tops in 
Church 
hoops
M l —
sroRTSEnrroit

Schedule _ Saturday, 
May 1 at Lakeside Field, 
Network Electric Cubs va. 
Shutter Bugs Marlins. 
11:30 a.m.: Sanford Lodge 
•62 Free A Accepted Ma­
sons Cardinals vs. Play U 
Again Sports Diamond 
Backs. 1 p.m.: Sunnlland 
Corporation Red Sox vs. 
Decn. Fisher A Lawrence 
Royals. 2:30 p.m.; Satur­
day, May •  at Lakeside 
Field. Deen. Fisher A  Law­
rence Royals vs. Play It 
Again Sports Diamond 
Bucks. 11:30 a.m.; Shutter

upset Lake Brantley on Tuesday, had by 
plating eight runs in the bottom of the third

Seminole High School's Alumni Field as the 
first game was played, but the nightcap was 
washed out.

But unlike the 6A-3 tournament, the 5A-5 
will not be completed today.

Host Seminole and Spruce Creek, which 
have been rained out for two consecutive 
days, will attempt to get their game In at 4 
p.m. this afternoon.

The Deltona Wolves, which won the battle 
of Deltona by beating Pine Ridge 4-2 on 
Thursday, will take on the winner o f the 
Seminole-Spruce Creek contest for the dis­
trict championship at 3 p.m. on Saturday.

No Information was received bom the 
Class 3A-Dlstrict 13 Tournament that la 
being played at Winter Springs High 
School.

Oayslde was supposed to play Mel­
bourne-Central Catholic at 4 p.m. and the 
host Wolves were to face Cocoa Beach at 7 
p in. with the championship game set for 
this evening at 7 p.m.

Inning.
It was all Reeber after that, as she kept 

DeLand off the board to raise her record to 
7-5 on the season.

Reeber also had a big day at the plate 
going 2-for-3 with a triple and driving in 
three runs.

Also contributing to the Lions’ attack were 
Katie Field (2-for-3), Coates (double, two 
RBI) and Alison Parker and Nielson (one 
RBI each).

LAKE MARY - Senior Sarah Reeber hurled 
a two-hitter and also drove In three runs as 
the top-seeded Oviedo Lions moved Into the 
Championship Game of the Class 6A- 
District 3 Softball Tournament with a 10-0, 
ftve-lnnlng thumping of DeLand Thursday 
afternoon at Lake Mary High School.

Who the Lions (20-8) will face In the final 
Is still unknown as for the second straight 
day the scheduled semifinal between No. 2 
seed and defending State Champion i * i»» 
Mary and last-year’s district runner-up. 
Lake Howell, waa rained out.

If the weather permits, they will try to 
finish the tournament today with i-nh» Mary 
and Lake Howell playing at 4:30 p.m. and 
the winner returning to face Oviedo for the 
trophy at 7 p.m. at Lake Mary High School.

The Lions scored a pair of runs In the 
bottom of the first Inning and then dashed 
whatever hopes the Bulldogs (11-13), who

SANFORD - Sanford First 
Church of the Nazarene's 
Team No. 2 has taken over 
•ole possession o f first 
place In the City o f Sanford 
Recreation Department 
Spring Adult Church Bas­
ketball League.

Nazarene II Improved to 
5-0 by beating Hickory 
Fteaaa aaa Church. Fags IB

IN OTHER SOFTBALL PLAY:
Almost the same situation happened in 

the Class BA-District 5 Tournament at

: . .- — - -

P j  5 ) L '  i  «  ’ i  ; %  K * j>j
a v J  '" t v  r r  v. 5 a  1
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But In the third Inning, the Fighting Semlnolcs 
took the lend for good.

Lytle led off with a booming double to deep 
leftcentcr field and moved to third on a wild 
pitch before scoring on a sacrifice fiy by Mike 
Robinson.

Seminole got another run In the fourth Inning 
ns Anthony DIFonzo walked with one out and

scored on a two-out single by Paulo Silva.

With one out In the sixth Inning. Nielsen gave 
up back-to-back singles and Powers brought In 
Meyers. A  stolen base put the tying run* In 
scoring position, but Meyers got a strike out and 
a grounder to second to end the threat.

Lytle led off the Seminole seventh Inning with 
a single and stole two bases. With one out, Pe- 
tracca was walked Intentionally and stole sec*

IN BRIEF
SYFA-JEFF BLAKE FOOTBALL CAMP

SANFORD - The Sanford Youth Football As­
sociation (SYFA) will be registering for the 
First Annual Jeff Blake Football Camp over 
the next few weekends.

Locally, registration for the camp will be 
held at the "Just For Feet" at the Seminole 
Towtie Center Mall tn Sanford on May 1st 
from It n.m. to 3 p.m.

Sign-ups will also be held at several 
'CHAMPS Sporting Goods' locations (all times 
are from 10 a.m. to 5 p.m.):

• Saturday. May 1 at Orlando Fashion 
Square Moll.

• Saturday. May 8 at Oviedo Marketplace.
• Saturday, May 15 at Seminole Towne 

Center.

Registrations will also be held at the 'Just 
For Feet* on S.R. 436 tn Altamonte Springs 
on May 15 from 10 a.m. to 5 p.m.

The Football Camp, for boys and girls ages 
7*to*17, will be held May 32-23 at Semtnole 
High School with present and former NFL 
players, the Seminole High coaching stsIT and 
the SYFA coaching stafi providing Instruction.

Cost Is $90 for two days or $50 for one day.
All proceeds from the camp w ill go toward

y o u th  sp o rts  programs.
For Information, call (407) 330-9016.

SRD TENNIS LESSONS
SANFORD • The City of Sanford Recreation 

and Parks Department Is ofirrtng Tennis Les­
sons at Orovrvtew Park (olT Lake Mary Boule­
vard).

The lessons, taught by Greg James, costs 
$20 for each four-week session. Students 
must register at City Hall.

For more Information call 330-5697 or 
682 6086.

6A-3
C on tin u ed  f r o m  P a g *  I B

snap a 1-1 tie In favor of the 
Rams (23-6). Travis Slants fo l­
lowed with a single to plate 
LeGate.

Tony Corrao was the winning 
pitcher. Improving to 7-1. He 
allowed one run on seven hits, 
striking out two without Issuing 
a walk.

Slants was 3-for-3 with an 
RBI to lead Lake Mary. LeGate 
added a double, run. and an 
RBI. Haney and Matt Horwath 
each singled nnd scored a run. 
Jose Tormos had a single and 
on RBI. Jose Rosado and Matt 
Main each contributed a single.

Kevin Graves provided the 
sole run for the Greyhounds 
(10-20) with his first home run 
of the season In the second In­
ning. Hr also hit a single. Billy 
Hess and Joe Santllll each hit a 
double. Chase Rozell singled 
twice. Dave Milton also hit a 
single.

Lake Mary players, coaches, 
and fans had a pair o f scares of 
their own In their game with the 
Greyhounds.

In the top of the fourth In­
ning. Santllll lifted a fiy ball 
Into shallow left field. Horwath

(the Runs freshman shortstopl 
and Stoats (Lake Mary's left 
fielder) ran Into each other. 
Stoats was able to recover and 
throw out Santllll at third. Hor­
wath left the game, but was able 
to come back tn the bottom of 
the fifth.

LeGate also nearly suffered 
an injury when his cleats got 
caught tn the clay near first 
base running out a ground ball 
In the bottom of the fourth. He 
tumbled over the bag and came 
up holding his knee. Fortu­
nately. he was able to continue 
playing.

"That was scary," said Tuttle. 
"We came very close to losing a 
third of our starting lineup 
within a couple o f minutes."

After the nightcap resumed 
after the rain delay. Larry 
Grayson broke open a close 
game when he hit a bases- 
loaded double with two out tn 
the bottom of the fourth tnnlng. 
giving the Lions a 4-0 lead. He 
added a two-run single in the 
sixth tnnlng to Increase 
Oviedo's advantage to 6-0.

Lubrano tossed his eighth 
complete game and hts fifth 
shutout of the season as he Im­
proved hts personal record to

9-0. He gave up Just two hits • 
singles to Mellllo and John 
Miller - while striking out 10 
and walking two.

Providing the offense for 
Oviedo (25-4) were Grayson 
(double, single. five RBI): 
Kenny Starling (triple, run): 
Blaine Schulte (two singles, 
RBI): Justin Holmes and Brett 
Murphy (each with a single and 
two nins); Jered Goodwin 
(single, run): and Javte Abram 
(one run scored).

Lake Brantley finishes its 
season at 16-14.

c l a s A  4x-d i s t r i c t  a

l y m s *  T $
U fcaM aiy 001 003 ■ _ S O I

Williamson And SotnromtOr. Como 
and Sanford. W P_ C om o  I7-1L U>_ WU- 
lunwon (1 -4). Saw _  rune. 2U _ Lyman. 
Mesa and StuitiUl: Lake May. LeGate. X  
.  none. UK _ Lyman. O ram  III. Hrrurda 
.  Lyman 10-30. Lokr Mary 23 6.

LIONS 7. P A T R IO T S  O 
U k t  Sm atlsy OOO 000 0 0  3 4
O vM s  010  303 s .  7 S 1

Ikiylrr. Hoiriguex 18) and Klmcrr. Lu­
brano and Ahram. W P _  Lubrano (SOL I f  
.  Itoylcr 11-2) Save _ none. 2U _ Oviedo. 
Orayson. 31) .  Oviedo. Staring. IIH _ 
none. Krrovda _ Lake Brantley 16-14 
Ovtrdu 25-4 _______________________

Church-
C on tin u ed I B

Avenue
Church of God. 56-45. and Its 
ststrr squad, Nazarcne I, 56-
51.

First Baptist, which was tted 
with Nazarcne II. beat Church 
of God of Prophecy, 51-45, on 
April 9th. but then was 
pounded by New Covenant. 88- 
57. on April 23.

In the other game at Sanford 
Middle School’s Dan Pelham 
Gymnatorlum, on April 9. 
Providence Missionary Baptist 
Church o f Lake Monroe 51, 
Hickory Avenue Church of God 
50 and C.H.O.P. (Community 
House of Prayer) 55. Nazarene I 
29: on April 16. New Covenant 
72. Church of God of Prophecy 
57. and Providence Missionary 
Baptist 53, Nazarene 1 48: and 
on April 23. C.H.O.P. 55. 
Church o f God of Prophecy 51.

The standings after seven 
weeks axe: Nazarene Team *2 
(5-0). First Baptist and 
C.H.O.P. (both 4-1). New Cove­
nant (3-2). Providence Mission­
ary Baptist (2-3), Nazarene 
Team #1 and Hickory Avenue 
Church o f God (both 1-4) and 
Church o f God of Prophecy (0- 
5).

Tonight there will be rare 
quadniplcheader with Nazarene 
•2 battling First Baptist at 6:15 
p.m.: God of Prophecy playing 
Providence Missionary Baptist 
at 7:15 p.m.: New Covenant 
taking on C.H.O.P. at 8:15 
p.m.: and Nazarene #1 facing 
Hickory Avenue Church of God 
at 9:15 p.m.

~  A P R I L  9
P R O V ID E N C E  S I ,  

C H U R C H  O P  G O D  BO 
Hickory A v . Church  o f  Ood (SO)

Onxgr Ikikrr 4 0-0 8, Nuvmon Beverley
4 0-0 9 Derrick Cuipcr 6 0-0 13. Bryan 
tlrlLusi 5 5 9 IS. Lawrence Gurdun I 0-2 
2. Devon.) mingle 0 0-0 Q TotaU 20 5-11
SO.
Providence M iss ion ary  (01)

Cturlr* llayr-i 0 0-0 0. run Williams 2 
00  4 Eramtll Krill 3 15 a  Mario Alex­
ander S 2-4 13, Mann Klrlds 9 2 5 21. 
Ihnlar Krill 0 04} 0. Jay Anderson 2 12
5 Icuat-, 21 6 16 51.
Rnr Covenant (7 3 )

Halftime .  Chuirh uf Caxl 24. Provi­
dent* 20 Three-point Held goals „ 
Church l i  O d  5 lUrUaral 3. Beverley. 
Oaiprrt lYuvulrtue 3 IE. Krill. Alexan­
der. ITridsI Tram louts _ ( hurt h of God 
15. IVirvIdetur 10 Kixilrd out . Church of 
Oil. OelLuid Tn hidrals _ Church ol 
laid, ITinglr X rnnrklrnrr. liayrs X 
bench.

C .H .O .P  BS.
F IR S T  N A Z A R E N E  I 2 9  

1st Church o f  the Nazarene I (29)
M Xrtl-lry 33-4 II. S Ityals O 5H 5 J 

l*> ais 4 3 4 I L L  KiJnnsnn O 0 0 0. D I III] 
024  2. Totals 7 13 20 20

■amity Hot*## o f  P» ayo i  (BB)
Bernard Smith I 04) X  Ernest Willson 

2 04) 4  Lenny Nelms I OO X llayfus 
McCoy 5 04) IX Curb Scott I 2-2 4  An 
ItxtFluyd 10 1-222. Bernard Smith 3 00  
4  Johnathan Janes I 04) 2. Touts: 24 3- 
405.

ItsIfUmr „  C.1LO.P 55. Naxarrne I 19 
Three-point Arid cauls _ Naroicne I 2 
IHmJcy 21. C.ILO.P 4 (McCoy 2. 0. Smith. 
Iluyd). Tram kails _ Naroicne I ft 
CHO P. IX Fouled oul _ Naxarrne L J 
Kyols Tnhnk-ols _ C.ILO.P.. Janes.

F IR S T  B A P T I S T  S I ,
OOD O P  P R O P H E C Y  4 S  

Church o f  O of o f  P ro p k o oy  (48 )
1L Daniels 2 2 3 6. L  Sands 2 OO 4  H 

Porters 1-1 IS. W. Anderson 3 4-S II. M. 
Jbe2 0-2 4.J. PUaeU 1 0 0 2 . Totals: 18 7- 
1145
1st flautist o f  floo ft ir fl t f l l )

Kk key Anderson 5 2 0 12. David TlndaU 
6 I -3 13. Jeremy Slllawuy 4 OO H. C  No­
lan I 04) 2. Denny Clayton 4 OO 11. Tom 
Kelly 0 OO a  14b FusseUus 2 1-2 5  J  
IVrrpfcs 0 04) 0. Totals: 22 4-11 51.

Halftime _ Prophecy 25. 1st BapUsi 19 
Three-point Arid fools _  Prophecy 2 
(Outer. Andrrsonl; 1st Daptlsl 3 1C lay ton 
3- Tram kails _ Prophecy ft 1st Baptist 
It. Fouled out _ none. Technicals _

APRIL 16 
NEW COVENANT 72,

OOD OP PROPHECY B7 
Church o f  Ood o f  n  oohsr y  (B7)

Harold Daniels 3 3 4  0  H J *  I OO X 
It Parker 7 OO 17. P. Jordan 3 0 - 15  
Shannon Powell 4 3-3 12. Willie Andnsat
1 002. Mike Monts 3 l-S 7. Totals: 22 7- 
1357.
Now Covenant (7 2 )

Charles Edwards 5 04) 12. Tony Dans S 
1-2 11, Marcus Williams I OO 2. Kenneth 
Mllehrll 3 0-16, James Sander 2 OO 4 
Andrr Collar 7 2-2 IS. Ktrh Kk* 8 2 3 19 
ToUh: 31 58  72.

Hatfllnie _ New Covenant 34. Prophcry 
25 Three-point Held goals _ Propliery 8 
D’arkrr X Jordan X IVmrell): New Cove­
nant 5 [Edwards X Collier X Hire). Team 
bub _ Propliery T. New Covmanl 14 
Fouled out _ none. Tcchnlrals _ Proph­
ecy. Morris.

N A 2 A N R E N E  I I  8 0 , 
C H U R C H  O P  O O D  4 S  

1st Church o f  tha N u a n n i  I I  (50)
Hrnil Wade 4 6H 14. Dale Whitman 2 

OO 4 Sean Whitman 3 46  10. Mike 
Krmlcy 1 2-2 5  Danny Watson 4 OO 5 
Timmy Watson 2 0-0 4. Sieve Wasula OO- 
0 0. John (kils 0 OO 0. Chad Wtuiman 5 
OO 11. Totals: 21 12 16 56 
Hickory Av. Church o f  Ood (48) 

Vwce Butler 2 12 5. Norman Beverly 3 
1-2 7. Lawrrnre Gordon 4 OO 5  George 
Baker 3 1-2 7. Bryan GHJand 2 2-2 H. Dcr- 
rtk Cooper 3 02  B. Davarki Pringle 0 OO 
0. Km Moll I OO 2 Totals 18 5-10 46.

llaUumc_ Church ul Cod 31. Naxarrne 
II30. Three putiil held goals .  Naxarrne I
2 IKmtiey. C. WhUnkud. Church of God 4 
ICeliand 2. Cooper 21 Team fouls _ Naxa- 
retie II 16: Churrh of God 12 Fouled oul _ 
none. Tcchnlrals _ none Kectirds _ 
Churrh of Gul 1-4

PROVIDENCE 83, 
NAZARENE I 48

(overtime)
l i t  Church o f  th a  Nuaurtna I (48)

Lyle Robinson 0 04) 0. Slercn Kyols I 
0-4 X Srntl Johnson 6 I-I IX Brian 
Howard 5 3 7 15 Jerrsl Kysls I OO X

Brandon Klnnell 7 2-8 16 Totals: 20 0-18 
45
Provides*# Mlsalouary (83)

Emmctl Kelli 7 0 0  17. Morin Fields 4 I- 
2 ft Mart) Alexander S 3-4 IX Kevin Fel­
ton 0 OO ft Tim Williams I 2-4 4  John 
Anderson 0 OO ft Charles Hayes 4 2-4 
10 TiSahr 21 8-14 53.

Halftime _ 25-25 Regulation _ 48-45. 
three point Held goal* _ Naxarrne I 2 
llkiwanl 2L Provldenec 3 IKetll 3L Team 
fouls .  Naxarrne I IX  Ptmrldrnra 15 
Fouled out _ Noxarcne I. IbwanL Techni­
cals .  none. Records _ IW Idrnrr 2-3.

APRIL 23
C.H.O.P. BB,

_ .  (8 1 ) 
Harold Daniels I 04) 2. Willie Anderson 

I 7-9ft Brian Parker 6 O-l 15 Marvin Joe 
OOO ft Shannon IVrwcU 0 OO ft Undrea 
Mllehrll 9 I S 19. Timmy PosteU 0 OO ft 
Itullip Jordan 2 04) 4. Quentin Herring I 
002. Kevin Ante 0 0-0 O Totak: 20 8-15 
SI.
Cam s unity Hanna o f Prayer (BB)

Johnathan Jones 3  1-4 7. Jerome Wil­
liams 4 2-2 It. Dayfus McCoy 10 2-2 25 
Ernest Watson I 0-0 X  Curt Scott 0 OO 
0. Toby Nelms 0 04) 0. Bernard Smith 4 0- 
0 10. Henry Brown 0  0-0 ft Lenny Nrlma 
0 OO ft Totals: 23 5-8 55 

Halftime _ Cod o f Prophecy 28. C HO P. 
25 Thrte-pmnl field goal* _ Oaf of Proph­
ecy 3 [Pucker X  C.ILO.P. 6 (McCoy X 
Smith X Williams], Team fouls _ Cod of 
Prophcry II; C.ILO.P. IX Fouled out _ 
C.H.O.P.. Jones. Technicals, none. Rec­
ords .  God of Prophecy 0-5 C.H.O.P. 4-1.

B7
1st BapUM a f  B u fo r d  (87 )

DowtdTTndall I I  2-4 25. Chad Nolan 2 0- 
0 4. Jeremy Stllaway 3 OO ft Ifobfa 
Fussdlus 3 I -3 7, Toro KrOy 3 7-12 15 To­
tals: 22 10-19 57. 
flaw Covenant (8 8 )

Marcus Williams O OO a  James Sand­
ers 4 0-1 ft Mike Lockhart 6 OO IX 
Charles Edwards 3 0-0 7. Titus Joshua 8 
OO 17. Tony Davis 4 OO ft Andre Collier 
II 4 6 2ft Richard Klrr 3 1-2 7. Totals: 30 
598ft

Halftime .  New Covenant 3ft 1st Bap­
tist 23. Three-point Itcld goals _ 1st Bap­
tist 3 (Kelly X Tindall): New Covenant 5 
(Cutlkr X Lockhart. Edwards, Joshua). 
Team knits _ 1st Baptist 7; New Covenant 
15 Ftailed out _ none. Technicals _ New 
Covmanl. Hire. Ret ends _ 1st Baptist 4- 
1; New Covenant 2-2.

N A Z A R E N E  H 8 6 , 
N A Z A R E N E  I 8 1  

1st Church o f  th a  N u a roa a  I  (81)
llrtm Howard 50-2 IX  Jarred Ryots 12- 

** 4, Lyle Robinson O 04} a  Ilrandun Kin- 
nrlt 9 1-2 22. Dennis Reynolds 2 OO 4 
Scotl Johnson 4 0-2 H. Steve Kyols 0 OO 
ft Totals: 21 3-8 SI.
1st Church e f  th a  N uarana H (50)

Mike Itemlry I DO 2. Chad Whitman 2 
00  4. Steve Wasula 4 0-18. Jon Oakes 3 
OO 7. Scan Whitman 2 0-0 5  Dale 
Whitman 1 5 6  7. S to ll Wade 4 2-2 10 
Tim Watson 3 0 0 6. Danny Watson 3 1-1 
7. lotah: 23 K-10 56.

Halftime _ Naxarrne II 30. Naxarrne I 17. 
Three-point Odd goals .  Naxarrne I 6 
(Howard X Klnnell 3F. Naxarrne 0 2 
(Oakes, ft Wliilman). Team folds _ Naxa- 
rme I II: N.ixarrne U IX Fouled oul 
nunc Trrhnlrals _ nunr. Itrrurds ~ 
Naxarrne I I -4: N.ixarrne II 50.

ond. The Tribe then got a run as both Jacob 
Davis and Ha) Kronenberg were bolh hit by 
pitches.

Plnch-hlttrr Shawn Lcfiwich then got home a 
run with a ground out and DIFonzo closed the 
Seminote scoring with a two-nin double.

An error on a potential double play ball and a 
two-out single by Deatefano gave the Hawks their 
final run in the bottom half of the sevrnth In­
ning.

Nielsen struck out four, walked one and hit 
one baiter to raise his record to 8-2, while Mey­
ers got the save.

Providing the offense for Seminole were Pe- 
Imcca (3-lor-3 with a double, run. two stolen 
bases. RBI), Lytle (2-for-2 with a double, two 
runs, three stolen bases). DIFonzo (2-for-3 with 
a double, run. two RBI), Sltvs U-for-4, RBI). Ro­
binson, Kronenberg and Lefiwlch (one RBI each) 
and Montalvo, W ill Trtiutman and Andrew Lisl 
(one run scored each).

n u U n s o  u k m i m o l e b  7. h a w k i  a
101 1004. 7 8 3 

I croak 0 10  000 1 _ a B 9
NUtam. Meyers (61 tuid Duels. DestrCxnn. HnlHs (5| and Den­

nison. WP .  N id sen IS-2). LP .  Deslrfano Save .  Meyer*. 211 .

Semtnole. Lytle. IVtrurra. IMFonau. 311. none. IIK .  none. Rec­
ord* _ Seminole 23-7.

m OTHER BASEBALL ACTION:
WINTER SPRINGS - For the second straight 

day the scheduled game between top-seeded 
Melbounre-Florlda Air Academy and Cocoa 
Beach In the Class aA-Dlstrtct 13 Baseball 
Tournament at Winter Springs High School was 
rained oul.

They will attempt lo get the gome In again to­
day starting at 4:30 p.m.

The winner o f tonight's game will meet host 
Winter Springs, a 4-0 winner over Melbourne- 
Central Catholic on Wednesday. In the Champi­
onship Game on Saturday at 7 p.m.

Admission, as set by the Florida High School 
Activities Association, Is $4 lor nil district 
games.

Ugal Notlct
M  TNI 

COURTM AND 
N H M U

l-M-H-F 
COUNTRY W1O0 HO M l 
LOANS. INC., a Now Vort 
Corporation l/Va 
COUNTRTWIOi FUNOtNO 
CORPORATION.

MCHAROW PARI 
S M II-M -M N ), 
0UN4F PAM 
|44tUNKMOWM). 
UNKNOWN T1NANT I. 
UNKNOWN TIRANT II;

MOOCH VILLAQ(

ASSOCIATION, INC .
Mid any unknown hair*.

creditors and other

unknown vpouaet claiming 
by. through end undoe 
Mty ol tho abovo-namod 
Oelrndsnta.

Oo fondant*
N o n e io F  

F0N I6L0W N I SALS
NOTICE ia hfrtby givan that 

the undaraignod Cloth of tha 
Circuit Court . ol

day of MAT. 1*49, al ,11 00 
o’clock AM. al'tho Wait front 
door of tho (ofninolk County 
Courthouse In (anford. Florida, 
oriot for calo and aott at pubttc 
outcry to tho highoat and boat 
bidder for each, tho fotlowmg- 
dcccrtbod proporty aituaf# in 
•aminola County. Florida 
CONDOMINIUM UNIT NO 1t« 

of Building IB of HIDDEN VIL­
LAGE CONDOMINIUM. o 
Condominium, according to tho 
Dado ration of Condominium, 
tharaol. and athibila tharato. 
recorded tho 12nd day of 
Worth. IN ) ,  in Official Rocorda 
Book a 1(34, pago t i l l  through 
triT. ol tha Public Rocorda of 
■emtaoto County. Florida, and 
aa amended by the following 
Amend muni* Official Record* 
Booka 143ft page tM I. Official 
he card* Book* 1438. pago 
l i t ] .  Official Record* (look* 
1141. pago 2001. Official 
Rocorda Book 1444. paga 1313, 
Official Rocorda Book 1414. 
paga 1444. Official Rocorda 
Book 1707. paga 1024. Official 
Rocorda Book 1731. paga 1320. 
Official Rocorda Book 1743. 
pago 1000, Official Rocorda 
Book 1740. page 1041. Official 
Record. Book 1744. pege 444. 
Official rocorda Book 1442. 
pag* 004 and Official Record* 
Book 1474, paga 1448 together 
with all appurtananca* tharato. 
Including an undivided inleret! 
In the common elemonl* ol *eid 
Condominium ae Oat forth in 
*aid Declaration thereof 
purauant to tho Final Judgment 
enlared in e cate pending in 
•aid Court, tho ttyla af which ia 
hndkal*d abovt 
WITNESS my hand and official 

te*i of *aid Court iht* 14th day 
ol April. 1004

If you aro a parton with o dra- 
ability who naad* any accom­
modation in ordar to participate 
in this proceeding, you are anti- 
H*d. at no coat lo you. to tho 
provision of certain aaaiatanca. 
Pleats contact Court admmia- 
tralor. 301 N. Park Avenue, 
tulle N301. tanford. Florida 
M77L (407) 323-4330 ail. 
4T27. within 2 working day* of 
your receipt of this nolice ol 
foreclosure sale; if you aro 
hearing impaired, eall 1-400- 
441-4771; If you aro voice 
impaired, call t-400-444-4770 
(COURT SEAL)
Maryanns Mora#
CLERK OF THE 
CIRCUIT COURT 
By: Dorolhy W. Boil on 
Deputy Clerk

ATTORNEY FOR PLAINTIFF 
tcott 0 Bit hop 
Duller 4 Hooch. P.A.
1144 4. Conway Rd . t ie  4 
Orlando. Florida 324t2 
(407) 341-4200 
B4HSt>3274

Publish April 23, 30. 1444 
0CB-2I a

IS TNS CIRCUIT 
eOURT IN AND PON 
•IM INOLI COUNTY, 

FLORIDA
CASK NO. ■■-20SS-CA-14-S
MERCANTILE BANK. N A , 
successor by merger with 
Rootevelt Bank. N A.,

Ptainlilf.
vt.
KATHLEEN L. BAKER 
(49tUNKNOWN).
FIRST INDIANA BANK. 
SEMINOLE COUNTY.
FLORIDA, a political 
•ubdlvition ol tho Slate 
ol Florida, and any 
unknown hairs,

Ltqal Nolle—
devisees, grintsee. 
creditors, and other 
unknown persons or

by, through end under 
any el the above named 
Deltodenls,

Defendants

NOTICE la hereby given that 
the undersigned Clerk of tho 
Circuit Court of Sominolo 
County. Fie ride. vriN on the Mlh 
diy •> MAY. 1*44. at 11.00 
o'clock AM. el the Wee) front 
doer of the Oemfnole County 
Courthouse In ■snford. Florida.
offer for tale and self al pubbe 
outcry to the highoat and boat 
bidder for each, the toNowmg- 
dsccnbed property situate in 
tenenole County. Florida 

Let tO and west • 44 lost of 
Lot II.  Block II. IAN LAN OO 
THi SUBURB BEAUTIFUL 
PALM IPRINOI SECTION, 
according to the plat thereof aa 
recorded tn Plat Book 3, Pago 
ttw i. Public Records of 
tenenole County. Ffortdo 
pursuant to the Final Judgment 
entered «  a cate pending tn 
sard Court, tho stylo ol which t* 
indicated above.
WITNESS my hand and ofhefol 

spat af **Id Court this 24th day 
otApril t i l l
It you are a person with a dis 

ability who needs any accom­
modation in ordet lo perlrctpofe 
m this proceeding, you ore enti­
tled. it no cost to you. lo tho 
provision ol csrtsin assistance 
Ptsete contact Court admtnis- 
tutor. 301 N Path Avenue, 
(till* N301, tanford. Florida 
32TTI. (40 T) 323-4330 oaf 
4227, within 1 working days ol 
your receipt ot this notice ol 
toreclosute tele: il you are 
hearing impaired, cell 1-000- 
•44-4771. il you are voice 
impaired, call 1-400-444-4770 
(COURT S(AL)

Mxryenne Morse 
CLIRK OF THC 
CIRCUIT COURT 
By Dorothy W Bolton 
Deputy Clerk

ATT0RN4Y FOR PLAINTIFF 
Nancy A Bishop 
Butler 4 Hatch, PA 
3114 4 Conway Rd . Sis. ■ 
Orlando. Florid* 32112 
(407) 311-4200 
MH4I41I2I

Publish April 30. and May 7,
m o
DEB-207

NOTICE
TO THI PUU.M

Nolice it hereby given the! a 
Public Hearing will bo held by 
the Planning 4 Zoning 
Commission In tho City 
Commission Chamber*. City 
Halt. 4*ntord. Florida at 7.00 
pm on Thursday. May 0. 1444, 
lo consider tha following 
change end amendment to tha 
Zoning Ordinance of the City ot 
Sanford. Ivminoto County, 
Florida

Rexoning from A-L Ivmmole 
County

To that of PD. Planned devvl-

Ufltl NotlC«>
-UN0LAIM40 

VtHfOLI AUCTION* 
4/14/44

44 HONDA
JHMAD4321EC0M342 

44 HONDA
2HaiD434XKHf44244 

13 LINCOLN
1 MR BP4IF4P V4I4H4 

4/24/44
IT CADILLAC

)08CDllltH4344114 
44 CHEVROLET

101AW41R4J4234042 
Tl CHEVROLET

CaTltlU1tT030 
*3 CHEVROLET

J31RF2343P744O04T
34 DO DOE

tB30D3tCSF(lt 13441 
11 DATIUN

JN4MD04I4CWI04141
42 DATBUN 

JNI HBt 4I4CU014124
43 DATIUN 

JNIH204ltDXS41343
•7 OL04M0BILE

103AJ1IWOMD3022I7
44 PONTIAC 

102AR44A4EB23444 7
74 PONTIAC

IJ3TW4 At 31443 
ALTAMONTI TOWINO 117 

MARKER IT ALT IP04 SALE 
;aiNi AT 10 00 AM VIEW 1 

HOUR PRIOR 
Publish April 30. INS 
MB-214 _______________ _

PtCTTTIOUl KAMI
Notice it hereby gnron that I 

am engaged in butinetv at 2413 
Iroquois Ave. lanford, FL 
12773, Seminole County. 
Florida, under the Fictitious 
Heme ol NO PNOH M PEST 
eORTNOL. and that I inland to 
register said name with tha 
Division ol Corporations. 
TalUhaste*. Florida, m accor­
dance with the provisions ot I he 
FtcliHoue Name Statutoa. To- 
Wit lection 444 04. Florida 
Statutes IN I

Publish April 30. IN*
MB-iat

LIOAL OCtCfUPTlOH The 8 
440 of Lot *4 (LESS tho E 14' 
tor Rd and LESS ROW lor Slate 
Road 41 on I). Fie Lend A 
Coloninlion Company. Lid., W. 
Besrdall's Mtp ot St. Joseph’s, 
tt recorded In Plat Book 1, 
Page 114. Public Records ol 
tvmino s County. Florida

Tho Planning 4 Zoning 
Commisaion wilt submit a rec­
ommendation lo tho City 
Commission in Isvor ol. or 
against the requested change 
or amendment Tha City 
Commisifon will hold a Public 
Hearing In the Commission 
Room in City Hall. Sanford, 
Florida at 7.00 p m. on May 24. 
IMS. to consider aaid recom­
mendation
Alt parties In Interest and eld- 

i#n» shall have an opportunity 
to be heard al said hearings 
James R Vslerino. Chairman 
Planning 4 Zoning Commiaeion

ADVICE TO THE PUBLIC It a 
person decldst to appeal a 
decision mad* with respect to 
any matter considered al the 
above meeting or hearings, 
hs/the made need a verbatim 
record ol the proceeding*, 
including the testimony end 
evidence which record is not 
provided by the City of Sanford 
(FS 2410103)

PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES 
NEEDlhO ASSISTANCE TO 
PARTICIPATE IN ANY OF THESE 
PROCEEDINGS SHOULD CON­
TACT THE PERSONNEL OFFICE 
ADA COORDINATOR AT 330- 
4424 44 HOURS IN AOVANCE 
Of THE MEETING 
Publish April 21. 30. ION 
DEB-190

TO T M  PUBLIC
Molw* to hereby »v*n  that a 

Public Hearing «nS be held by 
the Planning 4 Zoning 
Commotion In the City 
Commission Chamber*. City 
HaH. tanford. Florida at TOO 
pm on Tltuvaday, May 4. 19H. 
to consider the following 
change and amendment to the 
Zoning Ordinance af Ih* City el 
Sanford, tenunefo County.

R*toning from PD. Planned 
nretopment
4a toat of RC-t, Reetncled

LIOAL DESCRIPTION Lots 22 
* 21. Ctk 10. Draamwotd. at 
retarded in I he PuMk  Records 
of Sen*not* County. FL tn Piet 
Book 4. Page N  
The property being more gen­

erally detenu J ax 1024 W 
241b Street

The Planning 4 Zoning 
Commtstion wtN submit a rec­
ommendation to tho City 
Conuntation In favor of. or

Tho City 
Commiveroo writ hold a Pubfcc 
Hearing in the Commisaion 
Room in City Hall. Sanford. 
Florida at T 04 p m on May 14. 
tSM, to con*idar le d  recom­
mendation

AN parti** in tntarett and cut- 
tens shell have an opportunity 
to be heard at said hearing* 
Jam** R Valenno. Chairman 
Pfenning 4 Zoning Commtvston 

ADVICE TO THI PUBLIC It * 
person decides fo appeal • 
decision mad# with re* pec I lo 
any matter considered el the 
above meeting or hearings, 
he/she mod* need a verbatim 
record at the proceedings 
including the testimony and 
evidence which record •* not 
provided by the City of Sanford 
(FS 2SS 01041

PERSON! WITH DISABILITII4 
NEEDING ASSISTANCE TO 
PARTICIPATE IN ANY OF THSII 
PROCEEDINGS SHOULD CON 
TACT THI PIRSONNEL OFFICt 
AOA COORDINATOR AT 330- 
4*24 44 HOUR! IN ADVANCK 
OF THE MEETING 
Publish April 21. 30. ION
J U J ll------------------

M M  ESTATE OF 
LOIS A LESUE

LOIS A LESUE deceased FSs 
Murkier 90-244-CP is pendng *i 
trie Circuit Court tor lensnoi* 
County Florida. Probate Otwon. 
MeadifeeseofwtSchPPO Drawer 
C. Sanford. Fkmi* 32771 Th# 
names and tddrvtses of trie par

•vt forth below 
ALL INTERESTED PERSON! ARS 
NOTIFIED THAT

it served who have otyeciiont 
chsAvng* the vshdity of Ih* wd, #i* 
tywMicatlont of Pi* personal repn- 
sentelrve. venue, or (unsdtcbon of 
4us Court aro rvqmd fo 14* gw* 
cbfvclfona with Pin Court WITHIN 
THE LATER OF THREE MONTHS 
AFTER THE OATS OF THC FIRST 
PUBUCATION OF THIS NOTICE OR 
THIRTY DAYS AFTER THI DATE 
OF SERVICE OF A COPY OF THIS 
NOTICE ON THEM 

AS crwllora of the dveedent and 
other person* htmg claims or 
demand* (gaunt dacvdvnl** 
estate on whom a copy ol list 
notice It served withm Suva 
months alter the dale ol the hrst 
pubteabon of this notice mutt lit* 
their claims with this Court 
WITHIN THE LATER OF THREE 
MONTHS AFTER THE OATE OF 
THC FIRST PUBUCATION OF 
THIS NOTICE OR THIRTY DAYS 
AFTER THE DATE OF SERVICE 
OF A COPY OF THIS NOTICE 
ON THEM
All other creditors of the dece­

dent and parsons having claim* 
or demand* sgaintl Ihv deca­
dent's estate must file thsir 
claims with this court WITHIN 
THREE MONTHS AFTER THE 
DATE OF THE FIRST PUOUCA- 
TION OF THIS NOTICE
ALL CLAIMS, DEMANDS AND 

OBJECTIONS HOT SO FILED 
WILL BE FOREVER BARRED 

The dal* ol ths first publica­
tion ol this Notice i* April 23. 
t«99

Personal Representative 
VIRGINIA HAMILTON 

WILLIAM H MORRISON. 
ESQUIRE
Florida Bar No 143303 
7100 South U S Highway 17-92 
Fern Park. Florid* 32730 
Telephone 4 0 7/434-1424 
Allorn*/ lor Personal 
Representative 
Publish April 23. 30. 1094 
DEB- 234

Looal Notlcet
IN T M  OMOUtT OOMT 
O f T M  4BTN JWB4CIA4. 
ONMilfT, M A « f l  POR

GENERAL
JURISOfOnOtt fltWSION 

CAM  not 44-44#S-0A-14-f 
NORWIST MORTOAOI,
ItiC

PLAINTIFF 
Vt..
IVAN SANTIAGO 
If LIV1NO. AND IF DEAD.
THE UNKNOWN SPOUSE. 
HEIM. DCVIIIIS,
ORANTEEI. ASSIGNEES 
UENORS. CREDITORS. 
TRUSTEES AND ALL OTHER 
PAR Til 4 CLAIMING AN 
INTEREST NT, THROUGH, 
UNDER OR AGAINST 
IVAN SANTIAGO;
TERESA SANTIAGO 
IF UVINO. AND IF DEAD.
TMI UNKNOWN IPOUS1. 
HEIM. DEVISEES. ORANTEEI. 
ASSIGNEES. LIENOR*. 
CREDITORS, TRUSTEES 
ANO ALL OTHER PANT1IS 
CLAIMING AN INTI NUT BY. 
THROUGH. UNDER ON 
AGAINST TERESA SAMTIA00. 
CARILLON COMMUNITY 
RESIDENTIAL ASSOCIATION. 
INC ; JOHN DOE ANO JAM 
DOB AS UNKNOWN TENANTS 
IN POSSESSION

NBTWN NP

NOTICE IS HEREBY OIVIN
pursuant to a lumen*ry Fkiei 
Judgment ef foreclosure dated 
April I f .  1444 entered In CM 
Case Ne 44-0M3-CA-14-1 ef 
the Circuit Court ol Ih* IITM 
Judicial Circuit In and for HIM- 
NOLI County SANFORD. 
Flond*. I wd ted le th# foghetl 
and best fodder lor cash WIST 
FRONT DOOR ef the SIMINOli 
County Courthouse located at 
301 N PARK AVI to 4ANF0N0. 
Florida. *1 It 00 a tn. an Ih* 
14th day at MAT. 1PM Ih* fol­
low mg described property a* 
set forth to aaid Summary Final

LOT 1ST. TRACT 301 AT CARIL­
LON. ACCORDING TO THE 
PLAT RECORDED IN PLAT 
BOOK 44. PAGE 31 THROUGH 
3T. INCLUSIVE. AS R4COND4D 
IN THE PUBLIC RECORD! OP 
SIMINOLI COUNTY. FLORIDA 
Oatod Iht* 11th day ef April.

(CIRCUIT COURT SSAL) 
MARYAhNE MORSE. CLERK 
Clark ol toe Circuit Court 
By Dorothy W Bolton 
Deputy Clerk 

THC LAW OFFICES OF 
DAVID J STIRN. PA 
ATTORNEY FOR PLAINTIFF 
M l •  University Drive 
Suite 400
Plantation FL 33314 
(444) 233-4000 
4F-29347INCU

In accordance with the 
American with DiaatohM* Act. 
persons with dwefoktiee need­
ing e special accommodation to 
participate m tow proceeding 
should contact the Clerk ef the 
Circuit Court si the IIM 1NOLE 
County Courthouse ef 44F-313- 
4330, net later than seven day* 
prior la toe proceeding It hear­
ing impaired, t -*00-914-1771 
(TOO) or t-400-444-0770. eta 
Florid# Relay Service
Pubiteh. Apr# 21. M. 1444 
0FN-2II

IN TNS etNGUfT «#VNT
OP T M  14TH JUDICIAL 
CIRCUIT, IN ANO FOR 
SSMINOLS COUNTY,

•4N4RAL
JURISDICTION MV IS ION 

C A M  NOt 4C-44TS-CA14 N
OMAC MORTOAOI 
CORPORATION

PLAINTIFF 
V4
FIOCL OCLION,
IF LIVING, ANO IF DEAD.
THI UNKNOWN 4POUII.
HEIRS. D lVIttlS.
GRANTEE*. AtllONECI. 
UENORS. CRIDITORS. 
TRUSTEES AND ALL OTHER 
PARTIES CLAIMING AN 
INTERI4T NY. THROUGH 
UNDER CR AGAINST 
FIOCL DELEON. ROSA 
DELEON.IF UVINO.
ANO IF OEAO. THC 
UNKNOWN SPOUSE. HEIRS. 
DCVISIES. OR AN T i l l .  
A44IQNCI4. LIENORS, 
CREOITORS. TRUSTEE*
AND ALL OTHER PARTIES 
CLAIMING AN INTEREST BY. 
THROUGH.UNOIR OR 
AGAINST ROSA D4LE0N. 
FIRSTPLUS FINANCIAL. INC . 
JOHN DOE AND JANE DOE 
AS UNKNOWN TENANT!
IN POSSESSION

U O T fc O T 0" ™
FORECLOSURE SALS

NOTICE 19 HEREBY GIVEN 
pursuant lo a Summery Final 
Judgment ol foreclosure dated 
April 23. 1*44, entered in Civil 
Case No 44-2474 CAM B ol the 
Circuit Court of the 14TH 
Judicial Circuit in and for IIM I- 
NOLE County, lanford. Florida,
I will sell to Ih* higheil and 
best bidder lor cash the West 
Front Duar ol Ihe tamlnolo 
County Courthouse focatsd at 
301 N Park Avsnu* in Sanford. 
Florida, al 1100 am on the 
2Slh day of MAY. 1004 Ih* fol­
lowing described property aa 
aat fortn in said Summary Final 
Judgment, lo-wit 

LOT 41. KING8BRI00I CAST 
VILLAGE UNIT I. ACCORDING 
TO THE PLAT RCCOAOEO IN 
PLAT BOOK 44. PAOCt 41 
THROUGH 47. 1NCLU4IV1. AS 
RECORDED IN THI PUBLIC 
RECORDS OF SEMINOLE 
COUNTY. FLORIDA 
Dated (hit 21th day ol April. 
1449
(CIRCUIT COURT SEAL) 

MARYANNE MORSE 
Clerk of Ihe Circuit Court 
By Dorolhy W Bolton 
Deputy Clark 

THE LAW OFFICES OF 
DAVID J STERN. P A 
ATTORNEY FOR PLAINTIFF 
SOI S University Drive 
Suit* 400
Plantation. FL 33324 
(044) 233-4000 
M-32224(FNMA)GMA

In accordance with Ih* 
American with Oitafollliaa Act, 
persona with disabilities need­
ing a special accommodation to 
perticip*:* in this proceeding 
should contact Ih* Clark ot tha 
Circuit Court *t Ih* SEMINOLE 
County Courthouse at 407-323- 
4330. not later than savan days 
prior to tha proceeding II hear­
ing impaired, t-tOO-414-4771 
(TOO) or 1-40O-954-4TT0, vie 
Florida Relay Sarvic*
Publish April 30. and May 7. 
I MO 
0EB-2I2
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MOmOAO. C O M P A Q , ,

va.
MIC HMD NALL 
W LIVING. AMO IF OIAO.
w i  unknown if o u n ,
HUM . D M H M ,

IN I.
IClRCUiT COUNT M M ) 

MARYANN! N O N tl 
Clara at th# Circuit Court 
for. OorelAy W lotion 
Deputy CtorA 

TNI LAW OFFICES OF 
OAVIO J .  STIRk. F A  
ATTORNEY FON PLAINTIFF 
Ml >. University Drive 
(ulto MO
Ftontotlon. FL 33314
|W4| 2234000 
M-»30(«FM|NAT

In accordance wild th* 
Amanaan with OtsabrlMio* Act 
person* with disabilities need- 
M  a special accommodation lo 
participate In tfita proceeding 
should contact the Clara at tha 
Orcull Court at tha UMtNOLI 
County Courthowao at 407-333-

^M FE N O AH TlB )
■am i va

NOTICI IS H IM IV  OIVSN 
purauant to a Summary Final 
JudfIMfll dst#4
Apr.I S3. ISN. antarad M Chnl 
Caaa No M  NST CA 14 S ol 
Nio Circuit Court ol tha tSTM 
Judicial Circuit In and lar SSM* 
NOLI County SANFONO.

and heat btddar lor each 
W IST FNONT DOOM OF COUR- 
TMOUSI ol tha SlUtNOLI

NOLI County. SANFONO. 
Florida. I wM tad lo tha highest 
and boat btddar tar each W IST 
FNONT OOON OF COUNT* 
MOUSI ol Mo SSMNOLI

! £ , * » « «  
•  407-772-3373 or 
I lor mere nlo

17-41 Sanlord. FL 
Sami no la County,

under tha Fktitiou, 
u m  IA N , and Vmt

M — WEIGHT
Managem ent

Circuit Court al tha MMtNOLS 
County Cowrthouaa al 407-3B3-mg a apacial accommodation la 

participa’e m Vua procaadmo 
aha aid contact tho Clarti of tha 
Circuit Court at tha SSMtNOLS 
County Courthouaa at 407-333- 
4330. not lalar than aaaan day* 
prior lo Ota procaadmo It hoar* 
mo unpaired. I HO H I  I t t l  
(TOO) or 1-400-M4-4770 «la

■WSIVCMM A/S/A MANT 
IWS1TCHM: UNKNOWN 
SPOUSE OF MANY I  
IWSSTCHIK A/tUA MART 
IWSSTCHIK. IF ANT.
UNITSD STATU OF 
AMimCA. TNI SPRINGS 
COMMUNITY ASSOCIATION. 
MC . JOHN DOS ANO JANS 
DOS AS UNKNOWN TINANTS 
M POSSESSION

PDNS6LDSHRS SALS
NOTICI IS H IM IV  OIVSN 

purauant to a Summary Fmal 
Judgment al loractaauta doled 
April M. ttM . antarad m Chnl 
Caaa No M  II4CA 14 ■ ol tho 
Circuit Court ol tha IITH 
Judicial CmcuN In aad lar SSM- 
NOLI Caonty. SANFONO. 
Florida. I unN taK lo tha htohaal 
and boat butdar tar caah AT 
THI WIST FNONT OOON al the 
SEMINOLE County Courthouaa 
Mealed at 301 N SANK AVSNUI 
In SANFONO. Florida, a lt  1 00 
am on the 11 ih day ol MAT. 
IM t the lot lowing daaenbad 
proport/ at aal Mrth m l « d

may * y  ctaanar ( k  c

M n a n a m a

may dry ctaanar be. t 
MoriUtolPTOtfoO-TCT.

neeelen Chambara. City HaH. 
SanMrd. Florida al T 00 p m on 
Thuraday May 0. 1000. M con* 
aider tha toUowino change and 
amandmanl to lha Zoning 
Ordinance ol tho City ol 
SanMrd. SemtnoM County 
Florida.
heron.ng Imm NMOI. MullipM 

Family NaaidaMial-Ottica-

FUUNTIFF

N PHIL MUFF. JR .
IF LIVINO. ANO IF 0U 0 .
THI UNKNOWN 8POU9I. 
HUM. OtVISliS.
ONANTUS. ASSIONIIS 
USNONS CRIOITORS 
TRUSTS(9  ANO ALL OTHIN 
FANTIIS CLAIMINO AN 
INTEREST ST. THNOUOH. 
UNOSN ON AOAINST 
N PHIL HUFF. JN .
KANIN O HUFF.
IF LIVINO. ANO IF QUO.
TMi UNKNOWN SPOUSS. 
HUM. OSVISSSS. ONANTUS. 
AMK3NUS. UINOM. 
CNSOITORS. TNUSTIIS 
ANO ALL OTHIN MNTIIS 
CLAIMINO AN INTINSST BY. 
THNOUOH. UN0KN ON 
AOAINST KANSN O HUFF. 
KINOS BNIOOS COMMUNITY 
SINVtCSS ASSOCIATION.
INC ; ROYALWOOO (STATU 
AT KINGS BNIOOS VILLAOi 
ASSOCIATION. INC : PACIFIC 
SHONS FUNOINO. JOHN DOS 
ANO JANE DOS AS 
UNKNOWN TINANTS 
IN POSSESSION.

NOTIc'ttV*0* * ™
FONSOLOSUM SALS

NOTICE IS HEREBY OIVSN 
purauant to a Summary Final 
Judgment ol Mtecloeuf* dated 
April I t ,  ISSS. antarad m Civil 
Caaa No M 3S3S CA 14 P ol 
tho Clrcu.t Court ol lha 1STH 
Judicial Circuit In and lor SEMI­
NOLE County. SANFONO. 
Florida. I will tall to lha highatl 
and boat bidder tor caah AT 
WIST FNONT OOON ol tha 
tlMINOLE County Courthouaa 
located al 301 N PARK AVI in 
SANFONO. Florida, at It 00 
a m on the ISth day ol MAY. 
ISOS tha lot lowing daaenbad 
property a* eat forth in eatd 
lumma-y Final Judgment, to­
wn

LOT 42. KINOSBNIOOE. 
PHASE I A. ACCONOINO TO 
THE PLAT THEREOF AS 
NSCONOiO IN PLAT BOOK 41. 
PAOSS t f  THNOUOH It. PUB­
LIC MCONOS OF SEMINOLE 
COUNTY. FLORIDA

KSNNSTHQ WASItWICZ 
IF LIVINO. ANO IF OSAO.
TMS UNKNOWN SPOUSS. 
HUM. OSVISSSS.
ORAMTSES. ASSIONIIS. 
USNONS. CNSOITORS. 
TNUSTIIS ANO ALL OTHIN 
PANTIIS CLAIMINO AN 
MTSMST BV. THNOUOH. 
UNOSN ON AOAINST 
MNNCTH O WASIIWIC2. 
SONSIIAHNAV N WASISWtCZ 
IF LIVINO. ANO IF 0U0.
THI UNKNOWN SPOUSI. 
HUM, DIVISIU. ORANTSU. 
AUH1NIU. USNONS. 
CNSOITORS. TNUSTIIS 
ANO ALL OTHIN PANTIU 
CLAIMINO AN INTSMST BY. 
THROUGH. UNOSN ON 
AOAINST SONSIIAHNAV A 
WASISWICZ. BNVNHAVSN 
COMMUNITY ASSOCIATION.
INC ; JOHN DOS ANO JANS 
DOS AS UNKNOWN TINANTS 
IN POSSESSION

FONSOLOSUM SALS 
NOTICI IS HINISY OIVSN 

purauant to a Summary Final 
Judgment al Mroctoeura dated 
April 33. ISM. antarad m Chnl 
Caaa No M >113 CA 14 B al 
tha Circuit Court ol tha ISTH 
Judicial Clrcwl in and far 
Seminole County. Sanford. 
Florida. I will a all to tha tughaat 
and boat bidder lor caah at tha 
Waat front door ol tha I f  mi no la 
County Courthouaa located at 
301 N. Park Avenue in lanloid. 
Florida, at It 00 a m on lha 
2tlh day of MAY. ISM lha fol­
lowing daaenbad property aa

ROBERT M WOODALL. JN .
IF LIVINO. ANO IF 0IA0 
TMI UNKNOWN SPOUSI.
HUM. DIVISMS.
ONANTUS. ASSIONUS. 
USNONS. CNIOtTONS. 
TNUSTIIS ANO ALL OTHIN 
PANTIU CLAIMINO AN 
MTSMST BY. THNOUOH.
UNOSN ON AOAINST 
NOBSNT M. WOOOALL. JN ; 
JiTTAM WOODALL.
IF LIVING. ANO IF OIAO.
THI UNKNOWN SPOUSI.
HtlM. OSVISSSS. ONANTUS. 
AUKMIkS. UINOM. 
CMOITONS. TRUSTIES 
AND ALL OTHIN PARTIES 
CLAIMINO AN INTINUT BY. 
THNOUOH. UNOSN ON 
AOAINST JITTA M WOOOALL. 
COUNTRY DOWNS 
HOMEOWNERS ASSOCIATION. 
INC ; BANC ONC FINANCIAL 
SINVICU. INC.. JOHN DOS 
ANO JANS DOS AS UNKNOWN 
TENANTS IN POSSUSIOM

OSFINOANT(S) 
NOTICI OF 

FONSOLOSUM SALS 
NOTICI IS HINISY OIVSN 

punuanl lo a Summary Final 
Judgment ol ferecloeure dated 
April 23. ISSS. antarad in Civil 
Caaa No SS 2301 CA 14 B ol 
the Circuit Court ol the ISTH 
Judicial Circuit m and Mr SSMI- 
NOLI County. SANFONO. 
Florida. I will celt to tha higheel 
and beat btddar Mr caah AT 
THE WEST FNONT OOON ol lha 
SEMINOLE County Courthouaa 
located al 301 N PARK AVENUE 
m SANFONO. Florida, al I t  00 
a m on tha 2Sth day ol MAY. 
ISSS lha lollowing daaenbad 
property aa aal forth in a aid 
Summa-y Final Judgment. to-

"LOT 33. COUNTRY OOWNS. 
PHASE II. ACCONOINO TO THE 
PUT THEREOF AS NICONDSD 
M PUT BOOK 2*. PAOSS St B 
12. PUBLIC RECORDS OF 
SEMINOLE COUNTY. FLORIDA 
Oalad thia 24th day ol April, 
ISO
(CIRCUIT COUNT SEAL) 

MARYANNS MORSE 
Clark al the Circuit Court 
By Dorothy W Bolton 
Oeputy Clerk 

THE LAW OFFICES OF 
0AVID J. STERN. P A 
ATTORNEY FON PUINTIFF 
SOI S. University Drive 
■uile 300
Planlilmn. FL 33324 
(SS4) 233-4000 
M-3131 l(CMI)

In accordance with lha 
American wtlh Disabilities Act. 
paraona with disabilities need­
ing a apaclal accommodation lo 
pertlcipata in thia proceeding 
ahoukt contact tho Clark ol tho 
Circuit Court at the SEMINOLE 
County Courthouaa at 407-323- 
4330. not later than raven daya 
prior lo tha proceeding It hear­
ing Impaired. 1-800-tlS-S7Tt 
(TOO) or t-SOO-IIS-irrO. via 
Florida Relay Service 
Pubkah April 30 and May T.

• o t k a f a r ™ ™

NOTICE IB HEREBY OIVSN 
purauar I to a Summary Fmal 
Judgment ol Mrecloeura dated 
April It. ISM. antarad In Chnl 
Caaa No St 2«43 CA 14 P ol 
Hi# Cireul Court ot tho ISTH 
Judicial Circuit in and Mr SEMI­
NOLE County. SANFONO. 
Florida. I mil rail to tho tughaat 
aad baat bidder lor caah WSST 
FNONT DOOR ol lha SSMtNOLS 
County Courthouaa located at 
Ml N PARK A VS In SANFONO. 
Florida, at 11 00 am  on tha 
11th day ol MAY. ISM  tho fol­
lowing daaenbad property aa 
tat fortn m raid Summary Final 
Judgment, to-wit 
LOT 42. BLOCK O. WOOO- 

MENS PARK 2ND M PUT. 
ACCONOINO TO THE PUT 
THEREOF A t RECORDED IN 
PUT BOOK 13. MOE 73. OF 
THE PUBLIC RICONOS OF 
SEMINOLE COUNTY. FLORIDA 
Dated thia tfth day el April.

LOT It. WOOOBRIOGI AT THE 
SPRINGS UNIT ONE. ACCORD­
ING TO THE PUT THEREOF AS 
NICONOEO IN PUT BOOK 2«. 
PAGE 70. PUBLIC MCONOBOF 
SEMINOLE COUNTY. FLORIDA 
Dated thia 3<th day ol April. 
IMS
(CIRCUIT COUNT SEAL) 

MARYANNS MORSE 
Clerk el tha Circuit Court 
By Dorothy W Ballon 
Deputy Clark 

THE LAW OFFICE! OF 
OAVIO J STERN. PA 
ATTORNEY FON PLAINTIFF 
Mt S Univarally Drive 
Sulla kOO
Plantation. FL 33334 
(444) n 3-4000
IT-1S32S (EMC)

In accordance with Ika 
American with Dieabtkltea Act. 
paraona with diaabiktlee need­
ing a apacial accemmodaNon lo 
participate In Hue proceeding 
ahouId contact tha Clerk al tho 
Circuit Court al lha SEMINOLE 
County Courthouaa al 407-323- 
4330. not lalar than raven daya 
prior to tho proceeding l| hear­
ing Impaired. t-000-ttS-0771 
(TOO) or l-OOO-tlS-1770. via 
Florida Relay Servke.
Pubkah April 30. and May 7.

Tha Planning B Zoning

tOM. lo conaidor raid reeom- 
mandat an.

AH parties in tnlereal and citl- 
tana than have an opportunity 
M to hoard al aaid hearings 
Jamas N VaMnno. Chairman 
Planning t  Zoning Commission 

A0VICE TO THE PUBLIC It 4 
parson decides to appeal a 
decision mode with respect lo 
any matter considered al lha 
above mealing or hearmge. 
ha/aha made need a verbatim 
record ol tho proceeding#, 
including tha testimony and 
evidence which record is not 
provided by tha City ot SanMrd 
(Ft 200 0101)

PSN0ON0 WITH DISABILITIES 
NEE0INQ ASSISTANCE TO 
PARTICIPATE IN ANY OF THESE 
PROCEEDINGS SHOULD CON­
TACT THE PERSONNEL OFFICE 
AOA COORDINATOR AT 330- 
1424 44 HOURS IN ADVANCE 
OF THE MEETING 
Publish April 31. 30. 10M 
DID-111

(CINCU.T COUNT SEAL) 
MARYANNS MORSE 
Clark al the Circuit Court 
By Oorclhy W Bolton 
Oeputy Clerk 

THE LAW OFFICES OF 
OAVIO J STERN. PA 
ATTORNEY FOR PLAINTIFF 
Mt • University Drive 
lulls SO0
Plantation F L  33334 
(SI4) 233-1000 
M*32972(NATR)

In accordance with lha 
American with Diaabkitiaa Act. 
paraona with disabilities need­
ing a apacial accommodation to 
paitwlpato in this procaadmg 
mould contact tha Clerk ol the 
Circuit Court at lha SEMINOLE 
County Courthouaa at 407-323- 
4330. not lator than S evan  days 
prior to tha proceeding It hear­
ing impaired. 1-000-tM-077t 
(TOO) or t-iOO-OSS-0770. via 
Florida Relay Sarvka 
Publish April 33. 30. IMS 
MS-314

parson M F. 1770 Hangar Rd 
Sanford Aaporl No prion# can

impaired young men / 
Stud tor House Cord 

330-9310

NOTICE OF AOENCV ACTION TAKEN BV TUB 
ST. JONES RIVER M M  HARASSMENT DISTRICT

Notice ta gven that the lollowing permit waa Issued on April 
30.IM t to ADAMS BLOO MATERIALS PROPERTY PARTNERSHIP 
tM I 7th ST. SW WINTER HAVEN. FL 33U0. permit f40-117-0440- 
SRP Tho protect k located In OeminoH County taction 34. 
Township I t  South. Range 30 East Tha permit author Idea A BUN- 
FACE WATER MANAGEMENT EVSTEM ON 0.331 ACRES TO 
SERVE A TRUE* MANUFACTURINO FACILITY KNOWN A0 ADAMS 
BLOO MATERIALS Tha receiving waterbody la 0T. JOHNS

Tho flle«(e) containing tha application for tho above listed par-

judgment to-wit 
LOT 111. BRYNNAVEN FORET 

REPLAT. A RE PUT OF BRYN- 
HAVEN. ACCONOINO TO THE 
PUT THEREOF. AS RSC0R0E0 
IN PUT BOOK 30. PAOE 20 
ANO It . OF THE PUBLIC 
RECOROE OF SEMINOLE 
COUNTY, FLORIDA 
Dated thia 20th day of April. 
IMS
(CIRCUIT COURT SEAL) 

MARYANNE MORSE 
Clark ol tha Circuit Court 
By Dorothy W Bolton 
Deputy Clark 

THE UW  OFFICES OF 
OAVIO J (TERN. PA 
ATTORNEY FOR PUINTIFF 
Mt S. University Orive 
Suita 300
Plantation. FL 33324 
(944) 333-1000 
9t-33431(NAVY)

In accordance with the 
American with Disabilities Act. 
persona with disabilities need­
ing a apacial accommodation to 
participate in Hue proceeding 
ahould contact tha Clark ol tho 
Circuit Court al tha SEMINOLE 
County Courthouaa at 407-323- 
4330. not lalar than seven daya 
prior lo the proceeding II hear­
ing impaired. I •900-993-9771 
(TOO) or 1-900-949-9770. via 
Florida Relay Servk*.
Publiah April 30. and May 7.
1M9
D EB -243

firsaLQedsa!
O p p o rtu n it ie s

ml la available lor tnapeebon Monday through Friday aacapt Mr 
legal holidays 1 00 a m to I  00 p m. at tha it. Johns River Water 
Management District (District) Headquarter*. Highway 1M Waat. 
Pale Ika FL 32170-1420 A parson whose substantial intaraata am 
affected by lha Oiatncl permitting decision may petition lor an 
administrative hearing in accordance with Factions 120 440 and 
120 17. F.8.. or may chooee to pursue mediation aa an altornaUvo 
remedy under a sc lion 120 173. Florida Statutes, and rules 28- 
104 l i t  and 24-1M.401-404. Florida Administrative Code 
Petitions must comply with tha requirements ol Florida 
Administrative Coda. Chapter 24-104 and Rule 40C-I 1007 and be 
tied with (received by) tha District Clark located at District 
Htadqualera. 4049 Raid ttraet Palalka Florida 32177. PakUone 
Mr administrative hearing on tho abovo appkcatmn<s) must bo 
tied Within twanty-ona (21) daya ol pubbeatton ol thia notke or 
within twanly-sra (29) day* ol Iho Ottlrkl depositing nolle* of thia 
infant in tha matt tor those persons to whom tho district mail* 
actual notice Failure to tile a petition within thi* time period (hall 
constitute a waiver ol any rightist such poraonfs) may have to 
request an administrative determination (hearing) under sections 
120 449 and 120 97. F t., concerning Iho aubiocl permit 
Petition* which *r* not hied in accordance with tha above provi­
sion* arc subfecl lo dismissal

Because the admmstratn* hearing process is designed to Mr- 
muiato final agency action, in* tiling of a petition moans that the 
Ota triers final action may be different tram tho position taken by 
it in this nolw* ol Inlsnl Psraon* who** substantial Intaratt* will 
be allectedby any such final decision of the District on the appli­
cation have lha right lo petition M become a party lo tha pro­
ceeding. in accordance with the requirements set forth above 
Publish April 30 I9M 
DEB-277

|oin the largest Sea/ring Service In trie World! Adecco 
Employment Sendee has the |ob for youl We offer 
great pay. great benefits, and the opportunity to work 
for prominent companies In the Lake Mary/Heathrow 
area. We are currently recruiting for the toilowtng posi­
tions;

• Switchboard Operators S8.SO-S9.SO per hour 
- Receptionists 37.00-18.00 per hour
• Administrative Assistants 39-314 per hour
• Customer Service Heps 38-310 per hour
• Data Entry Operators 38-39 per hour
• rue Clerks 37.SO per hour
• Accounting Clerks 38 • S9 per hour
• Word Processors 39-314 per hour

Please |oln us on Monday, May 
3rd, 1999 between the hours of 
10am to 3 pm and Interview with 
one o f our Certified Recruiters.
Adccco Is located at 200 Waymont CT. Suite 124. In 
Lake Mary The Adecco office Is between Huntington 
Bank and the Post O f he* on Lake Mary Bfvd. Fleas* 

call us at 407-330-7171 If you need more Information. 8 
Or you may fax resumes to 407-330-9668

CELEBRITY CIPHER
by Luis Campos

Count*, C«no< ciyprogram n  ensue horn quouiov by famous 
poopk. pest and p m c  lech osar n fw opnot trends lor encowr 

rodsyscU* OrgueW C

O V  X V Q V M  P V V X K T I I L

J K V Q V X  J B S Y W P Y M O

P R E V IO U S  S O LU TIO N : 'Life doesn't have cigar edges * -  
David Hockney

*11 Botticelli w ere alive today ha'd be working for Vogue 
—  Peler Ustinov



Call 322-2611 
Seminole Herald 
Classified Dept. 

To Place Your Ad4* • Seminole Herald. Sanford, Honda • Friday. April 30.190#

133—Acreage Lot For 
Sale

157—Mobile Homes 
For Sale

1 0 J— H o u s e s -  
U n f u r n i s h e d

71— H elp  W a n t e d71— H e lp  W a n t e d71— H e l p  W a n t e d

INSURANCE CLAMS CLERK
F T  Pol OfticeWonJ process­
ing required E«p d  Wrvtows 
hetotol Good Sal Benefits 407- 
323 9522 Of 1 800-283-5122.
ER. 170____________________ __

LIGHT OFFICE HELP 
Bi lingual a plus

W I 1 - — hi I..LWIVil>9 EieliUCTOrE 
Nsnonwid* tnoor-traaef trsrvng 
cantor located si Santord sf*w  
driving Instructors Candidates 
null have verifiable tractor M4-

A MOVE M U C C IA IJ1 400 »q 
It 4 up' $265 A MONTH. OKIca- 
Sioraga. 321 -01 JO or 415-3506 LARRPIKMT LOT - M M *

Late. Lodi M v s i t o m  
90000175000 

LAKE FRONT LOT-Swna la- 
land. Lana Monrot. Itodueed. 

non 974.900
VACANT LOT-Lodi Arts* 
932000.1a. pH* aw dM  

LAKE MART LOTRWoodkJ
125.000

Adame Cl. WbodsdU
911.000

163— W a t c r t r o n t  
Pr o p e r t y  F o r  S a le

141—Homes For Sale
pioma or GEO and an merest in 
taicrnng others Compebtiva 
wage package mctode* comps 
ny paid heafth msurance. vaca­
tion and participation m 401K 
No overnight wavat. FiAP in 
tuna potmens Cal Rick at 328- 
8000 __________

2 BR near Crooma Stew* 9 new 
refrgaraior Nca rwvjnborhood. sq. A  CaRonva uyta 2 Rory! - - . . — —. — i aâpool, (erms ci emenmes ms- 

iducad to 1123.000 
Ctaaate l«Ma 4 Br. 2 t/2 Ba. 
Krapiae*. 2241 aq IL 2 atory 
Double lot 150X155 
1125.000.

no peta 1300 
407 321 4217

STEHSTROlil
MASONS (w tools A aapan- 
ancaVMASON TINDERS (*/•»- 
pan*ncal needad immediately 
Daily pay 4 traruportation aval- 
abto Compewve pay Cal 407/ 
302-1940 or 2585 Pan Dftva.

Dump Truck Driver
COL Requred, FT. Benefit* SANFORD Hill. Mat 1/1 Wf 

Fwepiac*. End PaDo. Hard-407-322-4133
Elactrtcian: Com e«p raqd Dr 
Lie raqd al local won 0FWP 
Teneky Inc. 322-7047

Shop Samlnot# Hi raid's 
CUsstMds Evtrydiy!

Eip. Auto/ Align2 Braka Tech, 
naadad. can-had m at least one 
area Alao TV* Imtalar naadad 
Apply at 9*ara Auto Cantaf. 
450 Town Canter Ctrcta. San-

New hiring alt portion* Top 
pay. pad vacation* after I year 
MeOcal cane lit* and a Drug 
Free Won place 4650 w  SR 48 
West Santo* 407-J3O-77T5 A 
3770 Orlando Or 17-82-Santord. 
407-321-4308

JIM DOYLE 
(407) 322-2495

WE NEED HOUSES TO RENT

97— A partments 
Furnished

SH3 2 HFLOOMNQ MSTALLERS
Hardwood and laminate Floor­
ing Apprentice* naadad mme- 
dialety tor edatashed. aipand- 
ng. company ktost be aM  to 
Rt up to 80 Lb* and won on 
knaa* tor arranged penod ol 
Bme Gnat advancement op­
portunity O l  Jach »1 ZZ1-6M3 
try and MUR ftav* vahd <TH- 
art iicanja and past back 
ground check

Now 
P f Hiring

Sales
Associates
• Full and Part-Time

• Advancement Opportunities
• Competitive wages

Apply by Phone 24 hours ■ day!

1-800-7TI-JO BS
oh thank haavan

Historic District 1SW1BA:
1475-mo • security Efficiency: 
337Vmo • security 323D229

PART TRIE POSITIONS:
Lot Driver 
Block D en
Computer Check In Parson 
Counter Clan 
Vehicle Cheek in Person 
Pel -up Deevery Driver 
Security Guard

FUU. TM E POSITION:
T «*  Clerk (No e«p r*q -wiit 
trim)

105—  D utlex/Triplex

Okfedk (407) 190Q448MX 49/na
1/2 Duple*. tBR I B A  Cent AC. 
No Pets 5400/mo Jernlgin 
Properties 1)0-3351 (407) 716-TALK*

Credit card Billing 
1 -eoo-cm r-FUN

FT periihibte ctorkt: Vinoul 
diyWlMR Muit pones* math 
ikitl* 4 physical requirement! 
SAVE-A-LOT. 2921 Ortando Or. 
tt20. Santord

Ibdrm apt. eompieie privacy, 
one person only. SiOOwk pkn 
3200 M cC al 321-3735

99— A partments 
U nfurnished

Between 9 AM-4 PM Monday- 
Wednesday 3895 S»R 48 East 
Santord (comer oi 48 and 415) 
407-323-4090

117— Co m m ercial  
Rentals

FT TEACHING POSITION
3 yr old class Musi nave COA 
or m process ol completing Ei- 
caiient pay with insurance and 
benefits CM Joyce. 321-7635 

ELECTRiCtANS/EXP. HELP­
ER WANTED Appft al |064<le 
17-92 4 Weioon Rd U  Mary 

Sae Howard Ward.

EOEMF/XW
DRUG TESTING EMPLOYER

OFFICE MANAGER
Ful bme. Computer it . tome 

Bookkaepmg Outgoing mckvid- 
ual to won with public m person 
and by phone Asaat w*h spe­
cial events Forwtrd letter ol in­
terest or resume plus 3 rets .to 

Office Manager. Greater Oviedo 
Chamber of Commerce, P.O. 

S oi 621234. Oviedo FL 33724

Jemigan
properties, inc.

For 425 iq. ft olfice nates 
downtown Santord Two 400 iq  
ft office space units nr down­
town Ron Jemigan. 330-3255

a * i i t  * p v

• General Labor • Administrative
• Warehouse • Data Entry
• Manufacturing • Receptionist

Short Term/long Term Temporary, Temporary 
to Hire Assignm ents Available

We specialize In personalized service tor our 
clients and employees!

Country-Osteen: Travel trailer tor 
ONE Utilities included ST&wk. 
1200 Security 324-9001 or 322- 
9410Glaaa manufacturer n Santord 

looking to rwr* 2 to 3 good, eag­
er men. espd and meipd to 
learn giasa busmen Wfl train 
Fiend* hr* good pay 407-321- 
3666

99— A partments 
U nfurnished

Otftc* 4 Store AveUaMe
1000* iq IL. A/C. private rest 
room. 3450/ma 322 6169

771-4113

s o fx m m w u )!
100— C o n d o m in iu m  

R e n t a l s

Outstanding Summer Job 
Opportunities exist now at

Orlando/Sanford Airport.
Get in on all the grov/thl

Plant Workar-FT: Chemical 
Mini - Seek mdmtduai tor gen­
ets! laciiity upkeep, wirehous- 
mg. drum handimg. (Forklift/
Electrical eip helpful) MS di­
ploma. dependaDto-Santort For 
App Into 321-79t0 Drug Free

103— H o u s e s * 
U n f u r n i s h e d

• 15 Day COL Training
• Dey 4 Weekend Claeses
• Financial Assistance
• Cantors Hiring On Sits

..Truck Driver 
s institute 
804V554-7364

HIRING CANVAS PACKERS 
For Manne Canvas Operstions. 

Er> Reo 327-H2S

Lake tovy. 2br/iba lenced yard. 
CMA. great area. $57S/mo.* de­
posit 332-9947. .House Cleaning - Perfect Job! 

Low ttrru  2-5 dayi/wk S7/hr.
MJe* pd, car mqd >34-5595

D ynAir Services, Inc. is experiencing phenomenal growth in our 
second year o f operations. N o w  is a perfect opportunity to get 
involved in the dynamic commercial aviation industry. W e  are current*
ly accepting applications for part-time Ramp Services and part-time 
Aircraft Cleaners positions. Applicants must work a flexible schedule,

C l MECHANIC
M Long wood area munuliiturcr 
sale Is kecking j qualified 
Efcosncc mcih.inu

understand some trig jish, pass a drug screening, complete a ten year 
work/school history, ro r those interested in Ramp Services positions 
you must possess a valid Florida driver's license and be able to  lift up

Irrigation Laborer 
F/T. aapenance preferred Vaca­
tion. pension CM 322-8133 candidates will h m v

LABORERS NEEDED 
FOR UNDERGROUND 

tm U TV  CONTRACTOR
HEALTH MSUMANCC ANO M1K 

PLANI Dm* free weripuc* 
Apsiy at SM MMw Drive.

gja m tiu n ic jl ipmudc 
fi ftosibiljt)-

■fcHgemling i in cspcricnic und 
^ncAOIk A mcdikjl bcnclil*
HjdWC vllnlllJ m ml tv-iinii- .mil 

history to

David M Company
Jt)1 Valentine Way 

tainKwmxI.ri .41750

Immediate openings! 5 line 
pnone system Camputar knowf- 
adga hatptol M F. 7 30-4 00pm 
430 7116 OFWP______________

LAKEVKW NURSING 
CENTER

is undergoing a matsrve e*pan- 
lion Wa are adding 65 bed* 
and win soon be accepting 
Medcsre 4 Medicaid NEEDED 
IMMEDIATELY licensed social 
worker, CNAs M shifts 4 main­
tenance helper Also accepting 
lor LPNs, CNAs 4 housekeep­
ing lor the eipansion New 
competitive pay rales wen ben­
efits Apply in person 919 East 
2nd 51. Santord. 322-6707 EO£ 
DFWP_______________________

$4-00 per hour for Aircraft Clea
9- Free Uniform s\ -s . » *> *f . a * i ' * ‘ ‘ 'i-y ' Tj f !\**arr* I

9- Free Parking
9  Comprehensive industry training

Brintl,  A ASSOC., 434-7444
Site Work Labor

0L Required. FT. Benefits
in . -a H iw

Light IndustrialLawn Service: Musi have es- 
penence Good Ors Lie S7.SGTir 
to start 324-1241, after Apm 
Legal Secretary: Busy Santord 
lew office has immedute open­
ing lor a legal secretary with 
superior phone 4 computer 
skills. Faimlianty wilh W P . 
Undtech. trust accounting, real 
estate. 4 prods te a plus Must 
be non smoker, seif motivated, 
willing u  learn Fas resume to 
407-321-1467

tango Dr or CM 324 1741_______
TRUCK DRIVER lor 3 days a 
week, possibly lull time, local 
deliveries Only neat and dean 
should apply Needs to have 
COL license. 834-3615

Workers Needed
Adecco Employment Services Is now hiring lor many 
different light Industrial positions In the Sanford/Lake 
Mary area.
• Meat Packers 1st shift 57 00 per hour
- Quality Control Inspector 1st shift $7 00 and up
■ Dess Brake operator 1st shift experience required 

57.42 -  5 11 BO per hour
• CDL Drivers 3rd shift 58 42
- Certified Forklift 2nd and 3rd shift 57 00 - 58 00
• Assembly Line Supervisor I st shift 57.50
• Material Handlers 2nd shift 56 25
• Medical Assemblers I st shift 56 20 per hour
• General Labor 56 00 • 58 00 per hour

Open House Interviews 
Monday May 3rd, 1999 

between the hours o f I0am-3pm
fleause bring kientlfk̂ rton tor proof of eiiglbriiry to work In the 
United States

Adecco. Lake Maty. Is located at ZOO Waymont CT 
Suite IZ4 between Huntington Bank and the Post 

Of lice on Lake Mary Btvd Please call 407-330- 7 17 1 
tor more Information.

Alter o k an equal npfwtunity wnpLiye.

For more information on these positiqi 
come by our administration office Mood 
from 9:00 a.m. until 3:00 p^. to fill out 

call us at (407) 322-3693. We ait

WANTED 97 People HI 
We’l  PAY you lo lose 
up to 29 plus pounds 

CALL TON FREE 1-600-754 5470

Private Invesugatioos • VIP Security 
Protective Security • Airport Security 

Secunty Guards (Home/Business) ,
Leans* Numbws A9fl00144 • B9500I54 3

C3600353 * Bonded ^
Prione (407)321-2191 

Fs* 1407) 321 2163 Can (407)314-7067 
Pager 1 886-509 6994 Email usginvOaol com 

JOHN WRIGHT. JR Presidenf
2621 S. Orlando Dr., Suite 8 

________ Sanford, FL 32773 _____ j

Clerical • Light 
Industrial • Assembly

501 N ORlANIIll AVI sum  /It • WINttH I’AMk

(
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322-2111 of Tall free from Orlando U 1 -M M  
You can fax vour ad to 407*323-0400 

300 N. Franch Ava., Sanford 32771 • P. O. Boa 1667. Sanford 32772 
Our office la opan to aarva you Monday through Friday, • am ■ 5 pm

DEADLINES:
For TMaday'a ad It Ion, tho daadllna la Monday at noon 

For Wadnaaday'a adit Ion, tha daadllna la Ttiaaday at noon 
For Thuraday'a edition, tha daodMna la Wadnaaday at noon 

For Friday's edition, tha doaddna la Thuraday at noon

CLASSIFIED
322-2611

P a y in g  fo r y o u r classified a d :
V accept Masiereard, Vtu, Dtseover and Am«We gladly accept Mastercard. Visa, Discover and American E,press We 

also will take cash or a personal check. Advertisers who wish to be billed can 
make arrangements at the time thee ad la placed. Please keep in rrund that 
ads in the Personals (class. 2 1). Business Opportune let (class. 55) & Garage 
Sales (217) require payment in advance.

In.the, event you need to chenge_your ad;
It you need to change your ad while it is running, please give us a can and 

we *d make ihe change tor the next avaXabto edOon. Please check your ad 
on the firs! day ol publication. II you And an error, please call us immerfcatety 
and we wi# correct the error tor the next publcalion. We are responsible tor the 
first insertion only and only tor the cost of me tost insertion.

ft Home Hearth Cars
12 Elderly Care
13 Health A Beauty
14 For Sale
15 Cemetery Lots
18 Reminder Services 
18 Luxury Items 
IS Compuler/TV
21 Personals
22 Hearth Care
23 Loel A Found 
25 Spade! Notees
27 Nursery A Child Cere 
33 Weight Management 
35 Hypnosis 
39 Health Insurance 
43 Legal Services

<
| E  M  P I  O Y M F N T

1

___  117 Commercial Rentals M f i t o e i M

■»»

67 Career
Constants 

60 Resumes
70 Education A Tramtog
71 Help Wanted
73 Employment

i
118 Office Space For Rent
119 Pasture For Rent 
123 Wanted To Rant 
125 Laase To Own
127 StorageiOffice For Rant

M E R C H A N D I S E

R E  A I  E S T A T E

R E  N T A I  S

91 Apartments/ ns
45 Debt ConaoAdaSon | 
55 Business

Opportunities 
87 Opportunrttoe 
59 Financial Services 
81 Money to Lend 
63 Mortgages

V

To Share
93 Rooms Far Rent 
95 
98
97 Apartments • Furnished 
90 Apartments • Unfurnished
100 Condominum Rentals
101 Houses Furnished 
103 Houses Unfurnished 
105 Oupiee/Tnpfex
107 Mob* Homes For Ram 
111 Resort vacations
114 Warahousa/RenM Space
115 Industrial Rentals

141 Homes For Sals 
143 Out of Stats 

Property For Sale 
145 Resort Property For Sale
147 Industrial Property For Sale
148 Mobile Home Lots For Safe
149 Commercial Proparty For Salt 
151 Investment Property For Sale
153 Acreage lot For Sale
154 Open House
155 Condominium For Sale 
157 Mobile Homes For Sale 
159 Real Estate Wanted 
100 Bueinen For Sale
183 Waterfront Property For Sale 
185 Duplex For Sale

181 AppiencesA 
Furniture For Sato 

183 Television A Stereo/Radto 
185 Computers For Sale 
187 Sporting Goods 
189 Office Supplies 
191 Buddtog Materials 
193 Lawn 6 Garden 
195 Machine Work 
197 Restaurant Equipment

221 Good Things to Eat
222 Musical Instruments
223 Miacelanaous 
229 Auctions

A U T O M O T I V E

m
M I S C  F l l A N E O U S

199 Pets A Supplies
200 Lhrsstock/Farm

201
209 Heavy Machinery 
207 Jewelry 
200 Wearing Apparel 
211 Anaque/Cosecsblee 
219 Boats A Accessories 
217 Garage Seles 
219 Wanted to Buy

as
231 Cars For Sale 
234 Automotive 

Accessories 
239 TruduBuses/Vans For Sale 
236 Car Rentals
238 Vehicles Wanted
239 Motorcyclet/Bikes For Sale
240 Boat Rentals
241 Rac. VehicleVCampers For Sale 
243 Trailers For Sato
245 Farm Equipment

252 Accounting
253 AdtMone A

254 Air Condrttontng

255 Alterations 
258 Appliance Repair
257 Auto Elect. Repair
258 Automotive
260 Bush Hogging
261 Computer ConsUting
282 Cabinets
283 Carpentry
284 Carpet A installations
265 Carpel Cleaning
266 Ceiling Repair
267 Ceramic Tie
268 Child Care Centers
269 Cleaning Services
270 Concrete
271 Construction
272 Delivery Services
275 Drywafl
276 Electrical
277 Fence
278 Handy Mvi
279 HauNng
280 Home Improvements
281 Irrigation A Repair
282 Janilortai Services
283 Jewelry A Repair
284 Lshafront Clearing
285 Landscaping 
288 Laundry Services

287 Lawn Services
288 Legal Services
289 Locksmith
290 Masonry
291 Mortgages
292 Moving A Storage
293 04, Lube A Fitter
294 Painting
299 Paper Hanging
297 Pest Control
298 PterxVOrgan Tuning
299 Plumbing
300 Pressure Cleaning
301 Booling
302 Screen A Glass Work
303 Secretarial A Typing
304 Siding
305 Smart Business
306 Stained Glass
307 Swmming Pool Services
308 Termite Repair
309 Transportason
311 Travel
312 Tree Service
313 TV/Radio
314 Upholstery
316 Wetdtog A Sheet Metal
318 We* Doing
319 Window Washing A Tinting

GARAGE SALES
U te ri toe )uur )anl sale to Ike 

Sr nr f no Jr MrraM fur only S .SI/per line 
Ctll by Noon on Tuesday anil your M in e  ad ran 
nut tor three days In thr fJrrauM for only SS.1S!

( 4 0 7 )  3 2 2 - 2 6 1 1

l I

217— G a r a g e  S ales

a an* at sals
§7 Or and Am. Fum. EVc. TooH 

Misc Fn -Sal 94PM 
30 J vraan Rd. Sartor 0

OARAGE SALE 
UULTI-FAMLY

Cardinal Oak* PMte H laarfy 
beds)

553 Mornng Dove Otto

OARAGE BALE 
MULTt-FAMLV 

Cardinal Oak* Phase U (aarty 
bad*)

553 Momma Oova C*cta
-UkE-Men. f !. F a- Ss l M bjil.

BANOtN ART TAM SAID
OOtGINAL PAJNTINO‘CAROS' 
FLORAL BASKETS'HAWAUAN 
T SHIRTS BATIK BAGS ETC 

MAT 14 •  1A4P 
SPECIAL MOTHERS OAT

a r m
'9W  5 PARK AVE 5ANF0fip_ 

MuM Family BEWp f BMto Stoto
Apr 30 May t 4 3 On 0»*k» 
ia. ra il to Waknra Rtvav Fad* 
oil SR 46

TARO SAL*
FAITH MISSIONARY CHURCH3 

INC
Yard, hake tala, car wish prut 
cNcfcan tanner* 53 Donation it 
RjytAppI l7-92md4ih San 

ton! May III. Mm  •

Yard Sala: Attoriad kitchen S 
noutanok] itam*. ckxna*. 
book* crilt Itam*. toy* 4 mtoc 
2590 Grenada Av# (oil a 25to 
SI) Sal only, 8 3pm

Youlfi that make* a tatterence 
Oarage Sato' 1104 W 3rd St. 
May 1*1 8-T Providence MB
Church

OARAGE SALE
119 N SUMMERLIN AVE 
FRI LSI AND SAT 511

217— G a r a g e  S ales

WANT TO GET RIO 
OF ALL THAT 

STUFF?
A TARO B A L I i* tha perfect 
way to do that and via Bantonato 
Naraktf can bmg paopia to yum 
door Advert** you tato n  Via 
Uemwvo/to N m W tor orVy 1 51/ 
kna and M ich i'a  «ama toava 
•ttoa lha monay coma* n Cal 
by Noon on Tuaaday and yocv 5- 
kna ad can run tar three day* m 
lha Herald tor ONLY 59.1*11 Al 
to  l*k to that you prepay the 
ad Ca4 u*-m  can hetort

( 4 0 7 )  3 2 2 -2 6 1 1
1 Family Yard tato: Ev*ryVvng 
horn A to Z. Apt X  4 May 1. S - 
5pm. 2036 JaiTavaon Ava (taka 
MHtanv* e to 20Vt SL turn aati 
two brock* to JaPataon)

BENEFIT BALE 
CAT PROTECTION SOCIETY

2460 MtoUonvrHe (oil C 25th 
S I), Huge' Lot* ol everything"

County Fair 4 Yard Sato al SOS 
Hickory Ava Church ol Ood 
Tape 4 space tree tor donation 
of total tala (15%) to halp our 
BuAdmg Fund Coma one. 
Coma
al Sat May 1*4 horn BAM 
2PM
Ph 321-0206 God OtottH

OARAGE BALE
746 Oaywood Cvcto, Sunnland 
Estates. Largo dotk. Tent bed. 
“ ■ 1 Proc . Mi«c 4 tot* tor |l 

ov taw BAT. E AM

5010 South Santord Av * 30pm

153— W a t e r f r o n t  
Pr o p e r ty  F o r  S a l e

i T.47 aoeeon st 
r*t Budd your dream 

heme or weekend oneway 
Samar ■ Simmon* 322-1728 

Heal Ettate ProlattonaN 
311-7800

185—  D u p l e x  Fo r  S a le

DUPLEX, 2414-18 Palmetto 
Are (S ol 25th. W  ol Sant Ava 
on 28tti P L) Modernized both 
unit* 20 r. IMh . open parking. 
909 5q FI each uda $550 
mmaa. trda. Asking 569.900 
Da-l| 407 629 5009 a-407475-

181— Am .IA.NCES it 
Fu r n it u r e  F o r  S a u

Dining TaMe «W2 Hava* 4 6 
chair* 5299 2 Dresser* nwror*.

185*4 A/C 5100 123-5898

MATTRESS BALE - Full w ,  
uted hoi tpnng* 4 maltrtt* 
56500 Larry* Man 322-4132

215— W a n t e d  t o  Buy

Alum. Cana Copper !■
Kokomo Recycling- JJ 
811W. DrsT-WF M .  BaLB-1

221— G o o d  T h in g s  t o  
E a t

BOB'S PEANUTS
Regular, catun. roaitad. hath 
|urr«o it! r imp, * moved ftth.
jetty 2330 Calory Ava. Santord 
324 4963

Wer.eemet Farm* 3461 Celery 
Av*. Santord

225— M is c e l l a n e o u s

Air Conditioner*: 12 000BTU 
5300. 10 000 BTU 5280. 3 
5000 BTU 5180 ea LAs new 
Lew than 1 yt 407-302-4794

CLEAR WATER PROOUCTS 
407-327-2124 Sprinkler,WMl

Pump Me* A Repair Lie. In*

ACROSS

1 Walks 
7 Surgical sew

13 Of medicine
14 Element *53
15 Inquiry for lost

foods 
trong cords

42 Unused
46 Fieh eggs
47 The same
51 Fabric-coloring 

method 
S3 Russian 

vehicle 
55 Gets away 

from

Answer to Previous Puzzle

17 Dobbin's lunch 56 Boxer Gene
18 —  to lunch
20 Consumes
21 Madison 

Avenue types
23 Loathe
27 Cutting off 

branches
32 Praying figure
33 Carpentry term
34 Japanese* 

American
35 Fragrance
36 Catherine tho 

Great, e.g.
39 Musical group 

of nine
40 Use an oven

57 Sumptuous 
meal

58 Preoccupy

DOWN

1 Former 
Yugoslav 
leader

2 —  avis
3 Coup d' —
4 Circle parts
5 Fade away
6 Codfish dish
7 Snicker
8 Brawl
9 Singer Adam s

s A P s ■
T H R U s
A M E L 1
R E T U R n |

w ■ A L A S
1 N S E C T

G E 1 S H A
s E N S E S

10  — ■ colada
11 Dill seed
12 Loch —  

monster

I 2 3 r~ iJ
n r

-T5-

(7 18

| Call lor Answers • Touch ton* or Rtaary Phenes 
■rtc KMTvnu. e 1*900*860*4500 ext, code 100

'
5“ nr tr TT

1 20

19 Ref's kin
21 Mors 

pretentious
22 Drooping
23 First-rate
24 Edge
25 Door 

fastening
26 Lulu
28 Claudius' 

successor
29 G e l--------- tha

ground floor
30 Seaport In 

Alaska
31 Flying pest
37 Most painful
38 —  Paulo
41 Fracas
42 Roman route
43 Do a 

Jackknife
44 Jum p
45 Book of 

Norse myths
47 Electrified 

particles
48 Go to  a 

restaurant
49 Makes do 

with
50 Baseballor 

Willie
52 Affirmative
54 Massage

K IT  *N* 1 A H I .Y I .K  <R b> l.t ir r )  Wright

10 tpeed mile bicycle good 
and. sung 535 00 Csl 322- 
2784

GUITAR LESSONS 
Uu k w i 20- yen* experience 

Rrtvile/Otokp Session*
128 N W u l  tor Terry

IM  Oevli vacuum c teener
550

CM 322 5684

SECURITY BARS 4  DOORS
55 tq II. Offering keyle** puin 
bulton hr* ratal** 324-1188

230— A n t iq u e / C l a s s ic s

BUCK WILDCAT,1966 40RJWT. 
ElUta Sato 39K org Ru*l Fra* 
40lcc/325hp new 4.C. Recant 
Eih Bks Hosts A Balts. Gold 
56.900 060 407-324-499t

HOW TO GET RIO 
OF THAT OLD 

CAR!
The SamAnaAtMwaMOtastt-

hed* art m* quenesl and moai 
me*p*nlta* way to l*e your 

cirt fton your thra* bn* ad lor to 
day* and pay orty 52t 001 Even 

bettor, if you tea 4 sooner 
(ahtoh ea KNOW you eta) you 
can uop your ad and only pay 
tor lha number ol days a actu­

ary rani Whit a Dsakl
Call today and watch 

the Herald Classi­
fieds work for youll

322-2611(407)

231— C a r s  Fo r  Sa u 231— C a r s  Fo r  S a le

1992 Chevy Cornea, 4dr. 
Wha* Tinted Wd*. Lk new ml, A C  
52900 00 Ph 323-0612

91 VWJCTTAOL 
Autry4 W. asking *2195 00 

467-922-1088 (toava message!

Shop Seminole Herald s 
CUsuftedi Everyday!

238— V ehicles Wanted

CASH MS PAKH
For Junk Cat*. Truck* 4 Miset 

KEEP AUERCA BEAUTIFUL 377 5M0

MA F i r s *Ame
IPi M O RTG AG E

CORPORATION

• Art Credit types Possible • 0-Down Programs AvaRMRe 
CaN JAN or ROD for 
Free pyoomRIcolloB 

Storing 9*nhol»/Voknla/LAlmtOrmg*
457 S  Grant St/Longwood

4 0 7 -8 3 4 -1 6 0 0

SERUICE/1NSTALLAT10HS
• Emergency Service
• Free Estimates
• Fast Service 
A Fair Prices

• Financing Available

I04-532-5858/888-883-4525 
Air Co«ditlo«li| A Htating SystoM

AUCTION

APRIL 30th 
m 7:30 PM

••

A a t i f M S ,  % sfs%
Chain, Dsctfithff

,  t i c .

323-9580 « 
810-8963

au-2245 • ab 1664 
10% BP.

Mapir Credit Cards *  
Accepted x

Support yuur kcnl 
tnnaovrv. Itry nr* II* 

hnul uT >»ur corBinunXy. 
You «B  rtml rypulaU* 
k*.a‘ tw snm n oral 

w v r n  n Ihta itkrclury.

SERVICE DIRECTORY
Advertise your business or services

f a x  B c E T iW iT O s ln H i U M
^  Call the Classified Department at:

( 4 0 7 )  3 2 2 - 2 6 1 1

253-Additions 4  
R emodeling

276-El e c t r ic a l

ADVANCE TECTONICS

Addltlon*-Comirtarttol 
Local Builder tinea IN I 

323-94*4 CQC001SU

HERITAGE ELECTRIC 
ALL YOUR SERVICE NEEDS 

UC. E BOO 11*23 
407-122-2248

285-Lan d s c a p in g  
T r t C T J 5 t f T

Tree work, mulching, sod work A 
landscaping Free Estimates!

Country 
Style 
City m  

Llvingr ,
Convenient
Spacious

Affordable

1/2 MONTH FREE RENT
WITH 1TR. LEASE OR ASK ABOUT OUR

MOVE-IN SPECIAL
• SiMduus Apurlnirnta with Urge Closet* • Lake 

Front • Vullrjball • S|urVllng Pool • Tennis Courts

Aiwpowr ej.vo rn n n trv  1 alte A nlt

a 4'RFO«r BLVD

\ l iMS i S l  LIVE O M  BLVD
N
i 1

Country Lake
Apartments s

2714 Ridgewood Ave., Sanford • 330-5204 §

258-Automotive

CUr* * Performance. 923 5459 
Custom Bull Transmission* 

AH Vehicle* Otacoumed

NEED AN ELECTRICIAN? 
CALL DICK'* ELECTRIC 

407-321-*733
Lie. ER000282SIOv*r 15 Yra.

28S-Le g a l  S er v ices

278-Ha ir  Salons

DIVORCE Wnh or Withoul 
CNklren. Missing Spouse F.m 
Cits* Legal Services 407-521- 
00*2

264-Ca r p e t  &  
In s t a l l a t io n s

CARPET INSTALLATION 
Relay*. r*tir*tch E repair. 

Call 444-4341

FANTASTIC SAMS
-U*n*‘ day -57.es

Th • Woman*1
Wal-Mart P U u

I* day • 54.95 
a -  322-9045

300-Pressure

C le a n in g

DUN RTTC Raa/Comm 
Fra* n L  LkAn*. Shingta 

Ctoanlng. Seta A
Affordable. 321-4122

268-Child Care 
C enters

279-Hau ling

Mike Duke* Hauling/Ctoanup

Chnstian mother *6 keap your 
:hild in her home Mon Fn Call 
Donna al 322-7342 or 260 4593

Trash Hauling. Yard Clean Up. 
oad407-fetc sa&ioadi -22M9I0.

PRESSURE-Steam Washing
Decks * Walks * Driveways 

STEAM FACTORY 324-7666

Fun Frtondly Environment, 24 
hr. Oay Car*. Ful A Part Time 
CPfl earthed 4*509*1/Kelli

•Fly By Cleaning S*rvic*a>
Home or olhc*. Fast A Bekabta 
Day 234 5955. Eva* 330-7711.

280-Home

Improvements

301-Ro o fin g

269-Cleaning  Services

All Purpose Home Repairs, 
handy man to suite every need 
CaH 407- 696 0363. Pg 745- 
9760

YATES ROOFING since 192S 
Church S Sr. Disc. 3rd. Gen. 
Lie. *RC0022S9a 322*1449

312— T ree S ervice

269-Cleaning  S ervices

CHARLES a  (Dan) MILLER
Builder. CBC0572S5, Res. 

Comm. remodel, editions, 
repair MC. VISA 

407-320-1741

GRIFFINS TREE SERVICE
Lg iree removal. Inm/stump 
grinding Lc-bondln* 330-3245

Teytor Prol. Ctoanlng Service
ResrComm/ Family ownedoper 

Free es!7 Leins Bonded 
407-574-4491

HANDYMAN concrete dry wilt, 
remodekng. custom home paint­
ing. interior.anterior 282-7069

What About Bob’s Tree Service? 
Tree Removal, Trimming. Bob- 
cal Svc, Firewood. Fra* Esti­
mate* Lie Ins 407* 240-1579

275-Drywall
281 - Irrigation  &  

Repair
313— TV/R adio

Dry Wairstucco Repairs 
Ail Tortures Matched 

Popcorn! 222-4334 LI

^ s « , e c r

^  f 0(
tiposute
*k A.

Irrigation-Repairs
Landscaping Fast Service 

Guaranteed (407) 322-3001

Nestel 3 In 1 
Phone, Radio, Pager. 

On Sain Now.
CaH today! 407444-7110.

Service Directory Uee Ad Specials

$30 per m onth............3 lines/3 m onths
$40 per m onth............4 lines/3 m onths
$50 per m onth............5 lines/3 m onths

Classified (407) 322-2611
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NOMOWnsJ SWE WAJD 
/toftrr A w t  w y s '

‘RXnDT’CK *  CBVtfOW 
CMlCCMtlCVm WSHOlE 
AM’ SNIFFS m s TNI If u£ 
DOE PO S ITS  fiONNA K  A

C  w w  s u ^ f e .. .  > i

W OM EN WON'T DATt M t  
. «• O f  MV CONPlTION.

« v  # ' v 4 l i - , —  * * • *  A
COHVlTlONl

Y O U  K n o w  -  7 M *

bMr i7#5 stMw>.

KUWN?

PHAT30UG 
/BARE SHQI

...POYOUMAveA 
BiMlHWS IUIATU

Ylfik A j55AMM» A3I / L-ICAPIN*LfJABPS, SAMPyf 
rT r-PttLS  AS ! f - . i  UMPHt 1 
m j=rf 7MOS£ SAAtKHtS J

/ THE UHOLE 
M/OC6SC <S 
* * * H J O U 3

H O R O S C O P E S

m n * M W»  todey Through an exchange 
ol ptoasaKrw  wMi to n o n t yowl d m  
•onwMng qua* banaAaai may resua 
CAWWCOWM (D**. U-Jm\. It ) Things 
too* good tor you today m seustons you

h r  wee* may ha atfuevod new. Foeua In 
ontoamoalmaanngM 
LCO (July W -t o t  S t) Today may offer 
you a vatuabte tcarrenq aapananca. ona 
VtatcoMdba moat anyoyabla and graMfy* 

f  î atoo aomatang you! hava a uaa-

VWOO (Atag. SM apl. S t) 0 aomaona a
auccaaaluily handling a maltar that 
aflacia your Intaraata. don't odor any 
advfca to change too aauaaon If h n g t 
aren't broke. don't ta toam 
U M A  (tag*. t M k t  S3) Tha tuck of 
someone alaa who la proapahng and 
llourtahmg could rub off on you today 
fm utfi aaaoaeaon Taam up w(ffi aueh a 
peraon * you get toe chance.
SC O AttO  (O c t IM Ia v . t t )  in araaa 
ahara you ware pravioualy stymied, 
opportune** could now suddenly devel­
op tor you. Taka advantage of taa sur-

SO THE TEACHER 
5AIP5HE COULD 
AUUAY5TEU. WHEN 
YOU WERE 60ESSIN6 
ATTHEAH5W6K5..

YOU TDLP HEK 
I 6UE55 AT 

THE AH5UI6R5?'

5VKE.MAJKIE..I HAP 
TO PROTECT MY5ELF.. 

YOU MADE MV 
ANSWERS LOOK STUflP..

YOU UNDIf STAND, 
DON'T YOU? YOU 
FOtfiVE ME, 
DON'T YOU?

AOUAM US (Jan. » F a t  tt ) Bang on 
tia go and moving about urvaatnctadty a 
whal wd make you tha happwst today 
Evan mundane errand* could turn into 
vartoua typaa ol plaaaani aipanancaa 
M t C IS  (ta d . Id-M arch t t )  Should 
to me thing opportune develop tor you 
where your financial interests are con

you up today whan you need toam. That 
support w « be a cnacal lector in achiev­
ing toe recede you're hoping tor. Trying to 
patch up a broken romance? Tha Asko- 
Oraph Matchmaker can hap you under­
stand whM to do to make toe raiakonahp

WE 00N7 RECEIVE VERY 
MANY FROM THAT BUNCHI

SMOKE SIGNALS FROM 
^OUR FAR OUTPOST! ^

IT FIGURES

ously expressing slam interest. (With 
no slam aspirations, ha would saitle 
for four spades)

The diamond lead ducked to South’* 
nine makaa life  easy. The declarer 
mfis his queen-jack of diamoods in the 
dummy and loaes Just one spade trick.

After (he more testing heart lead, U 
la tempting to assume spades are 3-2, 
whan you can draw trumps and con­
cede a club trick. Y et you must be 
careful. In came the spades are 4-1, win 
trick one with the heart king. Take two 
top trumps, but when the bad split Is 
revealed, play a club to the ace. then 
lead the club queen for a ruffing fi­
nesse. (If East covers, you ruff; if he 
plays low, you discard.) with this lay­
out, you win 12 tricks.

Perhaps you  think that finessing 
against West for the dub king is a bet­
ter percentage play. Agreed, but even 
if the flnesae wins, you still aren’t 
home. Yet if the raffing finesse works, 
you are.

o  IMS to N I X  toe.

The English day 
of lire

W H W D T m S  ? DRINK. YOU THli 15 YOURSPCON.
* - \ r — -^ v .

\  B R E W ?
Today, the English commemorate 

their patron aatnt, St. George. He is 
renowned fo r alaying a dragon, but 
G.K. Chesterton seems to have had in­
side Information on the famous day be­
cause he wrote, *St George be was for 
England, And before he hilled the 
dragon. He drank a pint of English ale. 
Out of an English flagon.*

This deal occurred in a match be­
tween England and Ua westerly neigh­
bor, Wales. How would you play in six 
spades after the lead o f either the dia­
mond eight, ducked to your nine, or 
the heart jack?

There are many routes to six 
spades. In this auction, South bids out 
his shape with four hearts, simultane­

ity Jimm y Johnson
DEAR DR GOTT: I’m a 23-year-old 

woman with bulimia. I make myself 
vomit after ea tin g  and have been 
using laxatives for almost two years. 
Last year, my parents became con­
cerned because I lost weight so fast 
They took me to an internist I was too 
ashamed to tell the doctor whal I was 
doing. After a aeries of tests, be rec­
ommended exploratory surgery dur­
ing which my gallbladder was 
removed. I really want to stop this 
destructive eating pattern, but I can’t  
What can I do?

DEAR READER Bulimia is a com­
mon eating d iaorder related to 
anorexia nervosa. In your comments, 
you have provided a clear description 
of the ailment which — if not treated 
— will progress to serious malnutri­
tion and other health consequences. 
You have also communicated the feel­
ings of helplessness, fear and loss of 
control that are central to the disease.

Obviously, you will not be able to 
obtain help as long as a sense of 
shame prevents you from being hon­
est with your doctor and your family. 
Many illnesies — such as bulimia, 
anorexia, drag and alcohol addiction, 
and sexually transmitted disease* —

fled to treat eating disorders. You can 
be helped; however, you must ask for 
that help. Let go of your shame; it Is 
nonproductive and will only stunt your 
emotional growth.

1 might add that had you been hon­
est with your doctor in the first place, 
you could have avoided unnecessary 
surgery.

To give you related information, I 
am sending you a copy of my Health 
Report "Help II; Substance Abuse A 

Mental Health.* Other readers who 
would Uke a copy should send |2 plus 
a long, sc (/addressed, stamped enve­
lope to P.O. Box 2017, Murray Hill 
S la lion. New York. NY totsa. Be sure 
to mention the title.

DEAR D R  GOTT; I have been tak­
ing three teaspoons of psyllium for the 
past year or so to lower my cholea-

16 THi BED T5OTW08U6H 
M/1)€0*TBUG67

PETER 
GOTT, M.D

are embarrassing. But they are, after 
all, merely diseases that can be treat­
ed once they are diagnosed 

I urge you to adopt an attitude of 
scrupulous self-honeity. You seam 
already to be at the point where you 
can look at your problem objectively. 
At least you are willing to acknowl­
edge you have a problem and are 
helplessly in ite grip. You have, with­
out knowing it, taken the first impor­
tant step toward recovery. I congratu­
late you on the courage it took to write 
me.

Your next xtep is to seek profession- 
i i  help. Be candid with your physician 
and ask for a referral to a practitioner 
oreferably a psychiatrist, whoUquau'

. *rlon)*oaOMl.com

GARFIELD by Jim  Davis

I  W ONPER W H A T 
T H A T  MEANS?

t t C U K  m n  W H E N  IS
-  TH E UTTER PUE?
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O F  TH E 

in s u u t ih s

-  - D O G  d

56 WARE
OF THE

in s u l t in g

------------- R 5 tS --------------------------------
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West East
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e to ■ 7 • 3 e K t 2
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a  a  q  7 a 2
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Vulnerable; East-West 
D e a le r South

&ouU West North East
1 a Pass 2 a  Pus
3 e Pass 3 a  Pus
t v Pass t N T  Pus
J V Pass 5 N T  Pus
a a Pass a a  Ail pass

Opening lead; • J
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